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Date First Name Last Name Organization Opinion Comments
7/30/2019 Amin Assareh Oppose This would block the city view and sunlight from my unit and I'm opposed to it
7/30/2019 Bing Xiang Ma Chinatown 

Resident
Oppose To protect Chinatown & Leather District’s history and culture, I oppose the Project. Chinatown 

has more than 100 years of history. Chinatown’s buildings and row houses represent that long 
history and rich culture. Working-class families have lived here for many years. We want to 
protect this home. When tourists visit Chinatown, they can understand the history and culture 
of our working-class families from the buildings they see. I hope the city government can 
protect our Chinatown community. Right now 125 Lincoln Street has many traffic problems. 
The development would add even more traffic. The tall shadow would also hurt the Chinatown 
Gate park. We hope we can save Chinatown’s working-class culture and history to pass down 
to future generations. Chinatown needs to preserve low-income, affordable housing and keep 
an affordable cost of living, so I oppose the 125 Lincoln Street Project. These comments were 
translated from Chinese. The email provided is the translator's email, not the resident's. A pdf 
of the original letter will be sent to Michael Sinatra by email. The author is available to discuss 
at (he speaks Cantonese).

7/30/2019 Stan McGee N/A (resident) Oppose (since my letter is too long to submit at once, I am submitting in parts and will mail you the full 
letter): Dear Mr. Sinatra: I am writing with respect to the above-referenced proposal now 
before the Boston Planning & Development Agency (BPDA). My husband and I have owned 
property and lived in Boston’s Leather District since September 1998. I have attended at least 
four neighborhood and public meetings on this topic that included extensive presentations by 
Oxford Property Group on their proposed redevelopment of 125 Lincoln Street, and I entered 
those meetings with an open mind and ears. Unlike the representatives of Oxford, I was not 
being paid to be there and attended these meetings out of my limited free time, instead of 
attending to other obligations and activities, in order to better inform myself on what was being 
proposed and to be a good citizen. I have zero economic interest or connection with any 
alternative proposals for this site. However, based on what I have seen and heard from Oxford 
over the last seven months and in sitting through at least eight hours of neighborhood and 
BPDA public meetings, I am writing in very strong opposition to Oxford’s 125 Lincoln Street 
proposal. Given the unanimous opposition to this proposed development within the Leather 
District, I suspect that you will be hearing separately from many of my neighbors with their own 
concerns. As a result, I will focus only on a few areas. At the outset, I want to make clear that I 
am not a “NIMBY” nor am I opposed to economic development. I am not in the habit of writing 
in opposition to proposed real estate developments, and I believe this is the first time I have 
ever written the BPDA on any topic. Indeed, while my home faces Atlantic Avenue / South 
Station, I have supported the proposed South Station Tower, which would directly impact me 
both in terms of shadows, wind and construction disruption and is much higher than what is 
proposed at 125 Lincoln (consistent with zoning for the South Station site across the street 
from me). I am not a zoning zealot, and I know that I have chosen to live in downtown Boston 
and in an urban setting. Within the Leather District, I most recently supported the proposed 
hotel development at 150 Kneeland Street (formerly the Splash Ultra Lounge), which required 
a significant variance in zoning to proceed based on its height. continued
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I did so based on the repeated sensitivity of the developer of that site to neighborhood issues 
and concerns as well as my belief that, due to the parcel size, the distressed property would 
not otherwise be re-developed but for the zoning variance. I was Assistant Secretary for Policy 
and Planning in the Executive Office of Economic Development for Governor Deval Patrick 
from 2007 to 2012, and I well understand and support the need for reasonable real estate 
development and the necessary ingredients to contribute to a vital business environment and 
a robust commercial taxpayer base in Boston. This is all by way of saying I am not a NIMBY 
opponent, and I believe the Leather District has shown itself to be imminently reasonable over 
the last two decades that I have lived here with respect to proposed developments in the 
neighborhood. 1. This building proposal would violate the BRA / BPDA’s own 2010 Greenway 
Planning District Study for this very site. Many of us in the Leather District lived here during 
the Central Artery / Tunnel project (the “Big Dig”). Construction and staging was done here 24 
hours a day, every day. I lived through all of this disruption and noise and watched as little 
thought or effort was made to address neighborhood concerns because the project was over 
budget and behind schedule. We understood that our sacrifice was necessary for the greater 
good, and in meetings with the City, we were repeatedly told that the social contract was that 
downtown residents who suffered through the noise, the traffic, the dirt, the lack of parking, 
etc. would end up with a beautiful park – a Greenway – at the end of it all. After billions in 
federal and state funds were invested on the Big Dig, one concern was that, after it was 
complete, private interests would potentially try to capture all of the lots adjacent to the 
Greenway and essentially take the public investment for themselves by building large projects 
on lots now made attractive by significant public investment and by the patient suffering of 
those immediate abutters who lived through the disruption of the Big Dig for many years. It 
was an understandable concern that large developments would negatively impact this new 
public space, and that the public good from the massive public expenditure would be lost. With 
this all in mind, in 2010, your predecessor agency, the Boston Redevelopment Authority 
(BRA), undertook the Greenway Planning District Study, collaborating with many architects, 
urban planners and neighborhood groups. Its stated objective was: “To create a set of 
guidelines specifically for these parcels adjacent to the Greenway and to establish design 
controls which achieve the following goals: • Preserve the newly created open spaces 
(environmentally, aesthetically, and economically) by identifying densities, heights and other 
building massing criteria that are compatible with the recreational activities and horticultural life 
that are being encouraged to grow there. • Activate the broader public realm in and 
surrounding the parks by identifying and strategically locating desired uses, particularly at the 
ground plane, that will contribute positively to the Greenway. • Ensure the long term value of 
the public’s investment in creating the Greenway by shaping development to maximize the 
quality of the parks and extend their impact beyond its edges and into the Downtown 
neighborhoods.”
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7/30/2019 Issay Matsumoto Tufts Oppose I've been doing volunteer work in Chinatown for about 7 months now. I attended the public 
comment meeting at Harrison Ave. and hold strong opposition to the project. Real estate 
developers conduct open meetings for public comment to address the health, safety and 
livelihoods of residents and community stakeholders—or to at least show that they listened to 
what the people had to say. But has Oxford Properties listened? Beyond these bare minimum 
standards, Oxford Properties, should use these meetings and other avenues of community 
engagement to proactively serve residents and businesses in areas that have continued to be 
racially and economically excluded from important civic areas of life for more than a century. In 
the midst of an “affordable housing crisis” that has gripped major cities across the country, it is 
unacceptable to propose large scale development without a robust plan for how it will serve 
those who will see it in their own neighborhood. It is blatantly evasive, untransparent, and 
insulting to community members—who attend open meetings, bring valuable community 
expertise, and ask important questions—for Oxford Properties not to have properly explored 
opportunities for affordable housing, and be so inadequately prepared to address anxieties 
about the eventual evictions of Hei La Moon and C-Mart. Put simply: one should show up to a 
meeting having done one’s homework. Oxford Properties has not shown in the least that they 
have done their homework: their 787-page project notification form devotes one sentence to 
housing on page 24. A 24-story They have not considered the people most directly affected by 
their investment schemes. The Mason Place resident said it succinctly: imagine the 
community’s quality of life. It was clear from the meeting that every single resident in that room 
opposed the development. One woman even called a vote in Cantonese and everyone there 
raised their hand in opposition. People with real stakes in the community, who don't want to 
see theirs and others' quality of life decrease, overwhelmingly oppose this development. 
Please listen to them.

7/30/2019 Chi Chi Wu condo owners Oppose We are owners of a condo unit at 70 Lincoln Street, #L-214, across the street from the 
proposed project. We are strongly opposed to this development. We are concerned about the 
traffic that the development will bring, given the fact that it’s an enormous single use 
commercial building. We are also worried about construction impacts, including the noise & 
disruption to our unit. We are also opposed because of the loss of community institutions such 
as Hei La Moon and the C-Mart supermarket. Currently, our 90 plus year old parents live in 
our unit. They rely on the supermarket for their groceries and Hei La Moon for family dim sum 
on weekends. It is hard for our 90 plus year old parents to walk that much further to get 
groceries or for dim sum. We do recognize that there could be some affordable housing 
benefit to Chinatown but it is not enough to offset the harm from congestion, loss of 
community businesses, and the contribution to the gentrification in this neighborhood. Chi Chi 
Wu Andrew Leong
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7/30/2019 Brad Blake Leather District 
Neighborhood 
Association

Oppose My husband and I have been homeowners and residents of the Leather District for over a 
decade and have been actively involved in supporting neighborhood improvements through 
volunteering, contributing to funds to clean the neighborhood through organizations like 
Project Place, and through being active members of the Leather District Neighborhood 
Association. We also invested a significant amount of money and time in our building both in 
improving the common spaces and in renovating our condo, adding a mezzanine level to the 
existing roof and a deck, improving the home’s value. While we’ve lived there, we’ve also seen 
a lot of other improvements to the neighborhood including the Greenway adding to the parks 
in the Leather District and Chinatown, and more and more families staying in the 
neighborhood and raising their children there. From Oxford Property’s first meeting with the 
Leather District Neighborhood Association, they have led with assertions and numbers that 
are focused primarily on what Oxford needs to build there to make sure they maximize Oxford’
s profits, and they’ve only seemed to consider the neighbors and the neighborhoods as 
obstacles they need to appease just enough to get their project built. What they have 
proposed is a very nice office building that would profit Oxford Properties, but does not at all 
belong in this location for a number of reasons, including the following: 1. The proposal does 
not even come close to complying with zoning. 125 Lincoln Street falls within the Leather 
District, a small mixed-use residential neighborhood between South Station and Chinatown. 
To preserve the character and scale of the neighborhood, there is a maximum legal building 
height of 80 feet and six floors, with a possibility for up to 100 feet and eight floors with 
approval through a “Large Project Review”. The proposed building is 370 feet (340’ plus 30’ of 
mechanical) and 24 floors. 2. The proposal completely ignores the extensive, taxpayer-funded 
Greenway Use and Development Guidelines. The study was completed and guidelines 
created to ensure the public’s investment wasn’t taken advantage of by developers ignoring 
and/or trying to capitalize on the newly created public spaces. The 125 Lincoln parcel was 
extensively studied and included in the guidelines because of its unique position in connecting 
neighborhoods and the parks and its potential to create significant shadows on the Greenway 
that could negatively impact public use and viability of plantings. continued



125 Lincoln Street Public Comments 2019-08-07.xlsx

5

As stated in the guidelines: “Because of the length of its frontage on the Greenway, the 
Lincoln Street Garage Site, if redeveloped, could profoundly affect the character of the 
Chinatown Park and the adjacent Beach Street Crossroad…Future additions or 
redevelopment of this site will be limited to 100’ by the high potential for shadows cast on the 
park. Development here should align with the 80’/100’ heights of the existing Leather District 
fabric.” 3. The proposal would create a wall between the Leather District and Chinatown. The 
purpose of the Greenway District Planning Study was to analyze how the removal of the 
central artery and the introduction of a park system could ‘stitch together old neighborhoods’ 
and work toward ‘repairing the urban fabric.’ Constructing a 370’ tall office tower along the 
Leather District/Chinatown edge is out of scale with both neighborhoods, is out of alignment 
with the use of surrounding buildings, and has the potential to divide more than unite. It 
includes a garage entrance/exit and loading dock that would slide right through the Beach 
Street Connector (the road that runs from South Station, through the Leather District, and to 
the Greenway parks and Chinatown) which is currently being redone to support pedestrian 
activity with all new sidewalks and lighting. Furthermore, the existing businesses on the site 
attract residents from both communities and bridge any cultural gaps that might exist. 4. The 
proposal is an affront to Boston’s sustainability goals by prioritizing a limited use building at the 
expense of two vibrant mixed-use neighborhoods. Typical office buildings are used on a 9-5 
basis and five days a week. They activate the streets around them only 25% of the time and 
push heavy burdens on infrastructure at peak hours. They waste resources, do little to 
increase pedestrian traffic on nights and weekends, and limit opportunities for smaller 
businesses. Oxford has used their multitude of resources to push forth a project that ignores 
the health, safety, and livability of both the Leather District and Chinatown. The fact that the 
City is spending taxpayer funded resources to consider this proposal calls into question the 
role of zoning regulations and the relationship between the City and big businesses at the 
expense of urban residents. Unfortunately, because the city is entertaining this proposal, the 
burden is now on the taxpaying citizens and business owners to fight this. Representatives 
from Oxford Properties have been very professional and respectful and say they’ve been 
listening as they’ve met with the neighborhood a number of times. I also think Oxford 
Properties has done a nice job with other properties they own in the city, including the nearby 
lobby project at 125 Summer Street. I hope that they will truly listen to the Leather District and 
Chinatown’s extensive feedback and opposition and go back to the drawing board to come 
back with a proposal that first seeks to improve and complement the neighborhoods and city it’
s in, rather than trying to push through the biggest building they possibly can to maximize 
profits.

7/30/2019 Catherine Chan Oppose Hello, I am in agreement with my neighbors in Lincoln Plaza and the LDNA, and oppose the 
current designs for 125 Lincoln St. The developers were aware of the height restrictions when 
they purchased the parcel; their plans far exceed them. The proposed building will not add to 
or enhance the neighborhood, rather it will wall off and cut the Leather District off from 
Chinatown and the Greenway. My neighbors have stated their opposition far better than I, and 
I am in full agreement with Lincoln Plaza & the LDNA.
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7/28/2019 John Randle Oppose I support construction of a new building to replace the existing one. However: - I see no 
reason and the applicants provide no reason why the new building should be allowed to 
violate existing zoning and planning limits to the height of the building, so the building should 
be scaled back to respect these limits. - The plan includes no residential units, which violates 
the mixed use nature of the neighborhood, and is what is needed to strengthen the vibrancy of 
the neighborhood and reinforce the benefits for the residents living here. - As it is, the benefits 
accrue to the pensioners in Ontario, to whom wealth will be transferred due to the planned 
gross violation of the building standards. - As I understand it, State Street will soon be moving, 
so there will be a glut of office space in the area and the developers have no anchor occupant. 
Plus, odds are that we are approaching the end of the building cycle, so an empty tombstone 
building will do no good for anyone.
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7/28/2019 Karen Tokos teacher/parent Oppose I attended the public meeting for this project held at Saint James the Greater Church in 
Chinatown on July 18th. After I rose to speak, the developer requested that my written 
submission to the BPDA include specific references to the Project Notification Form. Before I 
continue in that vein, I wish to state for you that I believe the Leather District exists today 
because people live here. The mixed residential and commercial use of the historic buildings 
in my neighborhood preserved the formerly industrial district from falling into urban decay and 
consequent demolition. The building that occupied the site of 125 Lincoln prior to the current 
structure was demolished during the construction of the Surface Artery (web: Chinatownatlas.
org). At that time, sites more attractive to residents existed to the south of Chinatown, and the 
population expanded in that direction (web: Chinatownatlas.org). Today, a neighborhood 
exists across the Surface Artery. The 125 Lincoln site offers an opportunity to connect two 
residential communities and increase resident population density in Downtown Boston. The 
proposal to erect a 24-story office tower at 125 Lincoln is both a missed opportunity and a 
literal obstacle to future opportunities to increase the resident population of Downtown Boston. 
Supporting argument for my position follows in reference to the 125 Lincoln Project Notification 
Form. I have submitted separate entries for each chapter of the proposal due to space 
limitations. Chapter One 1.2 Site Context and Existing Conditions The site consists of 
approximately 0.64 acres of developed land located at 125 Lincoln Street in the Leather 
District of Boston (the “Project Site”). It is located in close proximity to several Massachusetts 
Bay Transportation Authority (“MBTA”) stations including South Station, which features access 
to Red Line, Silver Line, commuter and passenger rails, Amtrak, and regional and local bus 
service. The Project Site is also less than half a mile from each of (i) the Downtown Crossing 
MBTA Station, with access to Red Line and Orange Line service, (ii) Park Street Station, with 
access to Red Line and Green Line service, (iii) Boylston Street Station with access to Green 
Line service, and (iv) Chinatown Station with access to Orange Line service. The developer 
correctly locates the project site within the boundaries of the Leather District. As such, I 
oppose the proposal for its disregard of the mixed residential/commercial uses currently 
demonstrating success in the Leather District. Furthermore, the addition of 4,000 office 
workers to the Leather District substantially dilutes the population of residents thereby further 
jeopardizing resident interest in the continued development of our neighborhood. The 
developer correctly locates the project site in proximity to multiple modes of public 
transportation. I will comment further on this topic in the chapter concerning transportation. 
1.4.3 Transportation In collaboration with BTD and the community the Proponent will perform 
an evaluation of the potential for the improvement of the north-south pedestrian 
accommodations at the Lincoln Street/Essex Street/Surface Street intersection The need for 
improvement at this intersection currently exists. I encourage city officials to visit this site 
during the morning or evening commute. It’s chaotic. Adding 2,000+more people at this 
intersection during peak hours is beyond my imagination. If there is not “potential for the 
improvement of the north-south pedestrian accommodation” at this intersection, the project 
proposal is not feasible. 1.4.4 Social and Economic Benefits The Project will strengthen 
economic vitality in the Leather District/Chinatown neighborhood by replacing a deteriorated 
commercial asset with an active office building with ground floor retail and public gathering 
spaces. The Project is expected to provide leasable space for or otherwise directly create 
approximately 3,000 permanent jobs. Economic vitality, as I experience it, is not enhanced by 
an office building. Residents of the Leather District and Chinatown will be severely 
outnumbered by the commuter population introduced into this space. The ground floor retail 
and public gathering spaces will inevitably be enjoyed by the occupants of the commercial 
space to the exclusion of Leather District and Chinatown residents. To my knowledge, there is 
no shortage of work for skilled professionals in the city of Boston. The job creation described 
here primarily serves surrounding suburban residents, not the residents of the City of Boston.
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7/28/2019 Karen Tokos teacher/parent Oppose I attended the public meeting for this project held at Saint James the Greater Church in 
Chinatown on July 18th. After I rose to speak, the developer requested that my written 
submission to the BPDA include specific references to the Project Notification Form. Before I 
continue in that vein, I wish to state for you that I believe the Leather District exists today 
because people live here. The mixed residential and commercial use of the historic buildings 
in my neighborhood preserved the formerly industrial district from falling into urban decay and 
consequent demolition. The building that occupied the site of 125 Lincoln prior to the current 
structure was demolished during the construction of the Surface Artery (web: Chinatownatlas.
org). At that time, sites more attractive to residents existed to the south of Chinatown, and the 
population expanded in that direction (web: Chinatownatlas.org). Today, a neighborhood 
exists across the Surface Artery. The 125 Lincoln site offers an opportunity to connect two 
residential communities and increase resident population density in Downtown Boston. The 
proposal to erect a 24-story office tower at 125 Lincoln is both a missed opportunity and a 
literal obstacle to future opportunities to increase the resident population of Downtown Boston. 
Supporting argument for my position follows in reference to the 125 Lincoln Project Notification 
Form. I have submitted separate entries for each chapter of the proposal due to space 
limitations. Chapter One 1.2 Site Context and Existing Conditions The site consists of 
approximately 0.64 acres of developed land located at 125 Lincoln Street in the Leather 
District of Boston (the “Project Site”). It is located in close proximity to several Massachusetts 
Bay Transportation Authority (“MBTA”) stations including South Station, which features access 
to Red Line, Silver Line, commuter and passenger rails, Amtrak, and regional and local bus 
service. The Project Site is also less than half a mile from each of (i) the Downtown Crossing 
MBTA Station, with access to Red Line and Orange Line service, (ii) Park Street Station, with 
access to Red Line and Green Line service, (iii) Boylston Street Station with access to Green 
Line service, and (iv) Chinatown Station with access to Orange Line service. continued
The developer correctly locates the project site within the boundaries of the Leather District. 
As such, I oppose the proposal for its disregard of the mixed residential/commercial uses 
currently demonstrating success in the Leather District. Furthermore, the addition of 4,000 
office workers to the Leather District substantially dilutes the population of residents thereby 
further jeopardizing resident interest in the continued development of our neighborhood. The 
developer correctly locates the project site in proximity to multiple modes of public 
transportation. I will comment further on this topic in the chapter concerning transportation. 
1.4.3 Transportation In collaboration with BTD and the community the Proponent will perform 
an evaluation of the potential for the improvement of the north-south pedestrian 
accommodations at the Lincoln Street/Essex Street/Surface Street intersection The need for 
improvement at this intersection currently exists. I encourage city officials to visit this site 
during the morning or evening commute. It’s chaotic. Adding 2,000+more people at this 
intersection during peak hours is beyond my imagination. If there is not “potential for the 
improvement of the north-south pedestrian accommodation” at this intersection, the project 
proposal is not feasible. 1.4.4 Social and Economic Benefits The Project will strengthen 
economic vitality in the Leather District/Chinatown neighborhood by replacing a deteriorated 
commercial asset with an active office building with ground floor retail and public gathering 
spaces. The Project is expected to provide leasable space for or otherwise directly create 
approximately 3,000 permanent jobs. Economic vitality, as I experience it, is not enhanced by 
an office building. Residents of the Leather District and Chinatown will be severely 
outnumbered by the commuter population introduced into this space. The ground floor retail 
and public gathering spaces will inevitably be enjoyed by the occupants of the commercial 
space to the exclusion of Leather District and Chinatown residents. To my knowledge, there is 
no shortage of work for skilled professionals in the city of Boston. The job creation described 
here primarily serves surrounding suburban residents, not the residents of the City of Boston.
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7/28/2019 Karen Tokos teacher/parent Oppose I attended the public meeting for this project held at Saint James the Greater Church in 
Chinatown on July 18th. After I rose to speak, the developer requested that my written 
submission to the BPDA include specific references to the Project Notification Form. Before I 
continue in that vein, I wish to state for you that I believe the Leather District exists today 
because people live here. The mixed residential and commercial use of the historic buildings 
in my neighborhood preserved the formerly industrial district from falling into urban decay and 
consequent demolition. The building that occupied the site of 125 Lincoln prior to the current 
structure was demolished during the construction of the Surface Artery (web: Chinatownatlas.
org). At that time, sites more attractive to residents existed to the south of Chinatown, and the 
population expanded in that direction (web: Chinatownatlas.org). Today, a neighborhood 
exists across the Surface Artery. The 125 Lincoln site offers an opportunity to connect two 
residential communities and increase resident population density in Downtown Boston. The 
proposal to erect a 24-story office tower at 125 Lincoln is both a missed opportunity and a 
literal obstacle to future opportunities to increase the resident population of Downtown Boston. 
Supporting argument for my position follows in reference to the 125 Lincoln Project Notification 
Form. I have submitted separate entries for each chapter of the proposal due to space 
limitations. Chapter One 1.2 Site Context and Existing Conditions The site consists of 
approximately 0.64 acres of developed land located at 125 Lincoln Street in the Leather 
District of Boston (the “Project Site”). It is located in close proximity to several Massachusetts 
Bay Transportation Authority (“MBTA”) stations including South Station, which features access 
to Red Line, Silver Line, commuter and passenger rails, Amtrak, and regional and local bus 
service. The Project Site is also less than half a mile from each of (i) the Downtown Crossing 
MBTA Station, with access to Red Line and Orange Line service, (ii) Park Street Station, with 
access to Red Line and Green Line service, (iii) Boylston Street Station with access to Green 
Line service, and (iv) Chinatown Station with access to Orange Line service. continued
 The developer correctly locates the project site within the boundaries of the Leather District. 
As such, I oppose the proposal for its disregard of the mixed residential/commercial uses 
currently demonstrating success in the Leather District. Furthermore, the addition of 4,000 
office workers to the Leather District substantially dilutes the population of residents thereby 
further jeopardizing resident interest in the continued development of our neighborhood. The 
developer correctly locates the project site in proximity to multiple modes of public 
transportation. I will comment further on this topic in the chapter concerning transportation. 
1.4.3 Transportation In collaboration with BTD and the community the Proponent will perform 
an evaluation of the potential for the improvement of the north-south pedestrian 
accommodations at the Lincoln Street/Essex Street/Surface Street intersection The need for 
improvement at this intersection currently exists. I encourage city officials to visit this site 
during the morning or evening commute. It’s chaotic. Adding 2,000+more people at this 
intersection during peak hours is beyond my imagination. If there is not “potential for the 
improvement of the north-south pedestrian accommodation” at this intersection, the project 
proposal is not feasible. 1.4.4 Social and Economic Benefits The Project will strengthen 
economic vitality in the Leather District/Chinatown neighborhood by replacing a deteriorated 
commercial asset with an active office building with ground floor retail and public gathering 
spaces. The Project is expected to provide leasable space for or otherwise directly create 
approximately 3,000 permanent jobs. Economic vitality, as I experience it, is not enhanced by 
an office building. Residents of the Leather District and Chinatown will be severely 
outnumbered by the commuter population introduced into this space. The ground floor retail 
and public gathering spaces will inevitably be enjoyed by the occupants of the commercial 
space to the exclusion of Leather District and Chinatown residents. To my knowledge, there is 
no shortage of work for skilled professionals in the city of Boston. The job creation described 
here primarily serves surrounding suburban residents, not the residents of the City of Boston.
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7/28/2019 Karen Tokos teacher/parent Oppose I attended the public meeting for this project held at Saint James the Greater Church in 
Chinatown on July 18th. After I rose to speak, the developer requested that my written 
submission to the BPDA include specific references to the Project Notification Form. Before I 
continue in that vein, I wish to state for you that I believe the Leather District exists today 
because people live here. The mixed residential and commercial use of the historic buildings 
in my neighborhood preserved the formerly industrial district from falling into urban decay and 
consequent demolition. The building that occupied the site of 125 Lincoln prior to the current 
structure was demolished during the construction of the Surface Artery (web: Chinatownatlas.
org). At that time, sites more attractive to residents existed to the south of Chinatown, and the 
population expanded in that direction (web: Chinatownatlas.org). Today, a neighborhood 
exists across the Surface Artery. The 125 Lincoln site offers an opportunity to connect two 
residential communities and increase resident population density in Downtown Boston. The 
proposal to erect a 24-story office tower at 125 Lincoln is both a missed opportunity and a 
literal obstacle to future opportunities to increase the resident population of Downtown Boston. 
Supporting argument for my position follows in reference to the 125 Lincoln Project Notification 
Form. continued
I have submitted separate entries for each chapter of the proposal due to space limitations. 
Chapter Two 2.1 Summary of Key Findings and Benefits Enhancement of the existing open 
space into a significant open space that serves the Leather District, Chinatown, and daytime 
office workers The existing open space, known as Triangle Park, is most heavily utilized by 
residents of Chinatown who gather here socially in the context of grocery shopping at C Mart. 
In practice, the open space described in the proposal will be utilized exclusively by 
commuters. During nighttime hours, it will be necessary for this space to be brightly lit in order 
to deter the transient population in our neighborhoods from gathering. Leather District 
residents will therefore be subjected to increased light pollution that has not been addressed in 
this proposal. 2.4.1 Height and Massing The Building’s height will be set at 340 feet,1 
consistent with other buildings along the Rose Kennedy Greenway and within the adjacent 
Financial District. Please disregard all artistic renderings of the proposed project. These 
images are misleading or perhaps deceitful. I have visited each of vantage points from which 
these images might be generated. The perspectives shown here are not achievable unless 
viewed from inside an existing structure and/or from a height well below 5 feet. For example, 
Fig 2.3b shows LD height at the 3rd floor above lobby level of the proposed tower and the 
cover illustration suggests that the LD height measures up to about the 14th floor above lobby 
level. As for computer generated models, Fig 2.3b shows 125 Lincoln in comparison to high 
rise buildings as if they are immediate abutters. When considering the scale of this project, 
consider the immediate abutters. The proposed tower is 2.5 to 3 fold out of scale with all of the 
structures that surround it.
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7/28/2019 Karen Tokos teacher/parent Oppose I attended the public meeting for this project held at Saint James the Greater Church in 
Chinatown on July 18th. After I rose to speak, the developer requested that my written 
submission to the BPDA include specific references to the Project Notification Form. Before I 
continue in that vein, I wish to state for you that I believe the Leather District exists today 
because people live here. The mixed residential and commercial use of the historic buildings 
in my neighborhood preserved the formerly industrial district from falling into urban decay and 
consequent demolition. The building that occupied the site of 125 Lincoln prior to the current 
structure was demolished during the construction of the Surface Artery (web: Chinatownatlas.
org). At that time, sites more attractive to residents existed to the south of Chinatown, and the 
population expanded in that direction (web: Chinatownatlas.org). Today, a neighborhood 
exists across the Surface Artery. The 125 Lincoln site offers an opportunity to connect two 
residential communities and increase resident population density in Downtown Boston. The 
proposal to erect a 24-story office tower at 125 Lincoln is both a missed opportunity and a 
literal obstacle to future opportunities to increase the resident population of Downtown Boston. 
Supporting argument for my position follows in reference to the 125 Lincoln Project Notification 
Form. I have submitted separate entries for each chapter of the proposal due to space 
limitations. Chapter Three (none) Chapter Four 4.1 Improvements to Beach Street will include 
substantial widening of sidewalks and other improvements to enhance the pedestrian 
environment. The work currently underway on Beach Street substantially improves the 
pedestrian experience. Leather District residents have been advocating for this work for more 
than 20 years. continued
However, this work does not effectively widen the sidewalk. Street lamps and sign posts are 
not relocated, therefore the width of the sidewalk for pedestrian traffic remains unchanged. 
4.2.5 Pedestrian Facilities Sidewalks along the roadway network near the Project Site are 
generally in good Condition. This statement is true concerning the sidewalks on Essex Street 
between Atlantic and the Surface Road, the sidewalk along the Surface Road on western 
boundary of the project, and the newly constructed sidewalks on Beach Street. This statement 
is false concerning the sidewalks serving pedestrian traffic along Essex St. in the direction 
toward the Chinatown and Boylston Street “T” stops. The developer has identified this route as 
a major carrier for pedestrian traffic to serve 125 Lincoln Street. This project is not feasible 
without substantial investment by the city to improve the pedestrian experience from the 
Chinatown and Boylston “T” stops during peak commuter traffic hours. Figure 4.1 Pedestrian 
traffic down Essex St. The “T” currently under serves the needs of Boston commuters. I do not 
own a car and I rely primarily on the “T” for transportation. The nearest stop to the Leather 
District is South Station. However, if I am using the green line or the orange line I never 
transfer to the red line to reach the Leather District. To do so will add more time to my trip than 
a walk from Boylston or Chinatown. Trolley and subway commuters to the project site can be 
expected to make the same choices. The level of pedestrian traffic down Essex St. should be 
considered significantly impacted by the proposed project. The proposal does not include any 
plan on the part of the city or the developer to improve the pedestrian experience down Essex 
St. 4.2.7 The Project site is served by several MBTA public transportation services, including: 
Bus Routes: 4, 7, 11, 15, 448, 449, 459, 501, 504, 505, 553, 554, 556, and 558; I have used 
bus routes 504, 553, 554, and 556 for the past 19 years for my daily commute reverse 
commute. I am familiar with rider experience with these services. These routes, as well as 
routes 505 and 558, overwhelmingly serve suburban commuters. These buses are full to 
capacity during AM inbound and PM outbound peak hours. The inbound drop off stop for 
routes 501, 504, 505, 553, 554, 556, and 558 is on Lincoln Street opposite to the project site. 
Increased capacity on these routes will require addition of more trips. Addition of more trips 
with more frequent stops for passenger drop off will exacerbate gridlock on the local roads in 
the immediate vicinity of the project site and backup onto the off ramps from 90 West.



125 Lincoln Street Public Comments 2019-08-07.xlsx

12

7/28/2019 Karen Tokos teacher/parent Oppose I attended the public meeting for this project held at Saint James the Greater Church in 
Chinatown on July 18th. After I rose to speak, the developer requested that my written 
submission to the BPDA include specific references to the Project Notification Form. Before I 
continue in that vein, I wish to state for you that I believe the Leather District exists today 
because people live here. The mixed residential and commercial use of the historic buildings 
in my neighborhood preserved the formerly industrial district from falling into urban decay and 
consequent demolition. The building that occupied the site of 125 Lincoln prior to the current 
structure was demolished during the construction of the Surface Artery (web: Chinatownatlas.
org). At that time, sites more attractive to residents existed to the south of Chinatown, and the 
population expanded in that direction (web: Chinatownatlas.org). Today, a neighborhood 
exists across the Surface Artery. The 125 Lincoln site offers an opportunity to connect two 
residential communities and increase resident population density in Downtown Boston. The 
proposal to erect a 24-story office tower at 125 Lincoln is both a missed opportunity and a 
literal obstacle to future opportunities to increase the resident population of Downtown Boston. 
Supporting argument for my position follows in reference to the 125 Lincoln Project Notification 
Form. I have submitted separate entries for each chapter of the proposal due to space 
limitations. Chapter Three (none) Chapter Four 4.1 Improvements to Beach Street will include 
substantial widening of sidewalks and other improvements to enhance the pedestrian 
environment. The work currently underway on Beach Street substantially improves the 
pedestrian experience. Leather District residents have been advocating for this work for more 
than 20 years. continued
However, this work does not effectively widen the sidewalk. Street lamps and sign posts are 
not relocated, therefore the width of the sidewalk for pedestrian traffic remains unchanged. 
4.2.5 Pedestrian Facilities Sidewalks along the roadway network near the Project Site are 
generally in good Condition. This statement is true concerning the sidewalks on Essex Street 
between Atlantic and the Surface Road, the sidewalk along the Surface Road on western 
boundary of the project, and the newly constructed sidewalks on Beach Street. This statement 
is false concerning the sidewalks serving pedestrian traffic along Essex St. in the direction 
toward the Chinatown and Boylston Street “T” stops. The developer has identified this route as 
a major carrier for pedestrian traffic to serve 125 Lincoln Street. This project is not feasible 
without substantial investment by the city to improve the pedestrian experience from the 
Chinatown and Boylston “T” stops during peak commuter traffic hours. Figure 4.1 Pedestrian 
traffic down Essex St. The “T” currently under serves the needs of Boston commuters. I do not 
own a car and I rely primarily on the “T” for transportation. The nearest stop to the Leather 
District is South Station. However, if I am using the green line or the orange line I never 
transfer to the red line to reach the Leather District. To do so will add more time to my trip than 
a walk from Boylston or Chinatown. Trolley and subway commuters to the project site can be 
expected to make the same choices. The level of pedestrian traffic down Essex St. should be 
considered significantly impacted by the proposed project. The proposal does not include any 
plan on the part of the city or the developer to improve the pedestrian experience down Essex 
St. 4.2.7 The Project site is served by several MBTA public transportation services, including: 
Bus Routes: 4, 7, 11, 15, 448, 449, 459, 501, 504, 505, 553, 554, 556, and 558; I have used 
bus routes 504, 553, 554, and 556 for the past 19 years for my daily commute reverse 
commute. I am familiar with rider experience with these services. These routes, as well as 
routes 505 and 558, overwhelmingly serve suburban commuters. These buses are full to 
capacity during AM inbound and PM outbound peak hours. The inbound drop off stop for 
routes 501, 504, 505, 553, 554, 556, and 558 is on Lincoln Street opposite to the project site. 
Increased capacity on these routes will require addition of more trips. Addition of more trips 
with more frequent stops for passenger drop off will exacerbate gridlock on the local roads in 
the immediate vicinity of the project site and backup onto the off ramps from 90 West.
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7/28/2019 Karen Tokos teacher/parent Oppose I attended the public meeting for this project held at Saint James the Greater Church in 
Chinatown on July 18th. After I rose to speak, the developer requested that my written 
submission to the BPDA include specific references to the Project Notification Form. Before I 
continue in that vein, I wish to state for you that I believe the Leather District exists today 
because people live here. The mixed residential and commercial use of the historic buildings 
in my neighborhood preserved the formerly industrial district from falling into urban decay and 
consequent demolition. The building that occupied the site of 125 Lincoln prior to the current 
structure was demolished during the construction of the Surface Artery (web: Chinatownatlas.
org). At that time, sites more attractive to residents existed to the south of Chinatown, and the 
population expanded in that direction (web: Chinatownatlas.org). Today, a neighborhood 
exists across the Surface Artery. The 125 Lincoln site offers an opportunity to connect two 
residential communities and increase resident population density in Downtown Boston. The 
proposal to erect a 24-story office tower at 125 Lincoln is both a missed opportunity and a 
literal obstacle to future opportunities to increase the resident population of Downtown Boston. 
Supporting argument for my position follows in reference to the 125 Lincoln Project Notification 
Form. I have submitted separate entries for each chapter of the proposal due to space 
limitations. Chapter Three (none) Chapter Four 4.1 Improvements to Beach Street will include 
substantial widening of sidewalks and other improvements to enhance the pedestrian 
environment. The work currently underway on Beach Street substantially improves the 
pedestrian experience. Leather District residents have been advocating for this work for more 
than 20 years. continued
However, this work does not effectively widen the sidewalk. Street lamps and sign posts are 
not relocated, therefore the width of the sidewalk for pedestrian traffic remains unchanged. 
4.2.5 Pedestrian Facilities Sidewalks along the roadway network near the Project Site are 
generally in good Condition. This statement is true concerning the sidewalks on Essex Street 
between Atlantic and the Surface Road, the sidewalk along the Surface Road on western 
boundary of the project, and the newly constructed sidewalks on Beach Street. This statement 
is false concerning the sidewalks serving pedestrian traffic along Essex St. in the direction 
toward the Chinatown and Boylston Street “T” stops. The developer has identified this route as 
a major carrier for pedestrian traffic to serve 125 Lincoln Street. This project is not feasible 
without substantial investment by the city to improve the pedestrian experience from the 
Chinatown and Boylston “T” stops during peak commuter traffic hours. Figure 4.1 Pedestrian 
traffic down Essex St. The “T” currently under serves the needs of Boston commuters. I do not 
own a car and I rely primarily on the “T” for transportation. The nearest stop to the Leather 
District is South Station. However, if I am using the green line or the orange line I never 
transfer to the red line to reach the Leather District. To do so will add more time to my trip than 
a walk from Boylston or Chinatown. Trolley and subway commuters to the project site can be 
expected to make the same choices. The level of pedestrian traffic down Essex St. should be 
considered significantly impacted by the proposed project. The proposal does not include any 
plan on the part of the city or the developer to improve the pedestrian experience down Essex 
St. 4.2.7 The Project site is served by several MBTA public transportation services, including: 
Bus Routes: 4, 7, 11, 15, 448, 449, 459, 501, 504, 505, 553, 554, 556, and 558; I have used 
bus routes 504, 553, 554, and 556 for the past 19 years for my daily commute reverse 
commute. I am familiar with rider experience with these services. These routes, as well as 
routes 505 and 558, overwhelmingly serve suburban commuters. These buses are full to 
capacity during AM inbound and PM outbound peak hours. The inbound drop off stop for 
routes 501, 504, 505, 553, 554, 556, and 558 is on Lincoln Street opposite to the project site. 
Increased capacity on these routes will require addition of more trips. Addition of more trips 
with more frequent stops for passenger drop off will exacerbate gridlock on the local roads in 
the immediate vicinity of the project site and backup onto the off ramps from 90 West.
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7/28/2019 Karen Tokos teacher/parent Oppose I attended the public meeting for this project held at Saint James the Greater Church in 
Chinatown on July 18th. After I rose to speak, the developer requested that my written 
submission to the BPDA include specific references to the Project Notification Form. Before I 
continue in that vein, I wish to state for you that I believe the Leather District exists today 
because people live here. The mixed residential and commercial use of the historic buildings 
in my neighborhood preserved the formerly industrial district from falling into urban decay and 
consequent demolition. The building that occupied the site of 125 Lincoln prior to the current 
structure was demolished during the construction of the Surface Artery (web: Chinatownatlas.
org). At that time, sites more attractive to residents existed to the south of Chinatown, and the 
population expanded in that direction (web: Chinatownatlas.org). Today, a neighborhood 
exists across the Surface Artery. The 125 Lincoln site offers an opportunity to connect two 
residential communities and increase resident population density in Downtown Boston. The 
proposal to erect a 24-story office tower at 125 Lincoln is both a missed opportunity and a 
literal obstacle to future opportunities to increase the resident population of Downtown Boston. 
Supporting argument for my position follows in reference to the 125 Lincoln Project Notification 
Form. I have submitted separate entries for each chapter of the proposal due to space 
limitations. Chapter Five 5.1 Summary of Key Findings and Benefits Shadow – The 
incremental shadows produced are consistent with the dense, urban context of the Project and 
have been minimized to the extent reasonably practicable. Daylight – The Project will result in 
a reduction in the visible skydome when viewed from adjacent sidewalks compared to existing 
conditions. Such changes are consistent with the Project’s urban context and will be offset by 
substantial improvements to the public realm that are anticipated to improve the overall 
pedestrian experience as compared to existing conditions. continued
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When describing increased shadow and diminished daylight, the developer speaks of the 
context of the Project as if I live in Manhattan. The increased shadow and decreased daylight 
is not consistent with the residential context of Chinatown and Leather District communities. 
Furthermore, the developer goes on to explain that the negative impacts apply to pedestrians. 
I am struggling to maintain my rage as I point out that the developer has ignored the 
experience of Leather District residents who do not spend weekends in their ample back yard 
in Natick. Rather, Leather District and Chinatown residents rely on the City of Boston to 
protect the quality of our urban living space. Many historic structures in Chinatown and the 
Leather District were built to serve the textile industry in the early 20th century (web: 
Chinatownatlas.org). Substantial daylight illuminated the interior spaces where garment 
workers crafted textiles and leather goods. Now that these buildings have been repurposed as 
residential spaces, the people who live in Chinatown and the Leather District enjoy the 
healthful experience of natural light in our homes. Let’s keep it that way. 5.3 Shadow At 9:00 
AM on the vernal equinox, net new shadow from the Project will be cast to the northwest 
across the Surface Road and onto the neighboring properties to the west. By 12:00 noon, 
shadows shift northward across the Surface Road, shading a portion of Chinatown Park. At 3:
00 PM, the shadows will shift northeastward onto Lincoln Street and the Surface Road. At 9:00 
AM on the summer solstice, shadow from the Project will be cast westward across the surface 
road. At 12:00 noon, the Project will cast minimal net new shadow to the north onto the 
surface road. At 3:00 PM, small amount of net new shadow will extend from the Project Site to 
the northeast onto Lincoln Street. At 9:00 AM on the autumnal equinox, net new shadow from 
the Project will be cast across the Surface Road and onto neighboring properties to the West. 
By 12:00 noon, shadows shift northward across the Surface Road, shading a portion of 
Chinatown Park. At 3:00 PM, the shadows will shift northeastward onto Lincoln Street and the 
Surface Road. At 6:00 PM limited net new shadow is anticipated. My husband, our son, and I 
lived through the construction of the Big Dig and the emergence of the expansive Greenway. I 
am grateful that the City of Boston, under the leadership of Mayor Menino, kept the experience 
of Boston residents a priority throughout the ups and downs of this challenging and necessary 
improvement for transportation through our city. I make fewer than 20 trips through the tunnels 
per yet, I spend countless hours per year enjoying the Greenway and its associated amenities. 
The plantings in Chinatown Park are a jewel. Chinatown Park survived the construction of the 
Radian building because it still receives substantial sunlight during the morning and midday 
hours. The office tower proposed at this site will choke out the sun that sustains an oasis of 
greenery for Leather District and Chinatown residents. The creation of this space and its 
maintenance should be a model for future development, not a casualty of future development.
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7/28/2019 Karen Tokos teacher/parent Oppose I attended the public meeting for this project held at Saint James the Greater Church in 
Chinatown on July 18th. After I rose to speak, the developer requested that my written 
submission to the BPDA include specific references to the Project Notification Form. Before I 
continue in that vein, I wish to state for you that I believe the Leather District exists today 
because people live here. The mixed residential and commercial use of the historic buildings 
in my neighborhood preserved the formerly industrial district from falling into urban decay and 
consequent demolition. The building that occupied the site of 125 Lincoln prior to the current 
structure was demolished during the construction of the Surface Artery (web: Chinatownatlas.
org). At that time, sites more attractive to residents existed to the south of Chinatown, and the 
population expanded in that direction (web: Chinatownatlas.org). Today, a neighborhood 
exists across the Surface Artery. The 125 Lincoln site offers an opportunity to connect two 
residential communities and increase resident population density in Downtown Boston. The 
proposal to erect a 24-story office tower at 125 Lincoln is both a missed opportunity and a 
literal obstacle to future opportunities to increase the resident population of Downtown Boston. 
Supporting argument for my position follows in reference to the 125 Lincoln Project Notification 
Form. I have submitted separate entries for each chapter of the proposal due to space 
limitations. Chapter Six 6.1 Summary of Key Findings and Benefits The Project has been 
designed to embrace the rich architectural character of the surrounding Leather District 
neighborhood I implore the City of Boston to acknowledge that Chinatown and Leather District 
neighborhoods are made alive by the people who live here. We, the residents, embrace the 
rich architectural character of our neighborhoods and our lives within these spaces sustain the 
viability of Downtown Boston. I grew up in the suburbs of St. Louis, Missouri. My mother grew 
up within the City Limits, and she wanted to raise her children in an urban setting. continued
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However, my father was concerned about the expanding decay of downtown St. Louis and 
convinced her not to take the risk of buying a home in the city. This story is typical of middle 
class, white, couples who started families in my hometown in the 60’s and 70’s. Today, St. 
Louis is a hollow city with the heart carved out of its urban center. Only two of the people who 
attended the July 18th meeting at St. James the Greater Church in Chinatown were from the 
Leather District. The vast majority of the attendees were elderly Chinatown residents. What 
will be the fate of Chinatown when these elderly residents leave their homes behind? More 
office towers? We need a project for this site which places the experience of Boston residents 
at the center of the developer’s intention and imagination. “The rich architectural character of 
the surrounding Leather District neighborhood” will best be embraced by encouraging more 
people to live here. Please do not ignore the long term stability that a mixed commercial and 
residential development lends to a city. Abandon this proposal and search for a project that 
encourages people of diverse economic means and walks of life to live downtown. 6.4.3 
Shadow studies show a net increase in shadow production is likely to occur within the vicinity 
of the Chinatown District, Leather District, and the Textile District. Projections for March, June, 
September, and December show an increase in shadow cast within an approximate 2-3 block 
radius of the Project Site to the west and northwest at 9am, and a slight increase to the north 
at 12pm. This area falls within both the Chinatown District and the Textile District. The 
projections also show a consistent increase in shadow production within the Leather District at 
3pm – centered on its northwestern extent. Other historic resources identified in the vicinity of 
the Project would see no show change. Here, I repeat my comments concerning shadow. 
Buildings, historic or otherwise, do not care about sunlight. Living things, such as plants and 
people are affected by sunlight. My husband, our son, and I lived through the construction of 
the Big Dig and the emergence of the expansive Greenway. I am grateful that the City of 
Boston, under the leadership of Mayor Menino, kept the experience of Boston residents a 
priority throughout the ups and downs of this challenging and necessary improvement for 
transportation through our city. I make fewer than 20 trips through the tunnels per year and I 
spend countless hours per year enjoying the Greenway and its associated amenities. The 
plantings in Chinatown Park are a jewel. Chinatown Park survived the construction of the 
Radian building because it still receives substantial sunlight during the morning and midday 
hours. The office tower proposed at this site will choke out the sun that sustains an oasis of 
greenery for Leather District and Chinatown residents. The creation of this space and its 
maintenance should be a model for future development, not a casualty of future development.

7/28/2019 Karen Tokos teacher/parent Oppose I attended the public meeting for this project held at Saint James the Greater Church in 
Chinatown on July 18th. After I rose to speak, the developer requested that my written 
submission to the BPDA include specific references to the Project Notification Form. Before I 
continue in that vein, I wish to state for you that I believe the Leather District exists today 
because people live here. The mixed residential and commercial use of the historic buildings 
in my neighborhood preserved the formerly industrial district from falling into urban decay and 
consequent demolition. The building that occupied the site of 125 Lincoln prior to the current 
structure was demolished during the construction of the Surface Artery (web: Chinatownatlas.
org). At that time, sites more attractive to residents existed to the south of Chinatown, and the 
population expanded in that direction (web: Chinatownatlas.org). Today, a neighborhood 
exists across the Surface Artery. The 125 Lincoln site offers an opportunity to connect two 
residential communities and increase resident population density in Downtown Boston. The 
proposal to erect a 24-story office tower at 125 Lincoln is both a missed opportunity and a 
literal obstacle to future opportunities to increase the resident population of Downtown Boston. 
Supporting argument for my position follows in reference to the 125 Lincoln Project Notification 
Form. continued
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I have submitted separate entries for each chapter of the proposal due to space limitations. 
Appendix A Article 80 – Accessibility Checklist Surrounding Site Conditions Is the 
development site within a historic district? If yes, identify which district: No. The Project Site is 
immediately adjacent to the Leather District Historic District. This is a false statement. The 
development IS WITHIN the Leather District Historic District. See Chapter One of the PNF. 
The developer makes this point himself. Are there sidewalks and pedestrian ramps existing at 
the development site? If yes, list the existing sidewalk and pedestrian ramp dimensions, 
slopes, materials, and physical condition at the development site: There are existing concrete 
sidewalks along Lincoln Street, Beach Street, and Tufts Street that range in width from 
approximately 7ft to 10ft wide. There are two existing concrete ramps – one at the corner of 
Lincoln and Beach Streets and the other at corner of Lincoln and Tufts Streets. The developer’
s description of the sidewalk widths is false. I made photos on Saturday, July 20, at 
approximates 3pm (listed below). Since this format does not support images, I will submit 
them separately to all parties concerned with the public comment process. 1. Beach St. 
Sidewalks improved topography 2. Topographically improved Beach Street sidewalk is 
effectively 6 ft. wide 3. Essex St. sidewalk (south) effectively 5 ft. wide 4. Location of Essex St. 
photo 5. Lincoln St. Sidewalk (east) effectively 5 ft. wide location of Lincoln St photo 6. Tufts 
Sidewalk(south) 5 ft. wide 7. Location of Tufts St. photo. Tufts sidewalk (south) with fireplug in 
center plus steep pitch between Utica and Lincoln 8. Tufts Sidewalk (North) 3 ft. wide 9. Tufts 
Sidewalk(North) accommodates two people max

7/26/2019 Kim Halliday Oppose This proposed building is too tall. It will block sunlight and sky from the Leather District, 
thereby reducing the quality of life in one of the few truly residential downtown Boston 
neighborhoods. Like the building at 2 Financial, this building should be limited to no more than 
12 stories. In addition, any parking facility should be required to provide reduced cost parking 
for Leather District residents with parking permits.

7/25/2019 Kenneth McIntire Leather District 
resident

Oppose Michael Sinatra, Project Manager Boston Planning & Development Agency One City Hall 
Square Boston, MA 02201 Dear Michael Sinatra, I would like to take this opportunity to weigh 
in on the proposed building at 125 Lincoln St. Let me be as clear as possible, the proposed 
building height is unacceptable. It violates the current zoning law, it is bad for the 
neighborhood, bad for the Greenway and bad for Chinatown. I oppose this development. As 
you are well aware, the zoning height for this parcel of land is approximately 80/100 feet (give 
or take). This zone height wasn’t created capriciously, or out of context, it was created in the 
context of the neighborhood, namely the Leather District, the Greenway, and Chinatown. As 
you are also aware, there were two studies done in 1990 and 2010, that confirmed this zoning 
height. This is the reason studies are done, plans are developed, and zoning is created and 
enforced, so ALL are on the same plan. Might I also take a moment and state that the current 
zoning height was something that Oxford properties was well aware of when they purchased 
this property. It was their intention from the onset, to void this zoning restriction. Basically, 
putting a stake in the ground, that their desires and profits are more important than the 
neighborhood that they exist in. Let me point out that the Leather District is a small, low rise 
neighborhood. We are basically 2.5 blocks length wise by 3 blocks. This parcel takes up 1 full 
block length wise. It is almost ½ the length of the Leather District. All the proposed renderings 
of the building do everything in their visual power, to mitigate this. They do NOT display AT 
ALL, the immense WALL this building will create. WALL sir, WALL. I cannot say it any other 
way. The Leather District neighborhood, had to endure countless hours of construction, 
detours, traffic (and still does) whilst the big dig was being executed, with the promise and 
hope that at the end, we, like other neighborhoods, bordering it, will have the Greenway as the 
finished product. continued
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Now that Greenway is a success, developers such are Oxford Properties are rushing in to 
cash in on this, when they had nothing at stake when the construction occurred. Now, they are 
asking to build a huge WALL, blocking out the Leather District views and providing basically 
commuters, who don’t live in the city, pay taxes and provide life to the city, spectacular views 
of the Greenway and beyond. All at our expense. The Greenway is the goal here, yet this 
building will cast huge shadows on the Greenway. Will create wind tunnels and add more and 
more traffic in the area (3,000 to 4,000 commuters are not all going to take public transport, 
there will be endless pickups and drop offs.) Basically, destroying the very element that is 
attracting the building here in the first place. In addition, part of the Greenway is the small park 
next to this parcel on Lincoln St. During their so called “construction”, they are going to level 
the park and kill all the trees and then create something in the future. All for them. Do you 
know how long it takes to get trees to grow so they provide shade again? Approximately 10 
years. The Leather District finally has some shade trees and this construction is going to 
destroy that, so that after their construction (3 years) new trees will be planted. That is 13 
years before we have shade trees again. Again, all about Oxford Properties needs, not about 
the Greenway. And then we get to Chinatown. The Leather District is part of the Chinatown 
neighborhood. So, let’s build a WALL in between. This is an office building, so no life on 
evenings or weekends. Do you think the street level business are going to cater to Chinatown 
or the 3,000 to 4,000 weekday office occupants? Did any of the new buildings in the area cater 
to anyone except the week day office occupants??? The answer is NO. Finally, there is the 
zoning exemption itself. They are not asking to put up a flag pole or extend the top of the 
building for a chimney or elevator head house. The current building is approximately 60 feet 
and is already very imposing on the street. The new height is 370 feet or 6 (yes 6) times the 
height of the existing building. Two times the existing height is already exceeding the zoning 
and will be out of proportion to the neighborhood. There was a reason for a zoning restriction 
for this parcel of land. Planners knew that a huge building would be bad for everyone 
concerned except a developer. There is a law in place to prevent this. It is the same law that 
prevents building heights in the Seaport, Beacon Hill, South End, etc, (Just because the 
Federal Government wants a height restriction in the Seaport as well, does make a law any 
stronger, law is law.) I shouldn’t have to be writing this letter, as there a LAW preventing this. 
That was the point of the LAW. You are asking existing residents, to allow an office tower in 
the middle of what is now, a mostly residential area, where we will have to endure 3 years of 
endless destructions/construction, traffic, noise and large quantities of pollution. And what do 
we get in return? A huge WALL, that removes our sunlight, any visible skies from our units and 
reduces our property values, all while giving all the benefits to this corporation. As a resident 
for 15 years in the Leather District, I am (and from the recent planning meetings, so are most 
of my neighbors), thoroughly opposed any exemption to the zoning law as it is now stated for 
this parcel. Sincerely, Kenneth McIntire 108 Lincoln St #4A Boston, MA 02111
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7/24/2019 Paul Gagnon Resident Oppose Michael Sinatra, Project Manager Boston Planning & Development Agency One City Hall 
Square Boston, MA 02201 Dear Michael Sinatra, I would like to take this opportunity to weigh 
in on the proposed building at 125 Lincoln St. Let me be as clear as possible, the proposed 
building height is unacceptable. It violates the current zoning law, it is bad for the 
neighborhood, bad for the Greenway and bad for Chinatown. I oppose this development. As 
you are well aware, the zoning height for this parcel of land is approximately 80/100 feet (give 
or take). This zone height wasn’t created capriciously, or out of context, it was created in the 
context of the neighborhood, namely the Leather District, the Greenway, and Chinatown. As 
you are also aware, there were two studies done in 1990 and 2010, that confirmed this zoning 
height. This is the reason studies are done, plans are developed, and zoning is created and 
enforced, so ALL are on the same plan. Might I also take a moment and state that the current 
zoning height was something that Oxford properties was well aware of when they purchased 
this property. It was their intention from the onset, to void this zoning restriction. Basically, 
putting a stake in the ground, that their desires and profits are more important than the 
neighborhood that they exist in. Let me point out that the Leather District is a small, low rise 
neighborhood. We are basically 2.5 blocks length wise by 3 blocks. This parcel takes up 1 full 
block length wise. It is almost ½ the length of the Leather District. All the proposed renderings 
of the building do everything in their visual power, to mitigate this. They do NOT display AT 
ALL, the immense WALL this building will create. WALL sir, WALL. I cannot say it any other 
way. The Leather District neighborhood, had to endure countless hours of construction, 
detours, traffic (and still does) whilst the big dig was being executed, with the promise and 
hope that at the end, we, like other neighborhoods, bordering it, will have the Greenway as the 
finished product. continued
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Now that Greenway is a success, developers such are Oxford Properties are rushing in to 
cash in on this, when they had nothing at stake when the construction occurred. Now, they are 
asking to build a huge WALL, blocking out the Leather District views and providing basically 
commuters, who don’t live in the city, pay taxes and provide life to the city, spectacular views 
of the Greenway and beyond. All at our expense. The Greenway is the goal here, yet this 
building will cast huge shadows on the Greenway. Will create wind tunnels and add more and 
more traffic in the area (3,000 to 4,000 commuters are not all going to take public transport, 
there will be endless pickups and drop offs.) Basically, destroying the very element that is 
attracting the building here in the first place. In addition, part of the Greenway is the small park 
next to this parcel on Lincoln St. During their so called “construction”, they are going to level 
the park and kill all the trees and then create something in the future. All for them. Do you 
know how long it takes to get trees to grow so they provide shade again? Approximately 10 
years. The Leather District finally has some shade trees and this construction is going to 
destroy that, so that after their construction (3 years) new trees will be planted. That is 13 
years before we have shade trees again. Again, all about Oxford Properties needs, not about 
the Greenway. And then we get to Chinatown. The Leather District is part of the Chinatown 
neighborhood. So, let’s build a WALL in between. This is an office building, so no life on 
evenings or weekends. Do you think the street level business are going to cater to Chinatown 
or the 3,000 to 4,000 weekday office occupants? Did any of the new buildings in the area cater 
to anyone except the week day office occupants??? The answer is NO. Finally, there is the 
zoning exemption itself. They are not asking to put up a flag pole or extend the top of the 
building for a chimney or elevator head house. The current building is approximately 60 feet 
and is already very imposing on the street. The new height is 370 feet or 6 (yes 6) times the 
height of the existing building. Two times the existing height is already exceeding the zoning 
and will be out of proportion to the neighborhood. There was a reason for a zoning restriction 
for this parcel of land. Planners knew that a huge building would be bad for everyone 
concerned except a developer. There is a law in place to prevent this. It is the same law that 
prevents building heights in the Seaport, Beacon Hill, South End, etc, (Just because the 
Federal Government wants a height restriction in the Seaport as well, does make a law any 
stronger, law is law.) I shouldn’t have to be writing this letter, as there a LAW preventing this. 
That was the point of the LAW. You are asking existing residents, to allow an office tower in 
the middle of what is now, a mostly residential area, where we will have to endure 3 years of 
endless destructions/construction, traffic, noise and large quantities of pollution. And what do 
we get in return? A huge WALL, that removes our sunlight, any visible skies from our units and 
reduces our property values, all while giving all the benefits to this corporation. As a resident 
for 15 years in the Leather District, I am (and from the recent planning meetings, so are most 
of my neighbors), thoroughly opposed any exemption to the zoning law as it is now stated for 
this parcel. Sincerely, Paul A. Gagnon 108 Lincoln St #4a Boston

7/22/2019 Idan Berkovich Oppose This development will eliminate the only parking option in the neighborhood, that is already 
overcrowded. It will lower property value, add thousands of pedestrians to the neighborhood, 
and will significantly increase the need for heightened security.

7/21/2019 James Scanlon Support I fully support this development. The garage is falling apart and a new building is needed there 
to maintain the neighborhood. There are plenty of other parking options so it won’t affect that. 
Fully support as an owner of a unit in the leather district!!!

7/20/2019 HONG PAN Oppose This proposed project will definitely have a hugely negative impact on the real estate 
properties in the Leather District, with many detrimental factors ranging from aesthetic ones to 
shadow effects over the older generations of buildings.
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7/11/2019 Jade Wong Oppose My family has been coming to Hei La Moon for years, celebrating weddings there, holding 
post-funeral meals, etc. -- it is the heart of Chinatown, and provides an important community 
space. It's also one of the biggest cultural and business centers in the area, drawing both 
tourists and locals. This gentrification would kill one of the best parts of Boston; it's a terrible 
decision from both a cultural and a business standpoint.

7/11/2019 Ian Kowalok Oppose Very against this project. Please do not displace important cultural establishments. Lots of 
valuable business already in the area that bring in lots of tourists and other revenue.

7/11/2019 Susan Wong Oppose Strongly opposed. Hei LA moon represents Chinese culture in boston. It brings solidarity, 
memories and community solidarity to chinatown. Furthermore an office bldg would create 
traffic in the area and de-chinese the shrinking chinatown. I am deeply opposed.

6/27/2019 Clifford Gluck Urology and 
Sexual 
Wellness

Oppose This project violates the height restrictions placed along the Greenway, and in no way should 
be given a variance. The design of the building stands in stark contrast to the historic nature of 
the Leather District architecture, much like the current City Hall violated the harmony of the 
West End. The plan speaks of “linkage” but instead creates a wall between neighborhoods. 
The suggestion that this is a “mixed use” building is absurd. Out of 630,000 sq ft, 4,000 sq ft 
are dedicated to retail, a ratio of 0.63%! Currently there are vibrant restaurants and a grocery 
store available to the neighborhood. Most of the frontage on Beach Street would be taken up 
by a garage entrance, making the walk along Beach St much less inviting to pedestrian traffic. 
The traffic and trip calculations would exponentially increase the pollution and congestion in 
the neighborhood. Having attended the meeting last night, the fourth in the proposal series, 
there has been an alarming arrogance and lack of responsiveness from the Oxford and the 
Gensler representatives. The neighborhood has been very clear about our concerns; the 
concerns were not only ignored, but the video “tours” and still mockups of the building all 
neglected to show its scale or any honest representation of how it will feel in the space. Even 
the picture on the BPDA website is a skewed view down Lincoln Street from the Surface 
Road, misrepresenting the scale of the building. I oppose this project in its current form, and 
sincerely hope that we, the voters and the taxpayers will be heard.

6/27/2019 Birgit Wurster Oppose Having attended the community meeting last night, I am writing again to express my strong 
opposition to this project. Not only is it inappropriate for the site and the neighborhood, the 
process so far seems to have completely disregarded valid comments and concerns 
expressed by the community from the very beginning. I've lived in the Leather District for 20 
years. This is my home, where I live and work, and the unique community where I hope to stay 
and raise my young son. We walk to work through Chinatown and play on the Greenway plaza 
at the Chinatown Gate. We meet friends for dim sum at Hei La Moon and buy vegetables at 
the C Mart. With a background in architecture and planning, I understand that cities grow and 
change, but we need development that responds to the actual physical and social conditions 
of the site. We need more attention paid to the environmental conditions such as light, wind, 
and air quality that would be forever changed by the massing of this building and the safety 
and community concerns potentially created by its Monday-Friday commercial-only use.
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6/27/2019 Karen Tokos Leather District 
Resident

Oppose Mark McGowan's April 5 letter of intent to redevelop this property states the following, "We 
anticipate that the Project will obtain necessary zoning relief from the Zoning Board of 
Appeals. We will continue to coordinate community outreach with your staff and the Mayor's 
Office." On what basis does Mr. McGowan anticipate such relief? I have attended two of the 
four public meetings concerning this project. The property owner and his associates politely 
tolerate the public outrage at the assault of this development upon Boston Leather District and 
Boston Chinatown residents. The property owner and his associates attempt to dazzle us with 
bells and whistles as if we may be distracted from the fact that this building will bring 4,000 
commuters into our neighborhood. The property owner and his business associates seem to 
believe that if their renderings never show the full height of the office tower, we will be unable 
to imagine the 320-ft behemoth that they propose to erect in place of the sky over our homes. 
Who in the Boston Planning and Development Agency (or is it the Mayor's office) has given 
Mr. McGowan reason to anticipate that zoning relief will be granted for this project? The 
rendering which did affect me was a view from the inside of one of the upper floors over the 
Historic Buildings of the Leather District and the Greenway. How nice for the suburban 
commuters to enjoy this vantage point while I contend with more vehicle congestion, more 
pedestrian congestion, no more sunlight, and an extension of a wind tunnel from Summer 
Street to Kneeland Street. This project is a test for the BPDA and Mayor Walsh. Your loyalties 
will be revealed as this proposal continues through the approval process. Are you beholden to 
corporate dollars? Are you beholden to suburban commuters? Or are you beholden to the 
residents of the City of Boston? I understand that the parcel of land where the garage currently 
stands is underutilized. However, the manner in which the parcel is developed should reflect 
the needs of the adjacent communities: the Leather District and Chinatown. I, a 19-year 
resident of the Leather District and a Boston Public Schools parent, demand that the BPDA 
hold the property owner accountable to serve me, my family, and my neighbors. If this 
developer cannot satisfy us, then the property is his to sell to another developer who can.

6/26/2019 Birgit Wurster Oppose I have lived in the Leather District for 20 years and plan to stay for many more. I was drawn to 
and remain in the neighborhood for it's unique architecture and for the scale of the 
neighborhood. An architect by training, I have been thrilled to see the development of the 
Greenway and adjacent properties that have been the result of careful and well-considered 
planning studies and a thoughtful approach to downtown development. The extreme 
difference in current height restriction and the proposed height of 125 Lincoln as currently 
proposed is baffling to me and, I can only deduce, driven by money. It would forever change 
the character of the neighborhood and it's connections through scale, views, and urban fabric 
to Chinatown. The Leather District is a unique and historic neighborhood and, though the 
existing garage is not an historic structure, the impact of a tower design at the site that 
disregards the context would forever have a negative impact on both the physical and larger 
community aspects of the neighborhood.

6/26/2019 Birgit Wurster Oppose I have lived in the Leather District for 20 years and plan to stay for many more. I was drawn to 
and remain in the neighborhood for it's unique architecture and for the scale of the 
neighborhood. An architect by training, I have been thrilled to see the development of the 
Greenway and adjacent properties that have been the result of careful and well-considered 
planning studies and a thoughtful approach to downtown development. The extreme 
difference in current height restriction and the proposed height of 125 Lincoln as currently 
proposed is baffling to me and, I can only deduce, driven by money. It would forever change 
the character of the neighborhood and it's connections through scale, views, and urban fabric 
to Chinatown. The Leather District is a unique and historic neighborhood and, though the 
existing garage is not an historic structure, the impact of a tower design at the site that 
disregards the context would forever have a negative impact on both the physical and larger 
community aspects of the neighborhood.
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6/26/2019 Maureen Quinn-Dupont Oppose I strongly oppose this project. The building is too tall for the neighborhood and it is going to 
create shadows, add to the wind tunnel and act as a barrier between the Leather District and 
Chinatown. The neighborhood cannot handle 4000+ people coming down East and Tufts 
street from South Station. The number of Lyft and Uber cars that will be added because of this 
project will make the traffic unbearable as they often create traffic issues. We will lose the C 
Mart and the Hei La Moon restaurant which are important to the community. The fact that this 
is an office building will create a dead zone at night and on weekends and probably be a 
magnet for vagrants. It would help if this building was also residential and included some low 
income housing for people in the area. We already have a problem with litter and with the 
added foot traffic that is only going to get worse. A building should be developed that respects 
the neighborhood. Sincerely, Maureen Quinn-Dupont

6/26/2019 David Dupont Oppose I strongly oppose this project. The proposed building is too tall for the neighborhood. It will 
create shadows and add to the existing wind tunnel. It would help if this building was also 
residential and included some low income housing for people in the area. The number of Lyft 
and Uber cars that will be added because of this project will make the traffic more of a mess. 
There is already a litter problem, adding all these people walking through the area will only 
make it worse. The building looks like it will divide the Leather District and Chinatown not unite 
them. The C Mart and the Hei La Moon restaurant which are very important to the area will be 
gone. The neighborhood can not handle so many people walking down East and Tufts street 
from South Station. A building should be developed that enlivens and respects the 
neighborhood. Sincerely, David Dupont

6/25/2019 Christian Flynn Leather District 
Resident

Oppose As a property owner, taxpayer, and resident of the Leather District, I would like to formally 
voice my opposition to Oxford Properties' proposed project. I will let others speak to the legal 
issues of zoning, and just state simply that this project is out of scale with the surrounding 
brick buildings, and its exclusive use as corporate space is not fitting with the idea of "mixed-
use" that characterizes the Leather District neighborhood. My biggest concern is that this 
corporate high-rise extends the footprint of the Financial District into the Leather District, and 
effectively walls off the neighborhood from Chinatown with which it is linked. It would also 
plunge the southwest end of the Rose Kennedy Greenway into darkness during much of the 
day. At recent meetings with the Leather District Neighborhood Association, Oxford Properties 
slyly presented their mammoth building as a great public benefit to the neighborhood, with talk 
about "winter gardens" and "publicly-accessible private space." What they are really try to sell 
the neighborhood is a corporate lobby that will not benefit anyone in the neighborhood who 
works a 9-5 job elsewhere in the City, as I do. When I return home from work on a weeknight 
at 7 or 8pm, or walk down Lincoln Street on a Sunday at noon, I currently see active and 
vibrant commercial spaces at 125 Lincoln Street that draw the Chinese community and others 
into our neighborhood, adding to a feeling of vitality and safety, something that will certainly be 
lost if this project is built as proposed. I'm old enough to remember what Downtown felt like in 
the 70s and 80s, when the streets were deserted after hours and there were no supermarkets 
or life on the weekends, and I think that this project is a step backwards to that era in terms of 
city planning and vision, not a step forward.

6/24/2019 Andrew Kowalski Oppose The proposed height for this building grossly exceeds the zoning for the property. Allowing a 
building of this size would have dramatic negatives effects on the surrounding community. 
Despite what the developers may claim, the height and density of the the proposed plans are 
not necessary for a profitable model. Regardless, it is not our communities responsibility to 
provide relief on the height restrictions to satisfy the financial objectives of the developer. I 
firmly oppose the proposed plan.
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6/24/2019 Caroline Lamanna Support Thank you, Oxford. I appreciate a developer who sees potential improvement for this 
neighborhood. The people who oppose this don't want to be inconvenienced by construction. 
Shadows? Please. Visit Post Office Square. It's lovely. Too bad for you if your view is blocked. 
Move. The current structure is an eyesore and only adds to what has become a druggie, 
vagrant infested area. I welcome a building that respects the people who pay a lot of money to 
live here ex: One Financial. Let the Financial District take over. The businesses here are 
sketchy and only bring in more trash. Evict. Upward and onward!

6/18/2019 jacqueline church Jacqueline 
Church Culinary 
Consulting

Oppose Re: the proposal by Oxford Properties at 125 Lincoln St. One overarching concern is the 
process and whether we can be assured of transparency moving forward. The Developers 
have attended several meetings to “hear the neighborhood’s concerns” but have proceeded to 
utterly ignore the nearly universal rejection of a development of this massive scale. They seem 
to think that they are guaranteed to get the zoning variances they seek. Is this, in fact, a done 
deal?? Boston has long had a history and national reputation of being one of the least 
transparent cities in terms of political operations. Back room deals have served only those 
involved and have continued to rob citizens of full participation in governance. I believe we can 
- and should -do better. I believe this proposal and how it is handled represents a significant 
opportunity to show Boston that we are working toward more transparent and inclusive 
governance. I would like to hear from BPDA exactly what the steps of this process will be and 
how the citizens of these affected neighborhoods will be notified of, included in this process. 
For example, is this comment form translated into Chinese? How will you include the 
Chinatown neighborhood’s concerns? It’s insufficient to offer translation AT the meeting if 
Chinese residents did not know OF the meeting or have a chance to submit comments 
because all prior notices are IN ENGLISH ONLY. Now, aside from process, here are my 
material concerns: 1) This proposal and the developers have ignored the neighborhood’s 
universal opposition to the mass and scale of this proposal. The proposed tower would benefit 
ONLY the developers, and throw Chinatown into shadow most of the day, as well as blocking 
sky/sun for the Leather District. 2) The proposal directly contravenes the current zoning for 
that exact parcel. This parcel is zoned for 80’ and 6 floors. Despite the neighborhood stating 
that we want nothing higher than 100’ they came back with a plan of nearly 400’ – TWICE. 3) 
The Greenway District Planning Study contemplated the impact of development on this 
precise parcel and concluded no development of this scale should be allowed. The study 
included several consultants, seven public meetings and two years of work. continued
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The conclusions were that any development on this parcel should be in alignment with the 
existing Leather District heights (100’ max). 4) When the elevated highway was taken down, 
this neighborhood endured years of construction with the promise of Greenspace and 
connected neighborhoods. This building as proposed would do just what that elevated 
highway did: cut us off from the city, cut Chinatown off from us; and take us backwards. 5) 
Traffic congestion on Lincoln since 93 was moved to empty right onto this street is horrendous 
and dangerous. The city sometimes forgets we are now a residential neighborhood, not empty 
lofts. Young families take their lives into their hands crossing this street. Adding MORE traffic 
for the 4-6K anticipated commuters this proposed tower includes would be a significant 
detriment to this neighborhood and indeed, to commuters who currently have to battle the 
existing congestion. 6) The proposed commercial-only development is not what this 
neighborhood needs. As you well know, this parcel, this neighborhood is zoned for mixed-use. 
We are not anti-development or against progress, we want sane and rational development in 
keeping with the existing zoning and Greenway plans. 7) Mixed use is what this neighborhood 
needs. Already, we deal with constant smash and grab car vandalism. Businesses that close 
at 5 or 6 (as the contemplated retail ground floor in this plan) would attract more shooting 
galleries, more vandalism, more homeless sleeping there. The Oxford group has already 
shown they are lousy landlords and care little about the impact on our city, our neighborhood 
from their lax management. When we regularly see needles, when a homeless woman gives 
birth next to a dumpster, and Oxford does nothing to add lighting or patrols, we can see plainly 
how lightly they take their responsibility as landlords. 8) The proposed tower throws years of 
planning out the window. It discounts completely the value articulated by years of planning, 
ignoring the value of connected neighborhoods, brought together over shared green space. 9) 
This proposal ignores the very real, urgent need for affordable housing in Boston. A modest 
building in keeping with existing zoning, with some affordable and some market-rate units and 
activated ground floor is the only tenable solution. 10) The developers’ bad faith is evidenced 
by their abysmal job as current landlords and their attempted obfuscation of facts in their 
choice of images to share. As well, they ignore or fail to acknowledge the opposition of the 
neighborhood. I would like to submit three renderings to support my comments. To whom may 
I submit them? Jacqueline Church Jacqueline Church Culinary Consulting Boston Chinatown 
Tours 116 Lincoln St., #4C Boston, MA 02111

6/14/2019 Alexander Lewis Oppose As a resident, I wholeheartedly oppose this project and the reasons continue to grow. First off 
the project ignores height restrictions already in place for the area. Our community would 
essentially lose a massive amount of natural lighting and be cast in a shadow. Next, the 
project would be overtaking a landmark in one of Boston Chinatown’s best restaurants, Hei La 
Moon. It provides the best dim sum in the city by far. Another point is that the residents have 
nearly universally opposed this project yet, the news media acts as if the project has already 
been given the green light, I can only assume that Oxford has a strong PR team as well as 
lobbyists to keep our politicians quiet about it. I have sent several letters to our city councilman 
and mayor to virtually no response, which is telling as both offices have responded to other 
issues immediately. If the scope of the project would change to meet regulations, then myself 
and many others would likely support the project, but as it stands, our concerns seem to be 
ignored...



125 Lincoln Street Public Comments 2019-08-07.xlsx

27

6/14/2019 Michael Redbord Oppose I've lived in the leather district for 8 years. I purchased a home there 3 years ago, on Lincoln 
Street. I plan on leaving if this project goes through, and taking my family's tax dollars and 
votes with me outside of Suffolk county, to somewhere where planning processes are 
respected. If this project goes through, it represents a critical violation of convenant between 
the city and its residents. Here's why I see it this way: When the greenway was built, residents 
of the city supported it. Why? The social contract us residents made, and the carrot we waited 
for with the Greenway project, was for not only an improved downtown green space, but for a 
planning process that we could rely on into the future. After the greenway construction was 
completed, we were assured through studies, meetings, and speeches that we'd live in an 
improved space: not just for green space, but for predictability and steadiness of progress. 
With that, the 125 Lincoln site was called out specifically. I specifically purchased an 
apartment across the street from it based on the assurances of that guidance, which limits the 
heights of that plot. Now, I am at risk of being made a fool of through back-room dealings and 
an outrageous, flagrant disregard for prior guarantee. It's a massive violation of resident trust 
to build such a structure here. At its core, my opposition is it's not just that I lose a view fine. 
That's fine. It's that, if this project goes through, behind that loss of personal material nicety is 
a capitulation of governance to the fast-changing winds of private interests. It's simply 
untenable to live in a city where you cannot rely on the word of your government. If this goes 
through, it will be seen by the residents of downtown Boston as a shameful reneging of prioir 
commitment by the city planning. We don't be that kind of city. We can do better. Regards, 
Mike

6/14/2019 Sandra Ginnis Support This new building on Lincoln Street will replace an eyesore, in my opinion. It will attract more 
life to the neighborhood and help to revitalize a space that is occupied by an unattractive, out-
of-date building. The building is not out of scale with others that are a block or two away.

6/14/2019 Steven Kowalski Oppose I support development of the site, However I absolutely oppose the proposed height of 340+ 
feet. Oxford Properties purchased the property knowing full well the zoning restrictions on the 
site below: Future additions or redevelopment of this site will be limited to 100’ by the high 
potential for shadows cast on the park. Development here should align with the 80’/100’ 
heights of the existing Leather District fabric and should reinforce the existing character and 
scale of the neighborhood. Oxford is trying to circumvent the zoning laws in the neighborhood 
for the benefit of themselves NOT the neighborhood at large. Zoning laws should be enforced 
and not manipulated by developers with deep pockets. As a resident in the Leather District 
and a member of the Leather District Neighborhood Association, I attended all (3) meetings 
we had with Oxford to share our overwhelming disapproval of the height. They have done 
nothing to address our concerns. I'm hopeful BPDA will enforce the law and send Oxford back 
to the drawing board.

6/14/2019 Christi Fried Chickadee 
Realty, LLC

Oppose I oppose the over-sized project that violates the zoning code (Article 44), urban planning with 
respect to the Leather District and the BPDA's own Greenway Planning Study for this site. All 
of them say 80' by right and 100' maximum while the Oxford plan is for 370'. This will bathe the 
Greenway Park in shadow in the early part of the day and the Leather District in shadow the 
later part of the day. I understand the need for compromise and would be willing to support a 
lower height of 218'. This takes the following into consideration: * surrounding variances from 
the zoning code: * Kneeland/Utica hotel to be built: 218' * Two Financial: 205' * Oxford 
profitability * diminished shadows on the Greenway and Leather District neighborhood

6/14/2019 Howard Hoffman Oppose This building should be mixed use with residential or a hotel so that it generates activity 24 
hours. The last thing the leather district needs is another dark building at night. There is 
already too much crime in the neighborhood.
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6/14/2019 John Winkler Support This is downtown Boston, if a building like this is not built here where do we expect it to go? I 
do support development at this site, and the neighborhood just approved a tower on kneeland 
which exceed the zoning heights. I would like to see a mixed use development with 
office/residential/and commercial space to increase the foot traffic across all times of the day. 
A large office structure will only add people during the workday which is not idea for the area; 
similar to the seaport we should be adding residents, restaurants, stores, and office space to 
make the most use of the space. Hopefully this will set a good example of building uses for the 
parcials on Kneeland along with the proposed tower above South Station.

6/14/2019 Steven Chittenden Oppose I strongly oppose the approval of this development. Oxford plans to build a 370’ office tower 
when they knew full well when they purchased this property that the height limit is 100’. They 
slant their proposal to be in the benefit of the Leather District and Chinatown neighborhoods 
when only they benefit. This massive tower would further enclose the Leather District, 
preventing needed sunlight and air to the legacy brick and mortar buildings here that need sun 
and air to stay dry. It obviously would be most devastating to the residents and my neighbors 
at that end of Lincoln Street who would face a giant office tower from the only widows they 
have. BPDA must enforce the height restrictions at this site or our neighborhoods will be 
changed permanently for the worse. I do believe the current structure is an eyesore and would 
support improvement at this site, but not this. Not ever.

6/14/2019 Marguerite Guglielmo Oppose I oppose this project for the following reasons: - Damage to the neighborhood, in particular the 
Asian community: Hei La Moon is an institution in China town and has been for decades. It 
brings valuable foot traffic to the neighborhood, which discourages loitering, especially during 
nights and weekends. Forcing Hei La Moon and C-Mart to close and find new locations (if 
there are any available) would damage China Town and the Leather District. - Lack of foot 
traffic on Lincoln street on nights and weekends: Having an office lobby "open to the public" is 
a fallacy. Take a walk around the Financial District on the weekends - all of their office lobbies 
are dark and locked. We already have a serious problem with petty crime, drugs, and loitering, 
so by leaving an *entire block* dark and unattended on nights and weekends will provide more 
safe havens for people to engage in illegal activity. Not to mention that China Town is a 
popular tourist attraction, and deteriorating safety of the neighborhood could drive out tourist 
traffic and adversely affect small businesses. - Use of building: I think more of us would be 
open to the tower if it provided housing, which would bring more people and have a positive 
impact on the very real housing crisis in Boston. That would also solve the problem of a dark 
and empty lobby on weekends, since the lobby would be open to residents 24/7. - Building 
Height: Oxford was aware of the zoning law below when they purchased the site, and they are 
blatantly using their money to manipulate the law to their benefit and their benefit alone. It 
would be one thing if they exceeded the 100' limit by only 20-30', but 340'+ goes far beyond 
that. For your reference, here is the zoning law I mentioned: "Future additions or 
redevelopment of this site will be limited to 100’ by the high potential for shadows cast on the 
park. Development here should align with the 80’/100’ heights of the existing Leather District 
fabric and should reinforce the existing character and scale of the neighborhood." To 
conclude, I would welcome development of the site if the following conditions were met: - The 
tower height is within 100' and they plan to have mixed retail on the ground floor instead of an 
oversized empty lobby - OR they put in housing instead of an office space Thank you very 
much for your consideration.
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6/14/2019 Wendi Boyden Oppose I have owned my home in the LD for 13 years now and this project doesn’t do much for the 
residents of this community - first and foremost the height of the building would shadow the 
entire neighborhood and effectively border it off from the rest of the city. Second, having this 
be primarily office space without commercial space that would increase foot traffic (I.e. a 
restaurant, NOT a club, repeat, NOT a club) in our neighborhood after 5pm to discourage 
homeless, drug dealers and other unsavory characters from settling in an area they think won’t 
be patrolled by police because there aren’t any pedestrians. I urge you to work with the LDNA 
to come up with a solution that is beneficial to both the residents and Oxford.



Downtown Boston
Business Improvement District
Corporation

Michael Sinatra August 2, 2019
Project Manager
Boston Planning & Development Agency
One City Hall Square, Room 809
Boston, MA 02201

RE: Oxford Properties’ 125 Lincoln Street Development Proposal

Dear Mr. Sinatra:

On behalf of the Downtown Boston Business Improvement District (DBBID), I am writing
regarding Oxford Properties, as they continue the development-review process with their 125
Lincoln Street proposal.

Oxford Properties has been a vital member of the Downtown Boston BID since it acquired 125
Summer Street in fall 2014. Oxford’s Executive Vice President for the Boston market, Chad
Remis, was elected to the Board of the Downtown Boston BID in fall 2015. Since then, he has
played a significant role as one of our Directors, most notably heading up our Economic Vitality
Committee.

Straddling the intersection of several Downtown neighbors, bordering the Greenway, and
close to multiple transit hubs, 125 Summer Street anchors one of the BID area’s most crucial
gateways. Taking advantage of its superb location, Oxford Properties has dramatically
transformed the property. In 2016, it invested $10 million in a major lobby renovation and
plaza makeover. It has revitalized that section of Summer Street with popular new retail tenants--
particularly an always-bustling Tatte Bakery that fronts on the plaza. And, working in close
collaboration with the BID and other members of the community--including residents and non
profit organizations--it has activated the plaza with a variety of seasonal events, from Baggo
leagues to a pop-up wine bar.

In closing, Oxford Properties is thoughtful and collaborative and fully understands the needs of
an urban environment. Given the positive personal experience I’ve had with the company, I
believe Chad and his team will bring the same level of commitment and care in developing 125
Lincoln Street as they have demonstrated with 125 Summer Street over the past half-decade.

The Downtown Boston BID is a private not-for-profit corporation that provides supplemental
services in Downtown Boston. Designed to benefit property owners, businesses, visitors,
students, and residents, it is committed to achieving downtown’s full potential as a premier
economic center and vibrant mixed-use neighborhood.

S cerely,

President & CEO
Downtown Boston BID

101 Arch Street, Suite 160 Boston MA 02110 617-482-2139 in1o@bostonbid.org www.downtownboston.org



















































































































































 
 華人前進會 
 Chinese Progressive Association 
 28 Ash Street, Boston, MA 02111 
 Tel. (617) 357-4499  Fax (617) 357-9611  www.cpaboston.org   

 
 

  
for justice, democracy and equality 

July 30, 2019 
 
Michael Sinatra 
Boston Planning & Development Agency (BPDA) 
One City Hall Square 
Boston, MA 02201 
 
RE: 125 Lincoln Street Project 
 
Dear Mr. Sinatra, 
 

I am writing on behalf of the Chinese Progressive Association (CPA) in response to the 
Oxford Properties Group (“Oxford Properties”) proposal to build the equivalent of a 34-story 
office building at 125 Lincoln Street. CPA is opposed to the 125 Lincoln Street Project 
(“Project”), as currently proposed, because it will harm Chinatown’s residents and workers. The 
scale and vision of the Project is disproportionate to the suggested benefits for the community. 
At the very least, Oxford Properties should reduce the Project’s scale, guarantee current 
businesses will have the space and option to remain at the site, address the concerns of abutters, 
and dedicate employment benefits to the community. In proposing a project at such a massive 
scale, Oxford Properties should also engage community organizations, residents, workers, and 
other community stakeholders to assess the neighborhood’s needs, including affordable housing, 
in considering the impact any proposal would have on our community. 
 

CPA is a grassroots community organization that works for full equality and 
empowerment of the Chinese community in the Greater Boston area and beyond. We seek to 
improve the living and working conditions of Chinese Americans and to involve ordinary 
community members in making decisions that affect our lives. CPA was founded in 1977 out of 
a series of community organizing campaigns around issues such as Chinese parents’ input into 
the Boston school desegregation process and organizing for community control over land 
development in Chinatown. Our membership is made up predominantly of Chinese immigrants 
and the Chinese-speaking; most are workers in low wage industries, working families, or low-
income elderly.  

 
Since our founding, we have launched programs such as the Chinatown Stabilization 

Campaign, Workers Center, and the Chinese Youth Initiative to engage the residents and allies of 
Chinatown, Chinese workers, and youth. We also provide a wide range of direct services, such as 
housing and immigration services. CPA now has a membership of over 1000 members, many of 
whom are Chinatown residents, and we serve about 3000 people every year. 

 
A major focus of CPA’s work is to preserve Boston Chinatown as a residential, working 

class neighborhood and the social, cultural, political, and economic center of the broader Chinese 
community of New England. As part of CPA’s Chinatown Stabilization Campaign, we helped 



28 Ash Street, Boston, MA 02111 
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bring citywide attention to the “affordability gap” in affordable housing and retarget the 
Inclusionary Zoning program to serve Boston residents.  We worked with tenants in ten 
Chinatown developments, totaling 700 units, to help them stay in their homes and improve their 
quality of life. We have also helped to establish Chinatown’s first resident association, which 
went on to win city government recognition as an advisory “neighborhood council” and 
increased affordable housing concessions through high-profile organizing campaigns. 

 
In response to gentrification and eviction, CPA has successfully campaigned for short-

term rental regulation in the City of Boston, alleviating the impact of short-term rentals on the 
existing communities in Chinatown and other Boston neighborhoods, and preventing evictions of 
more residents from their homes and transformations of their homes into short-term rental units. 
CPA has also been advocating for the preservation of Chinatown’s historical row houses from 
investment developers, to ensure that Chinatown continues to be a neighborhood for working 
class, low-income, immigrant Chinese families. 
 
Our Concerns – Ignoring Community Needs, Displacing Key Businesses, and Public Health 
Risks from Massive Scale 
 

Over the past two decades, Chinatown has faced rapid gentrification, resulting in a dearth 
of buildings suitable to community needs. Intense real estate development has not helped the 
availability of affordable housing for the lowest-income residents in Massachusetts. A recent 
report from the Federal Reserve Bank of Boston has found that for every 100 extremely low-
income households, the number of affordable and available units has decreased from 50.2 units 
in 2011 to 48.6 units in 2016.1 Based on a report from CPA and MIT’s Displacement Research 
Action Network, 80% of Chinatown residents reported housing insecurity due to skyrocketing 
rent, speculative and ongoing real estate transactions, lack of adequate protections for tenants, 
and a serious lack of affordable housing. Forty percent of surveyed households had no formal 
lease while almost sixty percent of those evicted were served only a verbal notice.2 Luxury 
housing is slowly encroaching upon long-time affordable housing for new immigrants offered by 
Chinatown’s row houses.3 Luxury high rises are taking over parts of the immigrant-heavy 
neighborhood where our members have long lived.4 Yet, in 2009, Asian Chinatown residents had 
a median household income of $13,000, less than 20% of Boston’s Area Median Income5. The 
BPDA indicates that only approximately 30% of housing in Chinatown is affordable to low-
income households (30% AMI or below), showing how the housing crisis is especially dire in 

                                                 
1 Nicholas Chiumenti, The Growing Shortage of Affordable Housing for the Extremely Low Income in Massachusetts (2019), 
available at https://www.bostonfed.org/publications/new-england-public-policy-center-policy-report/2019/growing-shortage-
affordable-housing-extremely-low-income-massachusetts.aspx.  
2 Boston Real Estate Times, “Boston’s Chinatown: 80 Percent Chinatown Residents Report Housing Insecurity” (Mar.9 2019), 
https://bostonrealestatetimes.com/bostons-chinatown-80-percent-of-chinatown-residents-report-housing-insecurity/. 
3 Milton J. Valencia, “Residents, advocates, work to save Chinatown row houses”, Boston Globe (Apr.30, 2019), 
https://www.bostonglobe.com/metro/2019/04/30/residents-advocates-work-save-chinatown-row-
houses/cbAFoMh4nfb2KpTW550lJJ/story.html; see also “Boston officials: Preserving Chinatown Row Houses ‘Complicated’”, 
Boston Herald (Apr.30, 2019), https://www.bostonherald.com/2019/04/30/boston-officials-preserving-chinatown-row-houses-
complicated/. 
4 Maria Sacchetti, “Chinatown, immigrant heaven, fights for its future”, Boston Globe (Mar.31, 2015), 
https://www.bostonglobe.com/metro/2015/03/31/chinatown-fights-for-its-life/hp6QBxj2nYeWgsoVeizshP/story.html.  
5 Asian American Legal Defense and Education Fund, Chinatown Then and Now: Gentrification in Boston, New York and 
Philadelphia (2013), available at https://www.aaldef.org/uploads/pdf/Chinatown%20Then%20and%20Now%20AALDEF.pdf. 

https://www.bostonfed.org/publications/new-england-public-policy-center-policy-report/2019/growing-shortage-affordable-housing-extremely-low-income-massachusetts.aspx
https://www.bostonfed.org/publications/new-england-public-policy-center-policy-report/2019/growing-shortage-affordable-housing-extremely-low-income-massachusetts.aspx
https://bostonrealestatetimes.com/bostons-chinatown-80-percent-of-chinatown-residents-report-housing-insecurity/
https://www.bostonglobe.com/metro/2019/04/30/residents-advocates-work-save-chinatown-row-houses/cbAFoMh4nfb2KpTW550lJJ/story.html
https://www.bostonglobe.com/metro/2019/04/30/residents-advocates-work-save-chinatown-row-houses/cbAFoMh4nfb2KpTW550lJJ/story.html
https://www.bostonherald.com/2019/04/30/boston-officials-preserving-chinatown-row-houses-complicated/
https://www.bostonherald.com/2019/04/30/boston-officials-preserving-chinatown-row-houses-complicated/
https://www.bostonglobe.com/metro/2015/03/31/chinatown-fights-for-its-life/hp6QBxj2nYeWgsoVeizshP/story.html
https://www.aaldef.org/uploads/pdf/Chinatown%20Then%20and%20Now%20AALDEF.pdf
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Chinatown. Given this deep socioeconomic need and in the face of an affordable housing crisis 
in Boston and particularly in Chinatown, any new development in Chinatown that does not 
actively prioritize Chinatown’s working-class residents adds to the risk that Chinatown’s lower-
income community will be forced out.  
   

The Project also threatens important local businesses. Currently, 125 Lincoln houses C-
Mart Chinese Supermarket. According to the BPDA Research Division, Chinatown has 
disproportionately fewer grocery stores than other Boston neighborhoods6. Losing C-Mart would 
take away one of the few ways Chinatown residents can access healthy, affordable and culturally 
familiar groceries essential to their health and daily life. Hei La Moon restaurant is another key 
cultural site as the large banquet hall serves as not just a staple in Chinatown’s food scene, but 
also a community gathering space as its large space allows it to host countless events from 
community banquets to weddings. Displacing Hei La Moon to a smaller space would endanger 
its ability to host such events. Both these businesses also serve a diverse clientele and play a 
unique role in bringing residents of Chinatown and the Leather District together. Eliminating 
these businesses would disrupt the connectivity of our two neighborhoods. Lastly, both C-Mart 
and Hei La Moon are important employers for Chinatown residents and many immigrant, 
working-class people in the surrounding area. Forcing out these businesses would remove 
essential jobs that employ limited English speakers. 
 

The Project’s massive scale is also a public health risk and hurts the quality of 
surrounding green and open space. Because Chinatown has historically suffered environmental 
injustices, any proposal for development should carefully consider the potential environmental 
impact. The Project’s PNF states that the current proposal for the site would generate over 2000 
more car trips on an average weekday (p 4-13). The PNF’s air quality evaluation also found that 
the Project would cause a small increase in CO concentrations (p 5-17). A 2019 report by the 
Union of Concerned Scientists found that Boston’s Chinatown has the worst air pollution from 
transportation-related emissions in the entire state, noting that particulate matter (PM2.5) of sizes 
including CO’s size are well known to lead to negative health outcomes7. The PNF’s shadow 
study (Figure 5.2) also shows almost half of the adjacent Greenway covered in new shadow by 
the Project building. Solar glare (PNF p 5-8) and daylight obstruction (PNF Table 5-3) are 
expected to worsen. Chinatown already faces a high risk of traffic and pedestrian accidents. The 
Project’s anticipated impact would exacerbate the danger. Moreover, Mary Soo Hoo Park, the 
Greenway, and Chinatown Gate are some of the only green and open spaces in the entire 
neighborhood. They are key spaces where residents constantly gather, where the community 
hosts festivals, and where Chinatown connects with the Leather District and welcomes the rest of 
the city. Adding pollution, imposing shadows, traffic, solar glare, and daylight obstruction to 
these central spaces would seriously damage some of the only spaces Chinatown has. 
 
 
 

                                                 
6 Boston Redevelopment Authority/Research Division, “Grocery Stores in Boston” (September 2014) available at 
http://www.bostonplans.org/getattachment/bbe06972-5b3e-4072-a30f-94db36138f33 
7 Union of Concerned Scientists, Inequitable Exposure to Air Pollution from Vehicles in the Northeast and Mid-Atlantic (2019), 
available at https://www.ucsusa.org/clean-vehicles/electric-vehicles/northeast-air-quality-equity. 

http://www.bostonplans.org/getattachment/bbe06972-5b3e-4072-a30f-94db36138f33
https://www.ucsusa.org/clean-vehicles/electric-vehicles/northeast-air-quality-equity
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Proposed Solutions – Community Benefits First, Keep Current Businesses, Reduce Project 
Scale, and Commit to Community Employment Benefits 
 

Building community trust for this Project would require prioritizing community benefits 
so they are provided first. Too often, developers from outside of the community come to our 
neighborhoods promising great advantages and then we are left with yet another high-rise 
building that further erodes the community’s historical and working-class character. Further, for 
a project this size, the benefits suggested by Oxford Properties are minimal. Additional 
consideration of appropriate benefits for the community requires more engagement with 
stakeholders to understand the community’s needs.  

 
At the outset of the proposal, we raise these initial suggestions to provide better 

understanding of the community’s long-standing needs and concerns in relation to the Project.  
 
First, building affordable housing units at 79 Essex, especially those that are deeply 

affordable (30% AMI and lower), would help address the massive need for homes for working 
class families. Boston consistently appears on surveys as the second most expensive city for 
renters in Massachusetts.8 Given the neighborhood’s location, Chinatown residents experience 
extreme displacement pressure. Additionally, allowing for retail space at 79 Essex may be a good 
way to temporarily relocate C-Mart and Hei La Moon during construction of 125 Lincoln and 
add space for future community businesses.  
 

Second, giving C-Mart and Hei La Moon the space and option to return to 125 Lincoln 
after construction is also a necessary step for community buy-in. As discussed above, both 
businesses are important features in the daily life of residents, and relocation would not be an 
adequate solution for Hei La Moon. Even if these two specific businesses do not wish to move 
back in to 125 Lincoln, the community has voiced the need to have an affordable, Chinese 
grocery store and a large banquet hall restaurant, so preserving the square footage and rent 
pricing for ground floor community businesses is critical.  
 

Third, reducing the scale of the Project to match the surrounding buildings is also 
necessary. Studies from the PNF seem to suggest that a smaller building would lead to less 
shadow, daylight obstruction, and possibly solar glare, and reducing the number of commuters 
going to the building would also decrease traffic and pollution.  

 
Fourth, we support the installation of a bronze statue celebrating Chinese immigrant 

workers by artist Wen-ti Tsen on the Beach Street side of the project across from Chinatown 
Gate. Tsen has proposed four such statues to memorialize the importance of Chinese immigrant 
labor at points throughout the neighborhood. Placing the proposed Restaurant Worker statue 
could be a good fit, especially if Hei La Moon remains at the site, also serving to bridge the 
Chinatown and Leather District neighborhoods. Such a monument would not only celebrate the 
contributions of Chinese immigrant workers in this community, but also the significance of 
Chinatown as an anchor community for immigrant workers throughout history. 

                                                 
8 Eileen Woods, “A Running List of the Most Affordable and Most Expensive Cities for Renters in Eastern Mass.”, The Boston 
Globe, July 9, 2019, available at http://realestate.boston.com/renting/2019/07/09/running-list-most-affordable-expensive-
cities-rent/.  

http://realestate.boston.com/renting/2019/07/09/running-list-most-affordable-expensive-cities-rent/
http://realestate.boston.com/renting/2019/07/09/running-list-most-affordable-expensive-cities-rent/
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Lastly, Oxford should use the added jobs from the Project to provide some employment 

benefits to the community. We appreciate that Oxford has promised housing and job training 
linkage fees. Still, there remains ambiguity as to whom the added jobs from the Project will 
benefit. We suggest that Oxford commit to using added construction jobs and job training 
linkage to hire and help community members, as well as allocate some office space to house 
nonprofits and other community organizations. It is also important that the construction and 
permanent jobs at this location meet the highest job standards to ensure a family sustaining wage, 
good benefits and a career for community members.  

 
We encourage Oxford Properties to continue engaging the community throughout all 

aspects of this proposal and development. By taking the steps we have outlined, the Project can 
be more than just an outside venture and truly integrate with the community it is built in. 
 
Sincerely, 
 

 
Karen Chen 
Executive Director 
 
Cc:  Edward Flynn, District 2 Boston City Councilor 
 Annisa Essaibi-George, Boston City Councilor At-Large 

Michael Flaherty, Boston City Councilor At-Large 
Althea Garrison, Boston City Councilor At-Large 
Michelle Wu, Boston City Councilor At-Large 
Sheila Dillon, Chief of Housing and Director of Neighborhood Development 
Brian Golden, Director of Boston Planning and Development Agency 
Joseph Boncore, 1st Suffolk and Middlesex Massachusetts State Senator 
Aaron Michlewitz, 3rd Suffolk Massachusetts State Representative 

  
 



Roger L. Berman 

c/o The Berman Company 

186 South Street, Suite 200 

Boston, MA 02111 

 

21 June 2019 

Mr. Michael A. Sinatra    Michael.A.Sinatra@Boston.gov 

Boston Planning & development Agency 

Boston City Hall 

Boston, MA 02201 

Re: 125 Lincoln Street Proposal 

Dear Mr. Sinatra: 

I am a commercial and residential property owner in The Leather District.  At age 69, I have been in this 

neighborhood my entire life, first in the Leather industry’s latter days and now as a real estate owner. 

Over decades, I have advocated for this neighborhood.  In 1974, I was part of a group of owners and 

renters who petitioned to make residential use “as of right” in under-utilized, commercial buildings. 

In subsequent years, I engaged in “IPOD” (“Interim Planning Overlay District”) planning which culminated 

in geographically defining the Leather District (Centerlines of the Surface Artery, Kneeland St., Atlantic 

Ave. and Essex St.), and, unless otherwise supported by the neighborhood, limited the height of new 

construction (up to 100’ plus 20’ +/- for rooftop additions) and an FAR of 8. 

I participated in the City’s charette of South Bay, the parcels south of Kneeland Street.   I participated in 

“Big Dig” design negotiations, supported Chinatown advocacy for additional housing and municipal 

services, and have been a member of the Leather District Neighborhood Association, since its inception.  

The result of these efforts, and those of countless other Leather District neighbors, commercial and 

residential renters and owners, has resulted today in a vibrant, 24/7, mixed-use neighborhood.  Although 

small, this neighborhood is well loved. 

The Leather District, and our Chinatown neighbors, have been well served by Mayor Walsh’s sustained 

enforcement of established zoning principles.  On countless issues, big and small, our collective voices 

have been listened to and respected over the last five years.  

Today, I am writing to express our neighborhoods near unanimous concern and deep opposition to the 125 

Lincoln Street project proposed to be built in this unique, specifically defined, mixed-use Leather District.  

The 125 Lincoln Street lot is a mere 27,958 square feet.  Rather than adhere to the Leather District’s 

allowed FAR of 8, Oxford Properties seeks to construct a structure at 22.5 FAR!   



I believe consensus exists that the replacement of the site’s current structure.  Despite three public 

sessions, all generally reasonable in tone, Oxford did not hear not one word of support for this proposal. 

However, Oxford felt emboldened to straight-faced, submit an “ask” of 330 feet (!), 24 stories (!!) and 

625,000 square feet (!!!).   

One of the cornerstones of Mayor Walsh’s tenure has been his ceaseless advocacy for additional housing, 

of all kinds, in all areas of Boston.  The new 125 Lincoln Street would include no residential space.  None.  

The keys to the Leather District’s success over 40+ years, has been its central location, human scale, 

superior access to transit and highways and becoming a true residential/commercial, mixed-use district.   

Oxford Properties’ proposal of solely office uses flies in the face of every City study of this District 

emphasizing the need to continue to nurture mixed uses.   

The one residential component of Oxford’s proposal, which I do support, relates to creating additional, 

affordable housing, albeit to do so entirely neighboring Chinatown.         

Located between the South Station Transportation Center and the Surface Artery, home to the 

Greenway’s hyper-actively used Chinatown Park, this is not a suitable location for an out-sized, generic 

office building, better suited for the Financial District or the Seaport.   

This neighborhood consists of mainly of, 6 – 8 story, varied height, masonry buildings.  The Albany 

Building, located directly across Beach Street from this site, is a historically designated, fully restored 

structure.  This building will dwarf that, 5-story structure. 

Today, the Leather District consists of about 40% +/- residential uses, including families with children.   

Leather District Commercial spaces house and incubate many professional and high-tech firms, and 

shared-work environments.  The walking environment is currently being enhanced by Mayor’s Beach 

Street Revitalization, a re-build of streets and sidewalks between Atlantic Avenue and the Surface Artery.  

If approved, this structure would be entirely out of character with the form, massing and mixed uses of 

the existing neighborhood.  The proposed plan would negatively affect the positive work, living and 

pedestrian aspects of the existing neighborhood.   

Despite claiming to have “listened” to renters and owners, residential and commercial alike, Oxford has 

presented a proposal entirely contrary to almost every comment presented in three public forums. 

For these reasons, I vehemently oppose this proposal and strongly urge the proponent “try again”.  This 

proposal should be withdrawn.  Oxford should demonstrate its stated interest in enhancing this desirable 

neighborhood’s strengths a live/work urban oasis.  Oxford is capable of something so much more 

appropriate for this site, and the Mayor’s vision of an evolving, residential-friendly Boton. 

Sincerely, 

 

Roger L. Berman 

 



6/18/2019 City of Boston Mail - 125 Lincoln Notification Form

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0?ik=0cbdb5b592&view=pt&search=all&permmsgid=msg-f%3A1636628244956471732&simpl=msg-f%3A16366282449… 1/2

Michael Sinatra <michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov>

125 Lincoln Notification Form 

Christopher Betke Mon, Jun 17, 2019 at 6:25 PM
To: Michael Sinatra <michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov>
Cc: kathryn friedman , Brad Blake , Suzanne Lee

Dear Mike: 

 

I am writing to object to the use of what I believe is an inaccurate rendering on the cover of the 125 Lincoln
Street Project Notification Form.  Simply put, there is virtually no legitimate perspective that would result in
those buildings looking that close in size.  That is so because I believe Lincoln Plaza (building on the left) is
about 90’ tall and the Oxford Proposal is 340’ tall.  Our team looked at it and created what we believe is a
much more accurate image. 

 

Of course, all of this begs the question: what project has to skew perspectives in order to present itself? 

Answer: A project that does not fit into the context of the neighborhood. 

 

 

  ß much closer to reality

  Oxford rendering

 

 

 

CHRISTOPHER G. BETKE
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Main Office

175 Federal Street  |  Boston, MA 02110

    

 

  

Confidential Transmission

The information contained in this electronic mail is intended for the named recipients only.  It may contain privileged and confidential
material.  Any other distribution, copying or disclosure is strictly prohibited.  If you have received this transmission in error, please
notify us immediately by telephone and delete the original transmission without making a copy.
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Michael Sinatra <michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov>

125 Lincoln Street Public Meeting Flyer 

Christopher Betke Tue, Jun 11, 2019 at 5:42 PM
To: Michael Sinatra <michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov>

Dear Mike: 

 

On behalf of the Leather District Neighborhood Association, we request a longer comment period.  It is insufficient time
between a meeting on June 26 and July 8 for comment particularly with the intervening 4th of July holiday.   Please
advise. 

 

Best, Chris Betke, Chair, LDNA

 

CHRISTOPHER G. BETKE

COUGHLIN◦BETKE LLP
Massachusetts | Connecticut | New Hampshire | Rhode Island
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July 9th, 2019 
Michael Sinatra, Project Manager 
Boston Planning & Development Agency 
One City Hall Square 
Boston, MA 02201-1007 
 
Subject: 125 Lincoln Street Project Notification Form (PNF) Comments 
 
Dear Mr. Sinatra: 
 
Thank you for the opportunity to comment on the 125 Lincoln Street 
Project Notification Form (PNF) located in the Leather District. The 
Boston Groundwater Trust was established by the Boston City Council 
to monitor groundwater levels in sections of Boston where the integrity 
of building foundations is threatened by low groundwater levels and to 
make recommendations for solving the problem. Therefore, my 
comments are limited to groundwater related issues. 
 
The project is located in the Groundwater Conservation Overlay 
District (GCOD) established under Article 32 of the Zoning Code. As 
stated in the document and confirmed at the scoping session, the 
project will be designed and constructed to comply with the 
requirements of Article 32.  
 
Compliance with the GCOD requires both the installation of a 
recharge system and a demonstration that the project cannot cause a 
reduction in groundwater levels on site or on adjoining lots.  
 
The PNF states that the proposed foundation system will likely consist 
of either a concrete mat foundation bearing on natural marine deposits 
or on load bearing elements which are installed within slurry-filled 
trenches. Figure 2.4 in the document depicts 5 levels of below grade 
parking, terminating 52’ below the existing ground surface. The 
document also states performance criteria will be established for 
maintenance of groundwater levels during construction in the vicinity 
of the Project.  
 



 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Monitoring of groundwater levels is to be conducted on a weekly 
basis, commencing one month prior to construction, continuing 
throughout all below grade activities, and concluding one month post 
all below grade activities. The data will be furnished to the Trust and 
the Authority on a weekly basis.  
 
The contractor will be required to implement necessary steps during 
the work to not lower groundwater levels outside the limits of the Site. 
In the event that groundwater levels drop below the observed pre-
construction baseline levels during construction, provisions must be in 
place to halt construction and dewatering until the cause is found and 
remedied.  
 
If feasible, one groundwater monitoring well may be installed in the 
sidewalk and in the public right of way to document existing 
groundwater levels. The new well will be installed in accordance with 
City and Trust standards for permanent groundwater monitoring wells.  
 
Prior to the issuance of a building permit, the Proponent will provide 
the BPDA and the Boston Groundwater Trust a letter stamped by a 
professional engineer registered in Massachusetts that details how the 
Project will meet the GCOD requirement for no reduction in 
groundwater levels on Site or on adjoining lots. 
 
I look forward to continuing to work with the proponent and the 
Agency to assure that this project can have only positive impacts on 
area groundwater levels. 

 
 
Very truly yours, 

 
Christian Simonelli 
Executive Director 

 
CC: Kathleen Pederson, BPDA 
Maura Zlody, EEO
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Michael Sinatra <michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov>

125 Lincoln Street Comment

Daniel Lu Tue, Jul 30, 2019 at 10:43 AM
To: michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov

Dear Mr. Sinatra,

Hi, my name is Daniel Lu and I am writing to you on behalf of Chinatown resident Bing Xiang Ma to help him submit his
comments on the 125 Lincoln Street Project. I've submitted his translated comments through the online portal. Attached is
a pdf of the original letter in Chinese. Below is the information and text I submitted through the online portal. 

Thank you and let me know if you need anything else!

Best,

Daniel

Name: Bing Xiang (first) Ma (last)
Address: 21 Edinboro St, Apartment 2D, Boston, MA 02111
Organization: Chinatown resident
Phone:  (resident speaks Cantonese）

Comments: To protect Chinatown & Leather District’s history and culture, I oppose the Project. Chinatown has more than
100 years of history. Chinatown’s buildings and row houses represent that long history and rich culture. Working-class
families have lived here for many years. We want to protect this home. When tourists visit Chinatown, they can
understand the history and culture of our working-class families from the buildings they see. I hope the city government
can protect our Chinatown community. Right now 125 Lincoln Street has many traffic problems. The development would
add even more traffic. The tall shadow would also hurt the Chinatown Gate park. We hope we can save Chinatown’s
working-class culture and history to pass down to future generations. Chinatown needs to preserve low-income,
affordable housing and keep an affordable cost of living, so I oppose the 125 Lincoln Street Project.

BingXiang-Ma-125-Lincoln-comments-scan.pdf
145K
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Michael Sinatra <michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov>

125 Lincoln Street Public Meeting Flyer 

Brad Blake Tue, Jun 11, 2019 at 6:32 PM
To: Kathryn Friedman 
Cc: Michael Sinatra <michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov>, Christopher Betke 

Thank you Kathryn. Michael, I echo Kathryn's sentiments here. I was just about to email you about this public notice. Is it
standard practice for these to be so one-sided? This makes it sound like a dream come true for the neighborhoods and
mentions nothing about it being so outside of zoning or guidelines. It feels like a product of the Oxford PR machine,
strikes me as very misleading, and doesn't at all read as an unbiased public notice that should come from city entity
providing some of the key facts on both the potential upside and challenges/downside. It should at the very least include
how much the proposal is outside of the current law and guidelines for the parcel. I think we may need to make our own
version to post alongside or in lieu of this that's more factually balanced. 
 
[Quoted text hidden]



8/5/2019 City of Boston Mail - 125 Lincoln Street Tower Project – Oxford Properties

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0?ik=0cbdb5b592&view=pt&search=all&permmsgid=msg-f%3A1640492192852034030&simpl=msg-f%3A16404921928… 1/1

Michael Sinatra <michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov>

125 Lincoln Street Tower Project – Oxford Properties

Lindsey B Tue, Jul 30, 2019 at 10:00 AM
To: Michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov
Cc: mayor@boston.gov, Michelle.Wu@boston.gov, bpdacomments@gmail.com, ed.flynn@boston.gov

Hi all,

I'm writing to comment on the 125 Lincoln project submission by Oxford properties, to say I'm strongly opposed.  They've
been deceptive in their pitch of the project to the neighborhood, and the plan is completely at odds with what I would want
to see from new development.  The plan is not in keeping with the style of the historic neighborhood, would cut us off from
the greenway and chinatown, and being just office space it would make our neighborhood less welcoming and less
attractive for businesses that would be open in the evenings, which we really need.

This plan would be awful for the neighborhood, and I'm adamantly opposed to removing the height restriction.

Thank you
Lindsey Bleimes
111 Beach St Unit 4C
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Michael Sinatra <michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov>

125 Lincoln Street Tower - Oxford Properties 

Jo Blum Tue, Jun 18, 2019 at 4:04 PM
To: Michael Sinatra <michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov>
Cc: mayor@boston.gov, ed.flynn@boston.gov, Michelle.Wu@boston.gov, Danchen Xu <danchen.xu@boston.gov>,

 18 June 2019

To:  Michael Sinatra, Project Manager

From:  Joanne Blum

 RE: 125 Lincoln St. Tower Proposal – Oxford Properties

I am writing to express my grave concerns about Oxford Properties proposal to build a 24-story office building in the
middle of the Leather District.  I am a twenty year resident of the Leather District.  I lived through the last years of the Big
Dig construction and numerous construction disruptions on Kneeland, Lincoln and Beach Streets.  The neighborhood has
emerged as a vibrant urban mixed use neighborhood with stores, restaurants that has benefited from abutting the
Greenway that is one of the most positive results of the Big Dig.

Despite numerous meetings with the Leather District, Oxford Properties has disregarded all the suggestions and
concerns raised by the people who would be directly impacted by their proposal.  At the community meeting on June 5,
Oxford made the exact same proposal it had in the past with no modifications. In a show of amazing arrogance, they
displayed renderings of their 24-story proposed building shown totally out of proportion to the 9 – 12 story buildings in the
Leather District by making it falsely look like their building was just a few stories higher than the buildings around it.

Below I have listed some my concerns of how this enormous and out of proportion building would significantly change the
character of the neighborhood. 

·       The parcel on Lincoln Street where Oxford is proposing a 370-foot building is currently zoned for 100 feet.   There
have been several extensive planning studies  including the Greenway Planning Study that have studied this particular
parcel.  These studies support the current zoning height as consistent with the parcel bordering on the Greenway and the
height of the buildings in the Leather District and in Chinatown.  A building four times as high as any around it will dwarf
all the current buildings.

·       Oxford’s structure essentially builds a wall between the Leather District and the Gateway to our Chinatown
neighbors.  It walls off easy access to the only playground for Leather District children on the Greenway at the Chinatown
Gate.  Further, since Oxford is proposing that its garage entrance will be in Beach Street, it will create an unsafe walkway
to the playground and that section of the Greenway. 

·       The Leather District is zoned as mixed use neighborhood.  Oxford’s building is solely office space.  Oxford has
said that they expect around 4,000 tenants coming into their office building everyday.  The ramifications of 4,000 people in
our small neighborhood are staggering.  There will be additional traffic congestion on the already clogged Kneeland,
Lincoln and Beach Streets.  Office tenants per se are not really part of the neighborhood.  They do not contribute to its
vibrancy in the evening or on weekends.  They come in for the day to work and then return to their own communities in
the evening.

·       A 24-story building will create additional wind tunnels to the ones that already exist at the end of Lincoln Street
where it meets Surface Ave.  The wind tunnels would extend almost the entire length of Lincoln Street.

·    The proposed structure will cast huge shadows not only on the Leather District but also on the Greenway.  That is one
of the reasons that the lots adjacent to the Greenway were zoned for 100 feet.  The Big Dig came at enormous cost but in
the end, we have a city treasure that should be protected and not allowed to be ruined by developers seeking to turn a
profit at the expense of Boston’s neighborhoods.

·      The Leather District is conscious of bordering on Chinatown and has sought to build stronger ties between the two
communities.   We have worked together on numerous projects over the years including preserving Reggie Wong Park,
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increasing affordable housing and creating more open spaces.  This proposal by Oxford Properties would effectively build
a wall between the two communities and is an affront to the efforts of the two neighborhoods to work together.

I ask that you seriously consider the impact that Oxford Prosperities proposal will have on the livability of our community
and reject their ill-conceived design for this property.

Sincerely yours,

Joanne S. Blum

210 Lincoln St. #603; Boston, MA 0211
 
 
 
Jo Blum 

 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 

Oxford - 125 Lincoln .docx 
117K

https://www.google.com/maps/search/210+Lincoln+St.+%23603;+Boston,+MA?entry=gmail&source=g
https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0?ui=2&ik=0cbdb5b592&view=att&th=16b6c3101edcd87d&attid=0.1.1&disp=attd&safe=1&zw


8/5/2019 City of Boston Mail - Fwd: 125 Lincoln Street Tower Project – Oxford Properties

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0?ik=0cbdb5b592&view=pt&search=all&permmsgid=msg-f%3A1640516115062886703&simpl=msg-f%3A16405161150… 1/2

Michael Sinatra <michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov>

Fwd: 125 Lincoln Street Tower Project – Oxford Properties 

Linda Bosse Tue, Jul 30, 2019 at 4:21 PM
To: Michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov
Cc: mayor@boston.gov, ed.flynn@boston.gov, Michelle.Wu@boston.gov,

Dear Mr. Sinatra:

 

I am writing to object to the proposed tower project at 125 Lincoln Street in the Leather District of downtown
Boston.  

This proposal would have a very significant adverse impact on the neighborhood and the Greenway.   My
husband and I have lived in the Leather District since 1987.   We have lived and raised our son here during
the Big Dig and through all the development in the decades since then.  We understand that this
neighborhood is a mix of commercial and residential uses, and recognize that new development is
inevitable – and can be a benefit to the City and the Leather District.

 

However, the proposed "super tower" project at 125 Lincoln Street would be a detriment in significant ways. 
The proposal for a building height of 370’ is more than four times the as-of-right height limit of 80’, and
almost four times the maximum allowed height of 100’ under the zoning code.  Those limits are important.  
By so grossly exceeding the height limits, this project would cast significant shadows over the Greenway
Park – a new public amenity that adds significantly to the quality of our neighborhood, and is enjoyed by
both fellow Bostonians and visitors to the City – and over our homes in the Leather District.   It would also
greatly increase traffic and parking congestion in the surrounding area. 

 

It is extremely important that the City preserve and protect significant public amenities like the Greenway
Park, and ensure that they are not enshrouded by shadows from new development.  Similarly, the City
needs to protect the character of its distinctive neighborhoods.  While the Leather District has
accommodated new development, this proposal is vastly out of scale.

 

In addition, if this project is allowed, it will also increase the pressure for more and more “super towers” in
the Leather District and Chinatown, since teams proposing other developments could argue that their super
tower would be consistent in height and massing with this one. 

 

I respectfully request that you deny the request for zoning relief requested for this project.

Sincerely,

Linda Bosse

102 South Street

Boston, MA 02111

cc: Mayor Martin Walsh - mayor@boston.gov

https://www.google.com/maps/search/125+Lincoln+Street?entry=gmail&source=g
https://www.google.com/maps/search/125+Lincoln+Street?entry=gmail&source=g
https://www.google.com/maps/search/102+South+Street+%0D%0A+Boston,+MA+02111?entry=gmail&source=g
https://www.google.com/maps/search/102+South+Street+%0D%0A+Boston,+MA+02111?entry=gmail&source=g
mailto:mayor@boston.gov
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City Councilor Ed Flynn - ed.flynn@boston.gov

City Councilor Michelle Wu - Michelle.Wu@boston.gov
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波士頓華埠居民會
BOSTON CHINATOWN RESIDENT ASSOCIATION

90 Tyler St, Suite 3, Boston, MA 02111
Email: Chinatownresidents@gmail.com

Website: http://www.chinatownresident.org

_______________________________________________________

Honorable Martin J. Walsh
Councilor Ed Flynn
Councilor Michael Flaherty
Councilor Althea Garrison
Councilor Michelle Wu
Chief of Housing and Director of Neighborhood Development Sheila Dillon
Director of Boston Planning and Development Agency Brian Golden
1st Suffolk and Middlesex Massachusetts State Senator Joseph Boncore
3rd Suffolk Massachusetts State Representative Aaron Michelwitz

The Boston Chinatown Resident Association is hereby expressing its concern regarding the 
project proposed for 125 Lincoln Street. A project of this magnitude is not in fitting with the 
neighborhood’s needs, will have a deleterious impact in Chinatown’s cultural support mechanism, will 
impact the residents of the Leather District, and goes against the wishes of its people who are Boston 
residents as well as voters. Housing is one of the biggest needs in the area to be impacted by 125 
Lincoln. Chinatown has seen an influx of luxury housing units in recent years. These housing units are 
not units that can accommodate residents on Boston’s lengthy affordable housing waiting list. These 
luxury units are also not units aimed at working middle-class residents. Rather than building an office 
building, we urge the development team, and our elected leaders to look at building housing on this 
site. 125 Lincoln will further erode the Chinatown neighborhood as it will be removing at least 4 
Chinese businesses from the area. These businesses stand to lose greater than 140 jobs. Workers of 
these, soon to be shuttered, businesses will certainly find great difficulty in attaining employment 
elsewhere. A lower income resident of Chinatown typically lives paycheck to paycheck, and is situated 
below the poverty line. A one week gap in pay can have a long lasting impact on their health, 
livelihood, and on the stability of their families. A project of this magnitude will have a negative impact
on traffic, which is already congested. It is not uncommon now to see emergency vehicles stuck in 
traffic on roads surrounding the proposed project site. This project will potentially keep ambulances 
from reaching nearby Tufts Medical Center during emergencies. During community meetings the 125 
Lincoln Street project presenters claimed that the City wants this project. Several meeting attendees 
rejected this statement as the area residents are the city. As of now, the residents don’t want this project,
and the Boston Chinatown Resident Association also stands in opposition. 

Chu Huang Hin Sang Yu Michael Wong

Co-Chair Co-Chair Co-Chair

90 Tyler St #3, Boston, MA 02111 ChinatownResidents@gmail.com

mailto:Chinatownresidents@gmail.com
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bostonpreservation.org

                                                                                              July 23, 2019

Michael Sinatra 
Boston Planning and Development Agency 
One City Hall Square 
Boston, MA 02201 
Re: 125 Lincoln Street

Dear Mr. Sinatra,

The Boston Preservation Alliance is Boston’s primary, non-profit advocacy 
organization that protects and promotes the use of historic buildings and 
landscapes in all of the city’s neighborhoods. With 40 Organizational Members, 
125 Corporate Members, and a reach of 35,000 friends and supporters we 
represent a diverse constituency advocating for the thoughtful evolution of the 
city and celebration of its unique character. We appreciate the opportunity to 
offer comments on projects that impact the historic character of the city.

The Alliance has had the opportunity to meet with the proponent and to hear 
from members of the community regarding 125 Lincoln Street. We are not 
opposed to the redevelopment of the site, including the demolition of the 
existing garage for a new building with reasonable height. However we do 
feel it is important that the new design be in better dialog with the adjacent 
historic Leather District. The proposed design feels alien to the scale and 
character of its context. The differentiation between the base and the tower 
should be more pronounced, perhaps with a clear setback above the fifth floor, 
a stronger cornice line, and a change in materials and/or color. Such changes 
might also help to break down the overwhelming mass of the building. The 
balcony cutouts fail to provide significant relief from what would be the tallest 
building in this area and are not in keeping with the character of the district. 

In order to more fully understand the relationship of the new design and 
the existing architecture in the neighborhood, we request additional views 
from the public realm throughout the Leather District as well as from 
Chinatown. It is unfortunate that two local Chinese businesses will be 
displaced by this development, further shrinking the cultural footprint of 
the Chinese community in this area. We strongly urge the proponent to 
accommodate these businesses on site or within their holdings nearby. 
Development continues to threaten Chinese heritage and sense of place 
here and it is untenable that these thriving, local businesses might be lost.

We look forward to reviewing design modifications and additional viewsheds of 
project. 

Sincerely,

Greg Galer 
Executive Director 

CC: 
Mark McGowen, Oxford Properties 
Christopher Betke, Leather District Neighborhood Association 
Karen Chen, Chinese Progressive Association 









 

Boston Transportation Department 

Comments for 125 Lincoln St Project Proposal 

 

 

The Transportation & Infrastructure Planning Department of the Boston Planning and 
Development Agency (BPDA) and the Boston Transportation Department (BTD) have jointly 
reviewed the Lincoln 125 project proposal. BTD supports the comments prepared by BPDA and 
would like to reinforce or add the following comments: 
 
Transportation 

● Motor Vehicle Parking: 

○ We are concerned over the number of motor vehicle parking provided. The city’s 

district-based parking ratios indicate 250 as the maximum number of spaces for 
a non-residential project of this square footage. This project is in one of the most 
transit-rich locations of the entire city. It is roughly a five-minute walk from both 
South Station—with service from the Red Line, Silver Line, eight MBTA 
Commuter Rail Lines, Amtrak, and regional bus service—and Chinatown Station 
with Orange Line service. Additionally, there is a bus stop with service from 
seven regional express MBTA bus lines immediately adjacent to the 
development on Lincoln St as well as two local bus lines (7 & 11) with stops a 
short walk from the development. Given this excellent transit proximity, we 
strongly encourage the Proponent to lower the parking provision below the 
maximum this maximum of 250. 

● Motor Vehicle Access:  

○ We are not in favor of the current motor vehicle entrance off of Beach St and 
would prefer motor vehicle access via Lincoln/Tufts St. Beach street is a vital 
pedestrian connection between South Station and Chinatown and maintaining a 
continual sidewalk and a continually active façade on Beach should be priority. 

● Transit Analysis and Mitigation: 

○ The share of transit trips during the AM/PM peak hours estimated for this project 
seems low at just under 20% (844 of 4256) of total daily transit trips (see Table 4-
13). It seems unreasonable that 80% of transit trips should take place outside of 
the peak hours, particularly given that the majority of the square footage of the 
project is dedicated to office use. Because of the improbably low estimate of 
peak-hour travel, we feel confident that the impact on transit would be greater 
than your calculations indicate. 

○ In mitigation, please provide a design and funding for the implementation of an 
AM/PM peak period bus/bike only lane on Lincoln St from Kneeland St to Essex 
St. 

● Bicycle Parking 

○ As noted by the BPDA, the current provision of off-street bicycle parking (100 
spaces) is too low for a project of this size. Per the City of Boston’s Off-Street 
Bicycle Parking Guidelines (0.3 spaces/1000 sq ft), this project should include a 
minimum of 188 secure bicycle parking spaces. 



 

○ As noted by the BPDA, the City’s bicycle parking guidelines also require a 

shower/changing facility for the first 40,000 sf plus any additional 80,000 sf. As a 
result, the Proponent should provide 8 shower/changing facilities. 

● Bluebikes 

○ We are pleased that the proponent will provide funding for the installation of a 
new on-site Bluebikes station. Please ensure that its location is considered as 
the design moves forward. 

● Transportation Demand Management: 
○ Echoing BPDA’s comments, please maintain or expand Zipcar on-site and 

provide a real-time transit information display in the lobby. 
● Analysis: 

○ As requested by BPDA: 
■ Please add Atlantic Avenue/Essex Street and Atlantic Avenue/East Street 

to the study area. 
■ Please perform a safety analysis of study area intersections, as well as 

the intersection of Atlantic Avenue and Essex Street, using City of Boston 
Vision Zero crash data from January 1, 2015, to the most recently 
available date. Several study area intersections have poor safety records, 
especially for people walking and biking, who are the most vulnerable 
roadway users. 

■ Please provide a motor vehicle speed study of Lincoln Street from 
Kneeland to Surface Road/Essex Street. Speeding is a noted concern 
along Lincoln Street, especially outside of the morning peak period when 
volumes are lower. Pedestrian volumes are significant already, and all 
new transit trips ultimately become pedestrian trips at the project site. 
Given the proximity to commuter rail, pedestrian platooning is likely to 
bring waves of pedestrians to and by the project site. 
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Michael Sinatra <michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov>

125 Lincoln Street Tower Project – Oxford Properties 

Carolyn Cain Mon, Jun 17, 2019 at 9:03 PM
To: Michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov
Cc: 

Dear Mr. Sinatra,
 
As a homeowner and resident of the Leather District, I am voicing my opposition to the 125 Lincoln Street Tower Project
as it is currently proposed. While a new building at that site will be a welcome addition, the proposed height of 370 ft is
well above the zoning limitations for our neighborhood. The owners were well aware of the height restrictions when they
purchased the property so they must have calculated that it would be financially rewarding to build a structure that
conformed to code. The limitation of 100 ft is designed to allow for new buildings that integrate with the neighborhood and
protect the Leather District and the Rose Kennedy Greenway from shadow and wind. Additionally, the project should add
to the community (mixed use) and not simply be built for financial gain for the owners. 
 
The Leather District is the Gateway to Boston and the threshold of the Rose Kennedy Greenway and this site has the
opportunity to add value to the city, the communities (Chinatown and Leather District), and the Greenway for those who
live here, work here and visit. In fact, earlier this very afternoon, I was able to direct a couple visiting from Scotland, to the
Chinatown Park that they’d identified as a site to visit. It would certainly be a shame for that park to be in shadow much of
the day from an oversized building!
 
Thanks for your attention to this project,
 
Carolyn Cain, Jonathan Kannair, Carson Kannair
 
717 Atlantic Ave, 6B
Boston, MA

https://www.google.com/maps/search/125+Lincoln+Street?entry=gmail&source=g
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Michael Sinatra <michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov>

125 Lincoln St. Tower Project – Oxford Properties

Tony Cavallerano Tue, Jul 30, 2019 at 9:12 AM
To: michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov
Cc: mayor@boston.gov, ed.flynn@boston.gov, Michelle.Wu@boston.gov, Danchen Xu <danchen.xu@boston.gov>,

I am writing to express my serious concerns about the proposed construction of a 350ft+ structure proposed
by Oxford Properties at the space currently occupied by a parking garage at 125 Lincoln Street. I have lived
in the Leather District for 20 years and during that time, I have witnessed a positive transformation of the
neighborhood, thanks to the effort of many concerned neighbors. 

I join my neighbors in opposition to such a proposal by Oxford properties for the following reasons:

1. In addition to the physical and infrastructure improvements, our neighborhood has worked diligently
to build bridges with adjacent neighborhoods, especially our neighbors in Chinatown. This proposed
building, much like the Mass Pike extension of 50 years ago, will wall off Chinatown once again. 

2. The Leather District is zoned as mixed use neighborhood, and the residential component has grown
significantly in the last 20 years.  Oxford’s building is solely office space, with an anticipated
occupancy of around 4,000 tenants. , most of whom will vacate the neighborhood at 5:00, and thus
will not contribute to the vibrancy of the neighborhood. 

3.  this outsized building project violates the zoning code (Article 44), urban planning with respect to the
Leather District and the BPDA’s own Greenway Planning Study for this site all of which say 80’
by right and 100’ maximum.  The Oxford plan is for 350’+ and  building this size will create
additional wind tunnels as well as cast large shadows, both on the Greenway and the Leather
District.

4. There will be additional traffic congestion on the nearly impossible-to-navigate Kneeland, Lincoln and
Beach Street intersections. 

We ask that you give serious consideration to the highly negative impact that Oxford Prosperities proposal
will have on the livability of our communities and reject their ill-conceived design for this property.

Sincerely yours,

Tony and Susan Cavallerano

210 Lincoln St. #202; Boston, MA 02111

https://www.google.com/maps/search/125+Lincoln+St?entry=gmail&source=g
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Michael Sinatra <michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov>

125 Lincoln

Christopher Betke Fri, Jul 19, 2019 at 9:31 AM
To: Mark McGowan 
Cc: Ed Flynn <ed.flynn@boston.gov>, "michelle.wu@boston.gov" <michelle.wu@boston.gov>, "mayor@boston.gov"
<mayor@boston.gov>, Michael Sinatra <michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov>

Dear Mark: 

 

            I wanted to follow-up on my comments at the most recent at BPDA.  They also echo comments I
made from our very first meeting.  To date, there has been nothing presented that would make this project
enticing to (a) people who are immediately across the street; or (b) the Leather District as a whole.   The
problem, of course, is that the project is extremely inappropriate in terms of massing/height and its single use
is not consistent with the mixed use the neighborhood.  Admittedly, it is tough to dress that up.  Having said
that, I note an almost deliberate effort to make the project not enticing to the Leather District. 

 

I am very surprised that the project has progressed this far with virtually nothing of import being
proposed for the Leather District.  This project is in the Leather District.  The LD is not of the view that a
glorified lobby is public space that counts as a neighborhood benefit.  We all know that lobbies are public
space anyone.  I can walk into every lobby in the city now.  Therefore, that is not seen itself as any more of a
benefit than what I would have if Oxford simply just built the building.  On the other hand, because it is in
your building, inevitably, Oxford will control the who, what, why, where and when of use of that space. 
That is not public space in any meaningful sense.  In addition, and importantly, once the building is built,
access shrinks.  We all know that from experience with other buildings.   To continue to suggest that as a
“benefit” when we all have called it out again and again and again as nothing we want or have solicited is
indicative of a lack of concern for our viewpoint.    

 

The “additional” green space Oxford speaks of is de minimis and no enticement.  First, it will be an
accoutrement for your building.   Again, without regard for a neighborhood “benefit”, Oxford would likely
want to have some adjoining exterior aspect to the property.  Thus, again, we are only really being offered
what Oxford would ordinarily do anyway.  Second, a good portion of the space is already public space
including some of which has been adopted into the Greenway (through the efforts of the LDNA – not the
owner of 125 Lincoln Street).  As such, Oxford is offering us public space that is already public space.   To
the extent Oxford is proposing an “upgrade”, the upgrade is not of significance.  Put differently, the small
amount of additional green space being proposed is of little/no consequence.  That is not necessarily
Oxford’s fault per se, the space is too limited.  Nevertheless, it is not anything of meaning.

 

When you and I first met, I suggested  that  Oxford’s proposals for LD benefits be “bold, creative and
imaginative.”   I also suggested offering a meaningful, tangible benefit to the numerous people who will be
directly, economically impacted by Oxford’s proposal to violate the zoning laws and all prior design studies.
If the City approves this, it is transferring wealth from the individual taxpayers/residents who live across the
street from that location by decreasing the value of our property to increase the value of Oxford’s property.  
In addition, the City will be taking, without due process, our right to deploy solar power on our roofs which
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is something our building is considering.   To date, there has been nothing of meaning offered to the LD as a
group or to the most impacted property owners that would justify this taking. 

 

Truthfully, it is hard for the Leather District to see what Oxford is proposing as anything other than
ignoring the Leather District’s interests or concerns.   In order to get LD support, Oxford does not need a PR
campaign or a lot of one on one coffee meetings with people in the neighborhood.  Oxford needs better
substantive ideas and plans.  Our neighborhood has already demonstrated that we support good ideas.   To
date, this is not one. 

 

Best, Chris   

 

CHRISTOPHER G. BETKE

COUGHLIN◦BETKE LLP
Massachusetts | Connecticut | New Hampshire | Rhode Island
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Michael Sinatra <michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov>

Public Comment on Oxford Property's Proposal for 125 Lincoln Street

Lawrence A. Chan Sun, Aug 4, 2019 at 4:35 AM
To: michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov

Dear Mr. Sinatra,

Please accept the attached letter/public comment on Oxford Property’s proposal for 125 Lincoln Street, that is
scheduled for review by the Boston Civic Design Commission on August 6, 2019. Because I am currently abroad
through mid-August, I am sending my letter by email only in order to ensure that my letter is included in the
Commission's deliberations before their review of the project. Thank you.

Regards,

Lawrence A. Chan FAIA
Principal
Chan Architecture & Urban Design
116 Lincoln Street #2B
Boston MA 02111 USA
Mail to:

Chan Letter to BPDA re 125 Lincoln St 190803.pdf
4355K

https://www.google.com/maps/search/125+Lincoln+Street?entry=gmail&source=g
https://www.google.com/maps/search/116+Lincoln+Street+%232B+Boston+MA+02111+USA?entry=gmail&source=g
https://www.google.com/maps/search/116+Lincoln+Street+%232B+Boston+MA+02111+USA?entry=gmail&source=g
https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0?ui=2&ik=0cbdb5b592&view=att&th=16c5bc6a44936bf9&attid=0.1&disp=attd&safe=1&zw
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Michael Sinatra <michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov>

125 Lincoln Street _ Project

Christopher Betke Mon, Jul 29, 2019 at 11:21 PM
To: Michael Sinatra <michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov>
Cc: "michelle.wu@boston.gov" <michelle.wu@boston.gov>, Ed Flynn <ed.flynn@boston.gov>, "mayor@boston.gov"
<mayor@boston.gov>

Dear Mr. Sinatra:

 

I write to personally oppose the out of proportion, inappropriate project proposed by Oxford Properties.   I
have lived in the Leather District for close to 20 years.  Currently, I live there with my wife and two
children.  We are a family that eschewed a move to the suburbs because we love our historic, low-rise
neighborhood.  We work hard, pay our taxes, rent office space in Boston, employ people in Boston, give to
our community and try to make our City a better place.  We ask little from the City for ourselves.  We should
not have to come hat in hand to ask the City to enforce its own laws to protect our home from a wealthy
foreign corporation.

 

The Oxford Proposal represents a significant threat to our home and family life in the City.  If the City
approves this completely disproportionate project, it will bathe our home in shadow, create an outrageous
wind-tunnel, increase traffic, wall off our home and our neighborhood from sky and light and cut us off from
existing neighborhoods.  We did not buy a home in the financial district nor did we elect to raise our family
in the financial district.  My decisions on where to buy and where to live were informed by the zoning laws
that should apply to everyone including mega-rich corporations like Oxford.  The City’s process of
permitting wealthy developers to buy their way out of applicable zoning laws is broken and violates
constitutional mandates of equal protection under the law.  If the City believes that 300’+ height is
appropriate in the Leather District, it should pass zoning laws that allow all property owners in the Leather
District to partake in that bonanza, not just rich foreign corporations that can afford the process to spot zone
their location.

 

I incorporate herein by reference the letters sent to you by Roger Berman, Valentine Oldham, Paul Gagnon,
David Seeley, Kathryn Friedman and Ogi Ogas as if they were sent by me.  The building is too big, its office
only use is inappropriate,  it is out of character, it is violates all prior planning, etc. etc. etc.  A zoning
variance is not required by Oxford as its representative stated in a public meeting that the property is
economically viable “as is.”

 

However, I wish to call a few unique issues to your attention.   The City should not approve a project of this
scope and magnitude in such close proximity to residential buildings.  A project of this massive scale – built
to the property line – represents a danger to the integrity of the residential buildings as well as a physical
danger to residents who will be within 50-100 feet of this massive construction project.  We had absolutely
no reason to believe when we purchased our home or when we elected to stay in the City that the City would
ever consider such an over the top project that does not even pay lip service to existing law.   If we had
known, we would have never stayed in Boston.  For the first time ever, we have to consider whether we can
live and raise our family at our home.  The notion that a huge project will be built less than 100 feet from my
children’s room is something that keeps me and wife up at night.  To date, Oxford has not bothered to say or
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propose a single thing to address this concern.  Indeed, the Oxford project is unique in its complete and utter
disregard for any concerns for the Leather District and, in particular, directly abutting residential owners.  I
have been part of many processes like this and I have never seen a circumstance before where a developer
does not try to meaningfully address such concerns.  It makes me wonder whether this process is truly
dynamic or whether there is a pre-ordained outcome.  I sure hope it is the former and not the latter.  

 

Why do families flee to the suburbs?  Because Cities don’t care that they do.  I have worked hard and given
of my time and effort to improve Boston.  Me and my family are part of the solution – not the problem.  We
are not asking for anything other than that the City enforce its law and follow its own planning.  If it does,
this project should not be approved. 

 

Thank you for your consideration. 

 

Sincerely, Chris

 

 

CHRISTOPHER G. BETKE

COUGHLIN◦BETKE LLP
Massachusetts | Connecticut | New Hampshire | Rhode Island
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Michael Sinatra <michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov>

Thank you

Jacqueline Church Wed, Jun 26, 2019 at 10:45 PM
To: Michael Sinatra <Michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov>

I appreciate your responsiveness and helping facilitate the meeting tonight.

I want to share my prepared comments I prepared for tonight.

Hello, My name is Jacqueline Church, I am a resident of the Leather District and business operator in Chinatown. I consider
our two neighborhoods linked through history. I'm proud to be a neighbor, a contributor, and supporter. I had my Chinese
wedding ceremony here at Hei La Moon and I bring Boston Chinatown Tours here to learn about Chinese culture and enjoy
dim sum. Thank you to Hei La Moon for hosting us tonight.

The history the Chinese community in Boston is clear. When it suited, the state took half of the residential property by
eminent domain at the very moment when the residential population doubled in size at the end of the Exclusion Act
era.

The city has overlooked Chinatown historically siting unfavorable businesses here, neglecting the need for affordable
housing and overlooking crime, dilapidated buildings, unsightly empty lots, and absentee landlords.

With regard to the larger neighborhood, including the once off-beat, Bohemian Leather District, the city is slowly coming to
realize we have evolved to include many families, many taxpayers, many voters.

Most of us keenly aware of the history of Boston politics and many of my neighbors have been far more intimately involved
with urban planning around the Big Dig and the development of the Greenway plans than I have. Many of my friends
around Boston roll their eyes and claim the city has not changed since the historic back-room deals and shady business
practices at the expense of citizens. I do not believe this is so. 

I believe we are at an inflection point in this neighborhood. The city has an OPPORTUNITY to demonstrate its
awareness of our existence, its respect for our needs, and its commitment to transparency by working with us for
REASONABLE development that serves this city's residents - not just a handful of wealthy developers. 

REASONABLE development might include some mix of commercial and residential units, some affordable housing for this
neighborhood and some integration with the Chinatown Park/Chin Park and the Rose Kennedy Greenway, so very many
years in the making. 

REASONABLE development would maintain the 100' zoning that is in place for this historic neighborhood.

INSTEAD, What Oxford proposes is a development that ignores the nearly universal objections of the neighborhood. A
proposal which FLIES in the face of all existing goals and plans for development here. Their proposal ignores the even
the fundamental ZONING for this parcel.

Their proposal ADDS ZERO affordable housing much needed in the neighborhood. 
Their proposal does NOT bring vitality to our streets and neighborhood at night. 
Their proposal does not even respect the FUNDAMENTAL reality of the plans that many people contributed years to
making. These plans which dictate REASONABLE use in keeping with the goals stated in many planning meetings
and pronouncements.

In meeting after meeting, they utterly disregarded our objections and often disregarded us even while we addressed them.
This is how they "listen".
Meeting after meeting they claimed be "good landlords" - but the shooting gallery, the birth near the dumpster, the continued
disregard for their neighbors speaks volumes about what sort of landlords they are. 
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Rather than offer a development plan that complies with the neighborhood zoning, offers vibrancy at night, protects the
assets to Chinatown and aligns with all existing plans OXford seems to believe they are ABOVE THE LAW and operate as
if someone has already assured them that they will have carte blanche to develop whatever they want. 

I ask the BPDA to promise transparency. CAN I HAVE THAT AGREEMENT?
I request you to swear to us today that no such deal has already been granted. CAN YOU SWEAR THIS?

I am a huge fan of architecture and am as moved as anyone at the marvels of engineering that literally inspire awe and take
our breath away. The question is NOT whether development is good. The question is not whether a given tower is beautiful. 

The question is this: Will the BPDA hold Oxford to the law and protect the needs and desires of this neighborhood
for REASONABLE development in COMPLIANCE with the LAW?

I urge you to correct the historic wrongs these neighborhoods have suffered by STICKING WITH THE EXISTING
plans for this part of Boston, hold Oxford to the same codes and plans everyone else must also comply with and send
them back to drawing board. Give us a reasonable plan which adds housing, protects Hei La Moon and C mart and
integrates rather than separates our neighborhoods/

I look forward to seeing what the BPDA does to address this proposal.
Best regards,

Jacqueline

- - -

Strategic thinker and storyteller. Skilled builder of profitable rela�onships. Analy�cal problem-solver, consultant, and alliance-creator. 

JacquelineChurch.com



 
Re: the proposal by Oxford Properties at 125 Lincoln St. 
 
One overarching concern is the process and whether we can be assured of transparency 
moving forward. The Developers have attended several meetings to “hear the neighborhood’s 
concerns” but have proceeded to utterly ignore the nearly universal rejection of a development 
of this massive scale. They seem to think that they are guaranteed to get the zoning variances 
they seek. Is this, in fact, a done deal?? 
 
Boston has long had a history and national reputation of being one of the least transparent 
cities in terms of political operations. Back room deals have served only those involved and 
have continued to rob citizens of full participation in governance. I believe we can - and should -
do better. I believe this proposal and how it is handled represents a significant opportunity to 
show Boston that we are working toward more transparent and inclusive governance.  
 
I would like to hear from BPDA exactly what the steps of this process will be and how the 
citizens of these affected neighborhoods will be notified of, included in this process. For 
example, is this comment form translated into Chinese? How will you include the Chinatown 
neighborhood’s concerns? It’s insufficient to offer translation AT the meeting if Chinese 
residents did not know OF the meeting or have a chance to submit comments because all prior 
notices are IN ENGLISH ONLY. 
 
 
Now, aside from process, here are my material concerns: 
 

1) This proposal and the developers have ignored the neighborhood’s universal opposition 
to the mass and scale of this proposal. The proposed tower would benefit ONLY the 
developers, and throw Chinatown into shadow most of the day, as well as blocking 
sky/sun for the Leather District. 

2) The proposal directly contravenes the current zoning for that exact parcel. This parcel is 
zoned for 80’ and 6 floors. Despite the neighborhood stating that we want nothing 
higher than 100’ they came back with a plan of nearly 400’ – TWICE. 

3) The Greenway District Planning Study contemplated the impact of development on this 
precise parcel and concluded no development of this scale should be allowed. The study 
included several consultants, seven public meetings and two years of work. The 
conclusions were that any development on this parcel should be in alignment with the 
existing Leather District heights (100’ max). 

4) When the elevated highway was taken down, this neighborhood endured years of 
construction with the promise of Greenspace and connected neighborhoods. This 
building as proposed would do just what that elevated highway did: cut us off from the 
city, cut Chinatown off from us; and take us backwards. 

5) Traffic congestion on Lincoln since 93 was moved to empty right onto this street is 
horrendous and dangerous. The city sometimes forgets we are now a residential 
neighborhood, not empty lofts. Young families take their lives into their hands crossing 



this street. Adding MORE traffic for the 4-6K anticipated commuters this proposed 
tower includes would be a significant detriment to this neighborhood and indeed, to 
commuters who currently have to battle the existing congestion.  

6) The proposed commercial-only development is not what this neighborhood needs. As 
you well know, this parcel, this neighborhood is zoned for mixed-use.  We are not anti-
development or against progress, we want sane and rational development in keeping 
with the existing zoning and Greenway plans.  

7) Mixed use is what this neighborhood needs. Already, we deal with constant smash and 
grab car vandalism. Businesses that close at 5 or 6 (as the contemplated retail ground 
floor in this plan) would attract more shooting galleries, more vandalism, more 
homeless sleeping there. The Oxford group has already shown they are lousy landlords 
and care little about the impact on our city, our neighborhood from their lax 
management. When we regularly see needles, when a homeless woman gives birth next 
to a dumpster, and Oxford does nothing to add lighting or patrols, we can see plainly 
how lightly they take their responsibility as landlords.  

8) The proposed tower throws years of planning out the window. It discounts completely 
the value articulated by years of planning, ignoring the value of connected  
neighborhoods, brought together over shared green space.  

9) This proposal ignores the very real, urgent need for affordable housing in Boston. A 
modest building in keeping with existing zoning, with some affordable and some 
market-rate units and activated ground floor is the only tenable solution. 

10) The developers’ bad faith is evidenced by their abysmal job as current landlords and 
their attempted obfuscation of facts in their choice of images to share. As well, they 
ignore or fail to acknowledge the opposition of the neighborhood.  

 



 
 
BAD FAITH OF DEVELOPERS EVIDENT IN THIS SKEWED PERSPECTIVE 



 
 
If they had nothing to hide, THIS would be the rendering widely shared. 
 



 
 
Or perhaps this one. 
 
 



6/14/2019 City of Boston Mail - 125 Lincoln Street Tower Project - Oxford Properties Comment

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0?ik=0cbdb5b592&view=pt&search=all&permmsgid=msg-f%3A1636136143110316504&simpl=msg-f%3A16361361431… 1/1

Michael Sinatra <michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov>

125 Lincoln Street Tower Project - Oxford Properties Comment 

chris colbert Wed, Jun 12, 2019 at 8:03 AM
To: Michael Sinatra <Michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov>

My wife Kate Gilbert and I live across from 125 Lincoln, and with its development will
lose our light and be in shadow. And we are supporters of the project nonetheless.  We
believe the LD is missing enlightened leadership and a vision for what the
neighborhood could/should be, and that the 125 Lincoln project, if done right, could
really help us improve the whole.  We also believe that the unfolding of the project was
not the best, and that a "listening tour" before any kind of reveal would have been
smart. But what's done is done. I believe the LD neighbors do not understand the
simple quid pro quo: we give Oxford height, they give us contributions to everything
from better sidewalks and lighting, to open space and greenery.  
 
Thank you for your stewardship.  I will continue to do what we can from within the LDNA
to establish a perspective of reason. 
 
Chris
 
--  
 
chris colbert
 
Watch Technology is Dead, my Ted-style talk given at the world's largest Fintech conference in Singapore.  
 
Read This Is It, my just released book on why and how to innovate your life. 
 
Sign up for my monthly Blueberry,  a short but provocative missive on navigating the world. 
 
 
 

https://www.youtube.com/watch?v=yVp500F2srk
https://www.amazon.com/This-Chris-Colbert-ebook/dp/B07RP45MQB/ref=tmm_kin_swatch_0?_encoding=UTF8&qid=&sr=
http://www.chriscolbert.com/
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Michael Sinatra <michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov>

125 Lincoln Street Comment Period Extension

Mark McGowan Mon, Jun 24, 2019 at 5:39 PM
To: Michael Sinatra <michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov>

Mike,

 

As the public meetings have started to get on the calendar in June and July and based on feedback from IAG members,
the public and Elected Officials, Oxford will extend the comment period to July 30th.

 

All the best,

 

Mark McGowan

Oxford Properties Group

125 Summer Street | 12th Floor| Boston, MA 02110

 

https://www.google.com/maps/search/125+Summer+Street?entry=gmail&source=g
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Michael Sinatra <michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov>

125 Lincoln Street Tower Project – Oxford Properties 

Henrietta Cosentino Wed, Jun 12, 2019 at 12:55 PM
To: Michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov
Cc: mayor@boston.gov, ed.flynn@boston.gov, Michelle.Wu@boston.gov, danchen.xu@boston.gov,

Dear People,
 
It was a shock to hear the Oxford Properties presentation on its proposed development at 125 Lincoln Street.
 Absolutely NOTHING about this project is appropriate for the given site. 
 
The proposed building is grossly out of scale with the buildings in the Leather District and in Chinatown.
 It would effectively cut off communication between the two districts.  
A building in that location should mediate between the two neighborhoods.  Instead, this walls them off—not
just physically but psychically.
 
It would also cast both the Greenway and the leather District in a gloom of shadow.  
 
That Oxford should even imagine such a building suggests that it has either not read or has knowlingly
disrespected the original plans for development in this area.  
A study in 2010 clearly stated a vision for development adjacent to the Leather District:  it specified that buildings
could be 80 ft. by right, and no more than 100 ft..  
This building proposes to be nearly FOUR TIMES the prescribed height.  
 
DO ZONING LAWS MEAN ANYTHING AT ALL IN THIS CITY?  We’ve lived in Los Angeles which is famously
inclined to erase the past, but there we never encountered such a radical assault on zoning. 
 
Then there’s traffic.  Lincoln Street is the debouchement of the exit 20 off-ramp.   It is narrow and already highly
congested.  Oxford imagines something like 4,000 people a day using the building.  Exactly how would they get
there and what would that do to traffic?  That’s a prescription for nightmare.
 
This proposed development offers nothing to the Leather District, nothing to the Greenway and nothing to
Chinatown.  One has to wonder:  who exactly would benefit?
 
The parking lot currently on the site may be less than beautiful, and would benefit from some clean-up and
refurbishment.  But we are grateful to have a parking lot in the vicinity and especially delighted to have, below it,
a jaunty banquet hall (Hei La Moon); and a Chinese purveyor of pork and duck.  These shops serve the
neighborhood very well. Nobody we know would want to see, in their place, some yuppie coffee shops and
boutiques.
 
The city did a spectacular job in creating the Greenway.  Then came the marvelous reincarnation of the
Leather District, once a no-go zone and now a vibrant residential community with families moving in.   Would
the city allow these marvels to be degraded for one unnecessary commercial development?
 
We moved to the Leather District because it is beautiful and residential, with the Greenway and Chinatown close
by.  
 
A building of the kind proposed by Oxford is an insult to the residents of Leather District and insult to the
shopkeepers and residents of Chinatown.
It is a terribly bad idea for the city of Boston.
 
A building like that, in the location, is not sustainable!
 
Respectfully,

https://www.google.com/maps/search/125+Lincoln+Street?entry=gmail&source=g
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Henrietta and Donald Cosentino
210 Lincoln Street #601
Boston, MA 02361
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

https://www.google.com/maps/search/210+Lincoln+Street+%23601+Boston,+MA?entry=gmail&source=g
https://www.google.com/maps/search/210+Lincoln+Street+%23601+Boston,+MA?entry=gmail&source=g
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July 30, 2019

Michael Sinatra, Project Manager
Boston Planning & Development Agency
One City Hall Square
Boston, MA 02201

Dear Michael Sinatra,

As a representative of the residents of Boston and all of its communities, I am writing to you
today to express my concerns regarding the redevelopment of the property on 125 Lincoln
Street. I have received a number of emails and phone calls from residents of the Leather District
and Chinatown expressing their objections over how this project is proceeding.

Chief among these concerns is the loss of a valuable community location that includes the Hei La
Moon Restaurant and the C-Mart Supermarket. Hei La Moon is a long-standing community
institution that serves as an invaluable convening space for many community events throughout
the year, includmg Lunar New Year celebrations and other traditional banquet events. C-Mart is
one of the only grocery stores in this area and provides culturally appropriate food to the
Chinatown and larger AAPI community.

Compounding the potential loss of these foundational community spaces is that they would be
replaced with a development that will make community-building in the Leather District even
more difficult. A proposed use of solely office space will not contribute to the vibrancy of the
neighborhood in the evenings or much-needed affordable housing. The stmcture threatens to
disconnect the Leather District from Chinatown, destroying the connections that these two
neighborhoods have built. A building of this size also has the potential to create wind tunnels and
overbearing shadows on the lively community nearby, mcluding on the Greenway, one of the
neighborhood's only green spaces.

The City should integrate any potential zoning changes into a comprehensive plan for the area
and address this proposal by taking into account the impact that development would have on the

BOSTON CITY HALL, ONE CITY HAT. L SQUARE, BOSTON, MASSACHUSETTS, 032U1

617-635-3115 . FAX: 617-635-4203 . MlCHELLE. WtT@BOSTON. GOV
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community. I support the many advocates and residents in opposing the project as proposed. I
look forward to working with yoiu- office to help reach a solution. If you have any questions or
concerns, please reach me at michelle.wu@boston.gov or (617) 635-3115.

^lujlk (^J^
Michelle Wu
Boston City Councilor-At-Large
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BOSTON CHINATOWN RESIDENTASSOCIATION
90 Tyler St, Suite 3, Boston, MA 02111
Email: Chinatownresidents@gmafl.com

Website: http://www.chiiiatownresident.org

Honorable Martin J. Walsh
Coundior Ed Flynn
Councilor Michael Flaherty
Coundilor Aithea Garrison
Councilor Michelle Wu
Chief of Housing and Director of Neighborhood Development Sheila Difion
Director of Boston Planning and Development Agency Brian Golden
1St Suffolk and Middlesex Massachusetts State Senator Joseph Boncore

3~ Suffolk Massachusetts State Representative Aaron Michelwitz

The Bosto’ atown Resident s ~ ciation is hereby expressing its concern regarding the
project propos ~for 125 Lincoln Street. A p eject of this magnitude is not in fitting with the
neighborhood eeds i ‘~ • a - rious impact in Chinatown’s cultural support mechanism, will
impact the residents of the Leather District, and goes against the wishes of its people who are Boston
residents as well as voters. Housing is one of the biggest needs in the area to be impacted by 125
Lincoln. Chinatown has seen an influx of luxury housing units in recent years. These housing units are
not units that can accommodate residents on Boston’s lengthy affordable housing waiting list. These
luxury units are also not units aimed at working middle-class residents. Rather than building an office
building, we urge the development team, and our elected leaders to look at building housing on this
site. 125 Lincoln wifi further erode the Chinatown neighborhood as it wifi be removing at least 4
Chinese businesses from the area. These businesses stand to lose greater than 140 jobs. Workers of
these, soon to be shuttered, businesses will certainly find great difficulty in attaining employment
elsewhere. A lower income resident of Chinatown typically lives paycheck to paycheck, and is situated
below the poverty line. A one week gap in pay can have a long lasting impact on their health,
livelihood, and on the stability of their families. A project of this magnitude will have a negative impact
on traffic, which is already congested. It is not uncommon now to see emergency vehicles stuck in
traffic on roads surrounding the proposed project site. This project wifi potentially keep ambulances
from reaching nearby Tufts Medical Center during emergencies. During community meetings the 125
Lincoln Street project presenters claimed that the City wants this project. Several meeting attendees
rejected this statement as the area residents are the city. As of now, the residents don’t want this project,
and the Boston Chinatown Resident Association also stands in opposition.

Chu Huang Hin Sang Yu Michael Wong

Co-Chair Co-Chair Co-Chair

90 Tyler St #3, Boston, MA 02111 ChinatownResidents@gmail.com
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Michael Sinatra <michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov>

125 Lincoln Street Tower Project – Oxford Properties

Laura D'Anca Tue, Jul 30, 2019 at 10:28 PM
To: Michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov
Cc: mayor@boston.gov, ed.flynn@boston.gov, Michelle.Wu@boston.gov, 

Dear Mr. Sinatra:
 
I am writing today to voice my opposition to the proposed building at 125 Lincoln Street in Boston
by Oxford Properties. 
 
As a 15 year resident of the Leather District, I care deeply about the neighborhood and the
community. The Leather District is a unique and distinct neighborhood that represents a rich part of
history in Boston and is home to many individuals who appreciate and love it as I do.
 
Overall, I believe that the proposed building would be a detriment to the neighborhood, Chinatown,
the Financial District, the Greenway, and the thousands of individuals who currently and will in the
future live in, spend time in and pass through the Leather District and surrounding communities
every day. 
 
Specifically, one of the primary concerns I have is with the proposed height of the project at 370'.

A 370' building would be in direct violation of the zoning code (Article 44) and urban planning
for the Leather District. The proposed height is almost four times that of the 100' maximum
height permitted by the BPDA’s Greenway Planning Study for this exact site. 

In addition, at a height of 370', the parks and homes surrounding and in the Leather District
and Chinatown will be bathed in shadows for a significant part of the day. 

Finally, the proposed height combined with such a large footprint for the building will create a
literal wall between the Leather District and Chinatown. The City of Boston just recently
completed a major resurfacing project on Beach Street, linking South Station to Chinatown,
which will be virtually irrelevant when the two neighborhoods are divided by the proposed
building.

I am also concerned with the disruption that will be caused by the actual construction of the
building. 

During the BPDA meeting on June 26, 2019, we were informed that the approximate
estimated time for the construction of the project will be 36 months. This will clearly have an
impact on those of us who live in the neighborhood, in Chinatown and in the surrounding
neighborhoods due to the noise, lights, air pollution, and traffic.

In addition, for three years both the sidewalk and parking on the west side of Lincoln Street
between Beach Street and Tufts Street will be usurped for construction. Oxford Properties
specifically informed us that this degree of encroachment is required due to constructing a
building of such height. Lincoln Street is already a very congested road and parking in the
area is extremely limited; Lincoln Street currently serves as the primary connector from 93N
and the Financial District; and the NE corner of Lincoln and Beach Streets currently serves

https://www.google.com/maps/search/125+Lincoln+Street?entry=gmail&source=g
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as an MBTA bus stop for commuters traveling into downtown Boston. As such, traveling on
Lincoln Street and parking in the neighborhood (and in turn in Chinatown and the Financial
District) will become increasingly difficult, which will have an impact not only on those of us
who live in the neighborhood, but also on the thousands of individuals who commute to and
visit the city during this time.

Finally, I am concerned with the proposed use for the building.

A 100% commercial space would be completely inconsistent with the mixed used properties
that make the Leather District the unique community that it is. As a neighborhood, we want to
encourage a sense of community. We have agreed, and it has been proven, that community
is best developed through both residential and commercial use rather than via an empty
lobby during the evening.

At the LDNA meetings and the BPDA meeting, we were also informed by Oxford Properties
that the proposed building will contain less parking spots than the current parking garage that
stands at the site. Adding thousands of individuals working in and visiting the building to an
already congested area that is lacking in sufficient parking and reducing the number of
parking spots will clearly only add to an already existing problem.

Thank you for taking the time to read the concerns I have outlined above and those shared by my
neighbors and others in opposition to the proposed building at 125 Lincoln Street by Oxford
Properties.
 
Sincerely,
 
Laura A. D'Anca
150 Lincoln Street, 2B
 

https://www.google.com/maps/search/125+Lincoln+Street?entry=gmail&source=g
https://www.google.com/maps/search/150+Lincoln+Street?entry=gmail&source=g
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Michael Sinatra <michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov>

125 Lincoln St Tower Project - Oxford Properties

Deniz Johnson Fri, Jun 21, 2019 at 8:05 PM
To: michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov
Cc: mayor@boston.gov, ed.flynn@boston.gov, michelle.wu@boston.gov, danchen.xu@boston.gov,

Hi Michael,

I am writing to express my strong objection to Oxford Properties' plan to build a 370' office tower at 125 Lincoln St. 

The proposed tower will negatively impact both Leather District and Chinatown.
It will wall off the Chinatown and Leather District neighborhoods from one another, and do nothing to improve access to
housing in the area.

As the board member of Greenway Conservancy, I strongly oppose any attempts that will completely cover a
section of the Greenway in shadows and eliminate the passageway between Leather District and Chinatown.

The BPDA Greenway Planning Study, as well as zoning ordinances, call for a building with a maximum height of 100', in
order to minimize shadows and fit into the surrounding area.  I feel that this plan, which is nearly 4x taller than zoning
allows, is completely inappropriate.

I'm also very concerned about the current businesses in the garage space.  The Hei La Moon restaurant and CMart are
both important to the Chinatown community in particular, and create active use at night and on weekends that serves to
deter crime.  An office building will be virtually unoccupied at those times and will create a sort of urban desert. 
This will make the neighborhoods very UNSAFE !

While the existing building can certainly use some improvement, it is much more valuable to the neighborhood than
Oxford's proposal.  I'd love to see a mixed use building in this location, with housing and other businesses that would
liven up the neighborhood at all hours.

Thank you for your time and attention, and I appreciate the opportunity to provide comments.

Regards,
Deniz Johnson
Board member - Rose Kennedy Greenway Conservancy
Leather District resident
111 Beach St 
Leather District

https://www.google.com/maps/search/125+Lincoln+St?entry=gmail&source=g
https://www.google.com/maps/search/111+Beach+St+Leather+District?entry=gmail&source=g
https://www.google.com/maps/search/111+Beach+St+Leather+District?entry=gmail&source=g


______ Kohl Coffee Company
P0 Box 1022

K ~ H I Prov~ncetown, MA 02657
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MichaeLA~Sinau*@Boston.Rov

Michael Sinatra, Project anagez
Boston Plann~ng and Development Agency
One City Sq~, 9~ Floor
Boston, MA 02201

Dear Mr. Sinatra,

As the owner of a neighborhood small business coffee and pastiy shop serving the residents and
employ~es in Chinatown, the Leather District, and Downtown Crossing, I would welcome the
opportunity of revitalizing the space at 125 Lincoln Street with a new, mixed use building.

A new office building with nice public space and ground floor uses will add more vibrancy and
activity in the area and increase foot traffic and patrons in the neighborhood.

The project offers the potential for my business to grow and support my employees.

We look forward to seeing the project advance.

Slnce~~,/)

James DeRosier
Kohi Coffee Co.
Vice President
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Michael Sinatra <michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov>

125 Lincoln Street Tower Project – Oxford Properties

Deniz Johnson Tue, Jul 30, 2019 at 10:48 AM
To: "Michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov" <Michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov>
Cc: "mayor@boston.gov" <mayor@boston.gov>, "ed.flynn@boston.gov" <ed.flynn@boston.gov>, "michelle.wu@boston.gov"
<michelle.wu@boston.gov>, 

Hi Michael

I am opposed to the current plan of Oxford Properties' office tower at 125 Lincoln St since it will lead to the following:

1 - City will lose voters as communities are dissolved
2 - City will have an increased burden due to the additional Police presence needed
3 - Property values will go down, city will be burdened with a traffic problem due to 3000+ people commuting to this
location.
4 - Greenway parcels will be impacted. It might not be feasible for Greenway to keep the parcels around 125 Lincoln.

To elaborate:
1- This proposed building will wall off the Chinatown and Leather District neighborhoods from one another. There will not
be any additional housing in this area.  The connected communities will now be disconnected. I expect Leather District's
(LD) residents will be most impacted due to being walled off between South Station and an office tower.  In the past, more
residents and families have moved to LD as an urban location with close proximity to the Greenway.  This will change with
a wall.
Families that have chosen to live in LD will start moving out to the suburbs, changing the demographics of the
neighborhood and we will be losing more voters in the city. 

2- Oxford indicates this proposed building's public space is available during business hours (8am - 6 pm - Monday thru
Friday).  
Currently we have a crime problem at this location even with foot traffic and BPD is not always able to respond in a timely
manner. Crime will increase by having an empty office building after 6 pm and on the weekends.  
Oxford properties has owned this location for 2+ years.  During this time, this location actually became an attraction for
some unsavory characters.  The security of the Greenway areas around this building became more of an issue.  Just last
week, 2 people were mugged on the Greenway property in front of 125 lincoln and the gang of suspects were stationed
behind the garage.  Oxford has cameras and a property manager (at Leather District's request) but they have not really
partnered with either neighborhoods.  
This means BPD will be called here more and more.

3 - With an increased crime and residents leaving, Leather District (LD) and Chinatown property values will  decrease. In
the mean time, traffic will be even more of a challenge in this area. City will need to address the gridlock that comes from
3000+ people commuting to this location. Another burden for Boston. I cannot see any of these as an economic boom for
Boston. 

4 - Unique situation of this building for Greenway...Until this building, the height provisions and other lenience from the
original plans were on both sides of the Greenway .  This building sits in the middle of 2 parcels - the decision on height
and its impact to Greenway should be seriously discussed.  Other lenience on rules might not necessarily be a
predecessor to this proposal.  It might not be feasible for Greenway to keep the parcels around 125 Lincoln if they are
covered in shadows, hard to plant/grow green areas for public use. Abandoned areas will be great location for crime
beds.

Recommendation:
1 - Keep the height more aligned with the communities (Chinatown and Leather District) this proposed building surrounds
and keep the connected communities
2 - Ground floor public space should be public space that is open weekends and late nights
3 - Explore mixed use building in this location - maybe partner with a local developer that understands Boston
communities.

These comments are in addition to my previous note:
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this oversized project that violates the zoning code (Article 44), urban planning with respect to the Leather District and the
BPDA’s own Greenway Planning Study for this site all of which say 80’ by right and 100’ maximum.  The Oxford plan is for
370’.  The proposed office-only use is completely inconsistent with the successful mixed use (residential/commercial) of
the Leather District.  It will bath the Greenway Park in shadow in the early part of the day and the Leather District in
shadow the later part of the day.   We can expect increased traffic and wind.  Worst of all, it will serve to wall us off from
surrounding neighborhoods. 

Thank you for your time and attention, and I appreciate the opportunity to provide comments.

Regards,
Deniz Johnson
Board member - Rose Kennedy Greenway Conservancy
Leather District resident
111 Beach St 
Leather District
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Michael Sinatra <michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov>

Leather District project does not fit with zoning and greenway formal planning 

John Donnellan Wed, Jun 12, 2019 at 10:01 AM
To: "Michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov" <Michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov>
Cc: 

 

Dear Sir,

I am in opposition to the Leather District oversized project that violates the zoning code (Article 44), urban
planning with respect to the Leather District and the BPDA’s own Greenway Planning Study for this site all
of which say 80’ by right and 100’ maximum.  The Oxford plan is for 370’.  The proposed office-only use is
completely inconsistent with the successful mixed use (residential/commercial) of the Leather District.  It
will bath the Greenway Park in shadow in the early part of the day and the Leather District in shadow the
later part of the day.   We can expect increased traffic and wind.  Worst of all, it will serve to wall us off from
surrounding neighborhoods. 

Please plan a project that matches what is already in neighborhood.

 

Thanks,

John Donnellan

Resident for 20 years

717 Atlantic Ave 1c

Boston, MA 02111

 

 

https://www.google.com/maps/search/717+Atlantic+Ave?entry=gmail&source=g
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Michael Sinatra <michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov>

125 Lincoln Street Tower Project-Oxford Properties

Cynthia Dyer Tue, Jul 30, 2019 at 6:10 PM
To: Michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov
Cc: mayor@boston.gov, ed.flynn@boston.gov, michelle.wu@boston.gov

Dear Michael,

I am a long-time resident (over 25 years) of the Leather District who would like to present my concerns regarding the 125
Lincoln Street Tower Project proposal as it stands.

Primarily the current proposal violates the zoning code of 100’ and the mixed use character of the Leather District
possibly setting a precedent for future development that could eradicate our neighborhood as the historic district that it is.

I have attended 3 of the 4 presentations where many neighbors expressed their dissent of the project. Not only did the
Oxford Properties not offer any possible compromises but totally disregarded all concerns raised.

Other specific concerns (not in order of importance):

The project is expected to take three years, three years blocking the Beach St easy access passage from the Leather
District to Chinatown and other neighborhoods. A huge inconvenience to walkers and drivers wanting to access the
highway. Not only that, it is three years of construction noise reverberating throughout the neighborhood and general
disruption.

The presenters mentioned they would be digging down over 20’, if I remember correctly, but no mention of a study on how
this digging will effect the foundations of nearby buildings. 

There is already an office building in the Leather District at the corner of Atlantic Avenue, Beach Street and South Street
that stood vacant for many years. If it wasn’t for We Work occupying the space it could still be empty. The presenters
have been vague as to whether they have tenants in place and if so who they are. It would be an abomination if this
project was given a go and the building was left empty.

Also there are plans for building out South Station. Between the two projects our neighborhood would be blocked off,
isolated from the rest of the city, a city which is taking great strides to unite all the different neighborhoods. The Southend
build up of Harrison Ave has opened access to South Boston and Chinatown. The Greenway connecting the North End to
the city proper. Fort Point, Seaport and South Boston are all connected and enjoying increased property values $1K+ per
sq ft while our property values hover between $600-700. This project, isolating us even more from the rest of the city,
could have an even more detrimental effect on our property values.

As other neighbors have mentioned, I am concerned about wind and shadow effects, increased traffic.  Little thought
given to the current very active businesses on that block- C Mart and Hei La Moon.

I am especially disturbed by the fact that Oxford Properties bought 125 Lincoln knowing full well that our neighborhood
has height restrictions but expecting a go ahead, especially without any compromises.

Please do not approve this project as it stands.

Best,
Cynthia Dyer
Sent from my iPhone
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Michael Sinatra <michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov>

125 Lincoln Street Tower Project – Oxford Properties 

Ford Englander Tue, Jun 18, 2019 at 10:23 AM
To: Michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov
Cc: mayor@boston.gov, ed.flynn@boston.gov, Michelle.Wu@boston.gov, danchen.xu@boston.gov,

Mr. Sinatra:
 
I am writing today to voice my opposition to the proposed building at 125 Lincoln Street by Oxford Properties. I am a 15
year resident of the Leather District and live at 150 Lincoln. As you know, the proposed height of 370 feet is almost 4
times that of the maximum height prescribed by the BPDA’s own Greenway Planning Study. 
 
The proposed building threatens to cut off our neighborhood from Chinatown. It will disrupt the area by adding large
shadows to Chinatown Park in addition to other parts of the Greenway and the Leather District. Furthermore, the
construction will shrink the congested city gateway street of Lincoln down to a single lane for at least 3 years. This
proposed commercial only building structure has been created with no regard for the mixed use nature of neighborhood. I
believe the Greenway Planning Study was a sufficient tax payer investment in the site and all developers should respect
the prescriptions codified in the Greenway Planning Study.
 
Thank you,
 
Ford Englander

https://www.google.com/maps/search/125+Lincoln+Street?entry=gmail&source=g
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Michael Sinatra <michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov>

125 Lincoln Street Tower Project – Oxford Properties

Meaghan English Tue, Jul 30, 2019 at 2:54 PM
To: Michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov
Cc: mayor@boston.gov, ed.flynn@boston.gov, Michelle.Wu@boston.gov, danchen.xu@boston.gov,

Dear Michael,

I am reaching out as a resident of the Leather District neighborhood, adamantly opposed to the proposed Oxford Tower
construction at 125 Lincoln.

There are numerous reasons why this construction is detrimental for the city, neighborhood, and residents. Many of my
neighbors from the Leather District and Chinatown have well-represented several of my concerns, both through written
letters and in the meetings we have all attended. Some of these include the exponential increase in air and noise pollution
that would distress our families and children daily, both during and post-construction, as well as traffic, wind, and shadow
concerns that would negatively affect all of us who have committed to living and raising families in this area. Please
accept this as a reiteration of my neighbors’ statements around each and every one of these health and safety concerns,
which will threaten our community and our children if the Oxford proposal is approved. 

I trust you’ve also received our concerns around the social contract we entered into with the city when we purchased our
homes here; that the Greenway Study, into which the city invested so much time, talent, and tax dollars, would be
respected, and that nothing over 100’ would be constructed in this very space. We are simply asking that our elected and
appointed officials respect their commitments, and represent the best interest of their constituents, as is their
responsibility. If Oxford is to be granted any proposal, it should be in-line with the law, and appropriate for the community.
The building should stand no higher than 100’ feet (with 80’ setback) and should reflect the nature of the community:
mixed use, with architectural features to ensure it becomes a part of the community; not a dividing wall between the
Leather District and Chinatown. While residents – both taxpayers and voters – work tirelessly to improve our
neighborhood, please do not allow Oxford to disregard law with a tower that will improve nothing but its bottom line.  

On the topic of Oxford Properties' management of the current state of affairs: quite frankly, it’s appalling. For a world-class
building management company to purchase a piece of property and then neglect its upkeep, providing an empty promise
to improve once it’s extreme demands are met: its offensive. It displays a complete disdain for the community and lack of
understanding of the neighborhood. We’ve heard repeatedly from the Oxford team that this tower will make the area a
safer, better place. Yet the current structure has been under their ownership for years, and there have been zero efforts to
clean up even the immediate surrounding area. A simple effort to install lighting, or a cleanup of the needles that decorate
their own investment would have at least provided a remote display of concern for the property and intent to improve it. To
grant a delinquent landlord their request to enhance their wealth – in the order of hundreds of millions of dollars, no less –
at the continued expense of the community would condone such behavior and ensure its continuance. I find no solace in
the promise of a “safer, better” community that would come from the construction of a commercial high-rise that will be
desolate after dark, by a landlord proven to be negligent. None. 

Lastly, on the topic of the community, we cannot ignore the fact that immigrant communities in this country are facing a
precarious moment. Erecting a commercial tower that further isolates Chinatown from the rest of the city, physically
removes the connecting point to the Leather District, and destroys several of its dearest and most community-critical
businesses in the process, is the beginning of the end. Oxford commentary that Hei La Moon and C-Mart “could” be
relocated to other parts of the city, and that supplemental options for affordable housing (so desperately needed) “will be
looked into,” is again meaningless, as Oxford cannot be trusted to respect the community within which it operates now.
What makes us believe that these businesses will be relocated, and that the workers will be supported in finding income?
That affected low-income residents will actually be provided housing opportunity? Chinatown is home to so many who
have made incredible contributions to this community. As several of my neighbors also expressed at the recent meeting at
Hei La Moon, I’d be ashamed if my city allowed a massive building management company to signal Chinatown's death
knell. The approval of such a monstrosity would direly and irreparably hurt the Chinatown neighborhood, as well as the
City of Boston. It’s not who we are. And it’s not who we want to be. 

I would welcome the opportunity to continue this conversation with your office, and look forward the City’s response to the
Oxford proposal. Thank you very much for your continued support for the residents of the Leather District and Chinatown
community. 
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Best regards,
Meaghan English
Leather District 

-- 
Meaghan English
M.A., International Affairs & US Foreign Policy
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Michael Sinatra <michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov>

125 Lincoln Street Tower Project – Oxford Properties

E.Y. Snowden Tue, Jul 30, 2019 at 12:20 PM
To: Michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov
Cc: mayor@boston.gov, ed.flynn@boston.gov, Michelle.Wu@boston.gov, 

Mr. Sinatra,
I am writing as a resident of the City of Boston Leather District in opposition to the Oxford Properties proposal for a 370'
office-only development at 125 Lincoln Street. This  grossly oversized project violates zoning code and urban planning
with respect to the Leather District and the Greenway Planning Study for this site.  More importantly, such a structure
would permanently damage our neighborhood with overcrowding, darkening shadows, and structural separation from the
Greenway and Chinatown without doing anything for residential life or local commerce.  I agree that the 125 Lincoln
Street garage property is in need of redevelopment, but I find Oxford's logic that the garage's profitability mandates they
build 370' of office to be perverse.  If they like the garage's profitability that much, they should rebuild a nice larger garage
to the 100' urban planning maximum height. 

Thank you for your consideration,
Edward Snowden
121 Beach St, Boston, MA 02111

https://www.google.com/maps/search/125+Lincoln+Street?entry=gmail&source=g
https://www.google.com/maps/search/125+Lincoln+Street?entry=gmail&source=g
https://www.google.com/maps/search/121+Beach+St,+Boston,+MA+02111?entry=gmail&source=g
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Michael Sinatra <michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov>

125 Lincoln Street Tower Project - Oxford Properties

Gregory Fiore MD Tue, Jul 30, 2019 at 8:27 AM
To: michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov
Cc: mayor@boston.gov, ed.flynn@boston.gov, michelle.wu@boston.gov, 

Dear Sir,

Regarding the proposed 125 Lincoln Street Tower Project, I am a Leather District property owner and am writing
to express concern with the Oxford Properties proposal under consideration.

My concerns stem mainly from the following:

1. Generally, the magnitude of the project will disrupt the footprint of the Leather District / Chinatown which is
why prior urban plans suggested different approaches

2. The height of the building will block the visibility from the Leather District into Boston and create shadows
that have been more eloquently described previously

Other approaches should be considered.

Thank you,

Greg Fiore

DISCLAIMER:

The information contained in this email (including any file attachments transmitted with it) is for the sole use of the intended recipient(s) and may contain

confidential and privileged information. Any unauthorised review, use, alteration, disclosure, copying or distribution is prohibited. If you have received this

email in error, please notify the sender by return email and destroy all copies of the original message. Any confidentiality or privilege is not waived or lost by

any mistaken delivery of this email

https://www.google.com/maps/search/125+Lincoln+Street?entry=gmail&source=g
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Michael Sinatra <michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov>

125 Lincoln Street Tower Project - Oxford Properties 

Christi Fried Fri, Jun 14, 2019 at 12:08 PM
Reply-To: Christi Fried 
To: michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov
Cc: Debra Fitzgerald-Klemp , Deborah Kay 

, "mayor@boston.gov" <mayor@boston.gov>,
"ed.flynn@boston.gov" <ed.flynn@boston.gov>, "michelle.wu@boston.gov" <michelle.wu@boston.gov>,
"danchen.xu@boston.gov" <danchen.xu@boston.gov>

Mr. Sinatra,
 
I oppose the over-sized project that violates the zoning code (Article 44), urban planning with respect
to the Leather District and the BPDA's own Greenway Planning Study for this site.  All of them say
80' by right and 100' maximum while the Oxford plan is for 370'.  This will bathe the Greenway
Park in shadow in the early part of the day and the Leather District in shadow the later part of the
day.
 
I understand the need for compromise and would be willing to support a lower height of
218'.  This takes the following into consideration:

surrounding variances from the zoning code:
Kneeland/Utica hotel to be built:  218' 
Two Financial: 205'

Oxford profitability
diminished shadows on the Greenway and Leather District neighborhood

Respectfully,
 
Christi Fried
Chickadee Realty, LLC
Leather District Owner
717 Atlantic Avenue, #8D
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Michael Sinatra <michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov>

125 Lincoln Notification Form 

Kathryn Friedman Tue, Jun 18, 2019 at 11:03 AM
To: Michael Sinatra <michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov>
Cc: Brad Blake , Suzanne Lee , Christopher Betke

Hi Michael,
 
I would like to add inconsistencies in the PNF to Chris's email about skewed information. The PNF contains conclusions
about wind, shadows, solar glare, daylight, etc. These conclusions are supposedly based on data, yet the supporting
images in Appendix B look to be based on a different model than the building presented on the cover of the PNF and the
one presented to the Leather District. I understand that design is an iterative process and that there is a continuous need
to update information. To file a document with the BPDA, though, in which conclusions and the data on which they are
based do not align calls into question Oxford's desire for transparency.
 
Best,
 
Kathryn
[Quoted text hidden]
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Michael Sinatra <michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov>

125 Lincoln Street Public Meeting Flyer 

Kathryn Friedman Tue, Jun 11, 2019 at 6:20 PM
To: Michael Sinatra <michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov>
Cc:  Christopher Betke 

Hi Michael,
 
Thank you for arranging the public meeting and for sending out the flyer. I have forwarded it to the Leather District
Association and will make sure to get it posted in neighborhood lobbies.
 
Residents of the Leather District are extremely concerned about Oxford's proposal as I am sure you will hear in the
coming weeks. There has also been quite a bit of frustration with the process. Oxford has used their multitude of
resources to push forward on a project that ignores the health, safety, and livability of the Leather District. In addition, the
project seems to be in direct conflict with the Greenway's goal to reconnect neighborhoods and Boston's 2030 vision of a
more sustainable city. While we are busy collecting our thoughts to share with you, Oxford has been on a campaign to
lead many to believe that the project is well along its way to approval, and that our voices do not count. We hope that you
will hear us and that you will give us opportunities to speak up at all critical junctures. I look forward to being on the IAG,
but I also want to make sure that my neighbors feel they have a say in protecting our community.
 
I look forward to seeing you at the scoping session on Monday.
 
Best,
 
Kathryn
[Quoted text hidden]
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Michael Sinatra <michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov>

125 Lincoln Notification Form 

Kathryn Friedman Tue, Jun 18, 2019 at 3:14 PM
To: Michael Sinatra <michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov>
Cc: Brad Blake , Suzanne Lee , Christopher Betke

Hi Michael,

 

Thank you for your response. Here are my comments regarding yesterday’s scoping session:

Climate study analysis and conclusions should be based on current building model.
Does the addition of a large office building change the noise standards for Lincoln Street
from residential to business? I.e. Can we be sure that no overnight construction will be
permitted and that snow removal will not involve any loud equipment?
The proposal should remove any reference of introducing two-way traffic on Beach Street.
How much parking will be removed from the Leather District, including residential spots,
metered spots, and publicly accessible garage spots?
Vehicular path(s) of travel from proposed garage to 93N should be included. Vehicular
path(s) of travel from 93N to garage should also be included. These paths should be looked
at in conjunction with traffic data.
Anticipated arrival/departure paths for cyclists should be included. Current cyclist entry
suggests that cyclists will be approaching from the Essex, Surface, Lincoln intersection.
Otherwise they will have to travel through traffic on Lincoln Street or against traffic on Beach
Street.
What is the proposed F.A.R. and how does that compare with surrounding buildings? What is
the F.A.R. both with and without the requested air rights?

In addition to asking for these clarifications and supplemental material, I support comments made
by others yesterday. Unfortunately, I do not have a list of those present so I can not attribute
specific comments, but I would like to reinforce the following:

Leather District residents should be prioritized in all improvements to the public realm. The
improvements to the public realm should be ‘extraordinary’. Privately owned public space
may not be welcoming enough.
The project and all public improvements should seek to make more welcoming thresholds
into the Leather District.
Tufts Street should be further explored as the loading dock entry. My building entry is on
Tufts Street, so from a personal standpoint, this is less desirable for me due to noise and
safety issues. From an urban design standpoint, however, I do agree that more investigation
of the Tufts Street entry is warranted. Beach Street is the path that connects South Station,
the Leather District, Chinatown, and often point farther west. It is also the main connection
between the Leather District and local schools, school bus stops, and daycares. Pedestrian
comfort needs to be prioritized on Beach. In addition, the Tufts Street extension which
separates the Oxford-owned 125 Lincoln parcel from the Greenway is consistent with the
roadways that mediate between public and private throughout the length of the Greenway.
Allowing Oxford’s property to flow seamlessly into Greenway owned land opens up too much
ambiguity over property ownership and responsibility.
Wind is currently uncomfortable on/near the site. The building should not further decrease
the comfort level. I would like to add to this by pointing out the number of children that reside
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in the Leather District and Chinatown. What might be considered ‘uncomfortable’ for an adult
could result in dangerous conditions for kids. I have had a stroller overturn at point 110 (fig.
5.1a) several times as well as at a location between points 50 and 53 (also fig. 5.1a).
A dimensioned site plan should be included in the proposal. It would be nice to also see a
dashed line included along all sidewalks showing were hydrants or signage would go. The
addition of these elements significantly cuts down available width of path.

Finally, here were my closing comments to Oxford:

In the PNF there is continuous mention of significant improvements to the public realm, however,
from the Leather District standpoint there is:

Loss of connection with Chinatown
Loss of businesses that are used by neighborhood residents
Loss of night and weekend activity in an area that needs it
Loss of sunlight
Loss of parking
Loss of residential neighborhood feel
Loss of sky view
Gain in wind
Gain in solar glare
Gain in traffic at already congested times

 
I hope that any further submissions by Oxford will address these points.

 

Best,

Kathryn
[Quoted text hidden]
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Michael Sinatra <michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov>

125 Lincoln Street Tower Project – Oxford Properties

Paul Gagnon Tue, Jul 30, 2019 at 7:06 AM
To: Michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov
Cc: mayor@boston.gov, ed.flynn@boston.gov, Michelle.Wu@boston.gov

Michael Sinatra, Project Manager
Boston Planning & Development Agency
One City Hall Square
Boston, MA 02201

Dear Michael Sinatra,

I would like to take this opportunity to weigh in on the proposed building at 125 Lincoln St.  Let me be as clear as
possible, the proposed building height is unacceptable.  It violates the current zoning law, it is bad for the neighborhood,
bad for the Greenway and bad for Chinatown. I oppose this development.

As you are well aware, the zoning height for this parcel of land is approximately 80/100 feet (give or take).  This zone
height wasn’t created capriciously, or out of context, it was created in the context of the neighborhood, namely the Leather
District, the Greenway, and Chinatown.  As you are also aware, there were two studies done in 1990 and 2010, that
confirmed this zoning height.  This is the reason studies are done, plans are developed, and zoning is created and
enforced, so ALL are on the same plan.

Might I also take a moment and state that the current zoning height was something that Oxford properties was well aware
of when they purchased this property. It was their intention from the onset, to void this zoning restriction.  Basically,
putting a stake in the ground, that their desires and profits are more important than the neighborhood that they exist in.

Let me point out that the Leather District is a small, low rise neighborhood.  We are basically 2.5 blocks length wise by 3
blocks.  This parcel takes up 1 full block length wise. It is almost ½ the length of the Leather District. All the proposed
renderings of the building do everything in their visual power, to mitigate this.  They do NOT display AT ALL, the immense
WALL this building will create.  WALL sir, WALL.  I cannot say it any other way.

The Leather District neighborhood, had to endure countless hours of construction, detours, traffic (and still does) whilst
the big dig was being executed, with the  promise and hope that at the end, we, like other neighborhoods, bordering it, will
have the Greenway as the finished product.  Now that Greenway is a success, developers such are Oxford Properties are
rushing in to cash in on this, when they had nothing at stake when the construction occurred.  Now, they are asking to
build a huge WALL, blocking out the Leather District views and providing basically commuters, who don’t live in the city,
pay taxes and provide life to the city, spectacular views of the Greenway and beyond.  All at our expense.

The Greenway is the goal here, yet this building will cast huge shadows on the Greenway.  Will create wind tunnels and
add more and more traffic in the area (3,000 to 4,000 commuters are not all going to take public transport, there will be
endless pickups and drop offs.)  Basically, destroying the very element that is attracting the building here in the first
place.  In addition, part of the Greenway is the small park next to this parcel on Lincoln St.  During their so called
“construction”, they are going to level the park and kill all the trees and then create something in the future.  All for them. 
Do you know how long it takes to get trees to grow so they provide shade again?  Approximately 10 years.  The Leather
District finally has some shade trees and this construction is going to destroy that, so that after their construction (3 years)
new trees will be planted.  That is 13 years before we have shade trees again.  Again, all about Oxford Properties needs,
not about the Greenway.

And then we get to Chinatown.  The Leather District is part of the Chinatown neighborhood.  So, let’s build a WALL in
between.  This is an office building, so no life on evenings or weekends.  Do you think the street level business are going
to cater to Chinatown or the 3,000 to 4,000 weekday office occupants?  Did any of the new buildings in the area cater to
anyone except the week day office occupants???  The answer is NO.

Finally, there is the zoning exemption itself.  They are not asking to put up a flag pole or extend the top of the building for
a chimney or elevator head house.  The current building is approximately 60 feet and is already very imposing on the
street.  The new height is 370 feet or 6 (yes 6) times the height of the existing building.  Two times the existing height is
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already exceeding the zoning and will be out of proportion to the neighborhood.

There was a reason for a zoning restriction for this parcel of land.  Planners knew that a huge building would be bad for
everyone concerned except a developer.  There is a law in place to prevent this.  It is the same law that prevents building
heights in the Seaport, Beacon Hill, South End, etc,  (Just because the Federal Government wants a height restriction in
the Seaport as well, does make a law any stronger, law is law.) I shouldn’t have to be writing this letter, as there a LAW
preventing this.  That was the point of the LAW.

You are asking existing residents, to allow an office tower in the middle of what is now, a mostly residential area, where
we will have to endure 3 years of endless destructions/construction, traffic, noise and large quantities of pollution.  And
what do we get in return?  A huge WALL, that removes our sunlight, any visible skies from our units and reduces our
property values, all while giving all the benefits to this corporation.

As a resident for 15 years in the Leather District, I am (and from the recent planning meetings, so are most of my
neighbors), thoroughly opposed any exemption to the zoning law as it is now stated for this parcel.

Sincerely,

Paul A. Gagnon
108 Lincoln St #4a
Boston
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July 30, 2019 

 

Michael Sinatra 

Boston Planning & Development Agency 

One City Hall Square, 9th Floor 

Boston, MA 02201 

 Re: Public Comment on 125 Lincoln Street Project 

 

Dear Mr. Sinatra, 

 The Asian Outreach Unit of Greater Boston Legal Services, which for decades has 

provided legal representation of and assistance to Chinatown’s community groups and residents, 

opposes Oxford Properties’125 Lincoln Street project proposal in the Leather District next to 

Chinatown. After several decades of fighting environmental racism, urban renewal, institutional 

expansion, and over-development, Chinatown is in the midst of a housing affordability crisis. 

The proposed project would attract more luxury development, worsen traffic congestion in a 

community already highly impacted by air pollution, and strip away the community’s historical 

value. The immense size and character of the proposal does not match the surrounding 

residential environment. In addition, given the historical and cultural context of the community, 

the benefits proposed by Oxford Properties are insufficient for the project’s size. 

Founded in 1972, the Asian Outreach Unit (AOU) at Greater Boston Legal Services has 

advanced equality and justice for the Asian American community through bilingual and 

bicultural legal services. We incorporate litigation, legislation, and legal services—in 

collaboration with community organizing—to fight against systemic forces disrupting low-

income Asian immigrant communities. No other program in Massachusetts serves the legal 

needs of the Asian population with the same breadth and depth. Each year, we provide legal 

representation and assistance to over 1,000 low-income Asian immigrant clients. We directly 

hear from the most vulnerable Asian immigrants in Greater Boston through weekly legal clinics 

in the heart of Chinatown and Dorchester, two of the most populated Asian immigrant 

neighborhoods and collaborate closely with advocacy and organizing by Asian immigrants and 

organizations. Through the campaigns and cases we work on, we see firsthand the impact of 

gentrification and displacement on the residents of Chinatown, many of whom have been evicted 

from their homes and scattered across suburbs such as Malden and Quincy. In recent years, we 

have represented increasingly more tenants dealing with landlords demanding rent increases or 

facing imminent eviction in Chinatown.  

A 34-story tall office building would disproportionately harm residents of color in a 

neighborhood already plagued by overdevelopment that is inconsistent with the zoning code and 
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Chinatown’s Master Plan. We urge you to reconsider the current proposal at 125 Lincoln Street 

and actively work with community organizations, residents, workers, and community 

stakeholders to understand the historical and cultural context and to identify and respond to the 

issues and concerns facing this community. 

I. The proposed project will exacerbate the housing crisis and disproportionately 

harm residents of color in Boston’s Chinatown  

  The site of 125 Lincoln Street has long been part of the Chinatown community and 

provided space for neighborhood institutions and resources benefiting residents, workers, and 

immigrants who come from other parts of the state and still see Chinatown as a cultural and 

economic hub. Although the Boston Planning and Development Agency (BPDA) identifies 

Lincoln Street as part of the Leather District, the 2010 Chinatown Master Plan included Lincoln 

Street when envisioning the future of the Chinatown community.1 The proposed project would 

therefore impact both Chinatown and the Leather District.  

Chinatown is one of Boston’s most densely populated neighborhoods, with an estimate of 

12,000 residents. Existing Chinatown rental households have lived a longer period of time in 

their units than other Boston rental households and have established deeper roots in the 

community.2 Many residents are long-time renters who rely on the community, its network, and 

extensive resources for limited English proficient residents and workers. Despite years of 

development surrounding Chinatown, many residents remain low-income and excluded from the 

benefits of developments, as over one third of Chinatown’s population live below the federal 

poverty rate.3 

 While Chinatown’s origins are rooted in discrimination, the neighborhood’s more recent 

history is mired in displacement. During the City’s urban renewal period in the 1960s, the former 

Boston Redevelopment Authority seized land and homes from multiple neighborhoods including 

Chinatown. Seven hundred residents of Chinatown were evicted during this period, and much of 

the land was later sold to Tufts and New England Medical Center. In addition to institutional 

expansion into Chinatown, in the 1950s and 1960s, the federal government built two major 

highways, the Massachusetts Turnpike and the Southeast Expressway, right through the heart of 

Chinatown, which continues to suffer from serious air pollution problems and chronic traffic 

congestion.4 In more recent years, luxury residential developments and hotels have encroached 

on Chinatown. These luxury developments have attracted higher income households and led to 

drastically increased housing prices. By 2016, the majority of Chinatown households were 

extremely low-income, but a significant percentage was also very high-income.5 The rise of 

                                                           
1 2010 Chinatown Master Plan, http://www.focl-boston.org/uploads/8/2/7/7/82770312/chinatown_master_ppan_2010.pdf. 
2 Id. 
3 United States Census Bureau. (2018) American FactFinder. Retrieved from: 

https://factfinder.census.gov/faces/nav/jsf/pages/index.xhtml.  
4 Leong, Andrew, The Struggle over Parcel C: How Boston’s Chinatown Won a Victory Against Institutional Expansion and 

Environmental Racism, ScholarWorks UMass Boston (Sept. 1997), 

https://scholarworks.umb.edu/cgi/viewcontent.cgi?article=1021&context=iaas_pubs. 
5 Main, Kelly Leilani & Diana X Bell, Forced from Home: A Human Rights Assessment of Displacement and Evictions in 

Boston’s Chinatown, Displacement Research & Action Network (2019), 

http://www.focl-boston.org/uploads/8/2/7/7/82770312/chinatown_master_ppan_2010.pdf
https://factfinder.census.gov/faces/nav/jsf/pages/index.xhtml
https://scholarworks.umb.edu/cgi/viewcontent.cgi?article=1021&context=iaas_pubs
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luxury apartments continues to drive up housing prices and cause even more housing instability 

for residents. Although the conditions of rental apartments remain subpar, often with no heat or 

hot water, and regularly filled with rodent and pest infestations, Chinatown rents continue to go 

up. 

For decades, Chinatown residents have borne the brunt of disproportionate development 

in downtown Boston. Oxford Properties’ proposed project continues this pattern. The 

community’s residents of color will again disproportionately experience the impact of policies 

that enable massive development. 

The current proposal on 125 Lincoln Street insufficiently addresses the community’s 

need for affordable housing and other community resources and does not carefully consider new 

spaces for the existing community. Instead, Chinatown would lose another plot of land to 

development that attracts high-income professionals into the area and displaces the long-time, 

low-income, immigrant Chinese American population that has sustained and built this 

community for decades. Without thoughtful consideration of community needs, Oxford 

Properties’ proposed project will harm the character of this historical Asian immigrant working-

class community.  

The Chinatown community has long advocated for developments to benefit the public 

and carry community benefit such as truly affordable housing, community space, and economic 

opportunities for residents. We urge Oxford Properties to meaningfully engage community 

residents, workers, organizations, and stakeholders to consider how a new development project 

could transform and support a community through necessary resources and benefits rather than 

further erode its history and culture.  

II. The proposed project exceeds the allowed building envelope and is inconsistent 

with Chinatown’s Master Plan  

 

Zoning has long played a role in the overdevelopment of Chinatown. The community 

developed Chinatown’s Master Plans in part to respond to zoning variances granted for luxury 

and other unwanted development in the neighborhood. But without consideration of the Master 

Plans, developments exceeding the zoning envelope have created eyesores and drastically 

changed the demographics of Chinatown’s historic working class and family-oriented 

neighborhood. Although Chinatown was originally lined with three- or four-story brick row 

houses, decades of development have led to the demolishment of these historic buildings with 

the displacement of its residents. Only a dwindling number of row houses are left, and groups 

like the Chinese Progressive Association, a grassroots organization in Chinatown, have called for 

more protective zoning law to preserve the row houses remaining in the area.6 The Chinatown 

community is familiar with the power of zoning—and the exceptions to zoning laws granted for 

developments—that can impact this historic neighborhood of color.   

                                                           
https://static1.squarespace.com/static/56340b91e4b017e2546998c0/t/5c7811640852290f392207ca/1551372655581/CPA+report+

final+2019.pdf. 
6 Id. 

https://static1.squarespace.com/static/56340b91e4b017e2546998c0/t/5c7811640852290f392207ca/1551372655581/CPA+report+final+2019.pdf
https://static1.squarespace.com/static/56340b91e4b017e2546998c0/t/5c7811640852290f392207ca/1551372655581/CPA+report+final+2019.pdf
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The proposed project will require zoning variances from the Zoning Board of Appeals. 

For example, the current height of the proposed project is 340 feet, which far exceeds the limits 

set in the Boston’s zoning code.7 Curiously, Oxford Properties is already distancing its project 

from the Leather District and Chinatown, within which it is squarely situated, and instead trying 

to affiliate with the Financial District. According to Oxford Properties’ Project Notification 

Form, the proposed height is meant to be consistent with “other buildings along the Rose 

Kennedy Greenway and within the adjacent Financial District.”8 The purpose of the zoning code 

is to protect “Boston's distinct neighborhoods from the development of buildings or uses that do 

not harmonize with their surrounding context.”9 Yet, in considering the “surrounding context,” 

Oxford Properties chooses to “harmonize” its project with the Financial District rather than the 

heavily residential neighborhoods of the Leather District and Chinatown within which the project 

would be sited. The impact of the proposed high-rise, if allowed by the City, would further 

intrude and gentrify the communities in Chinatown and the Leather District. 

 The purpose of the Chinatown 2010 Master Plan is to set guidelines for development. 

The Master Plan identified low and middle-income units in the neighborhood as a significant 

need. The Master Plan also identified more open spaces and green areas and better air quality as 

some of the core public health concerns of Chinatown’s residents. The Master Plan has set goals 

for the City to conduct assessment studies and find ways to improve local air quality and expand 

open space.10 The scale of Oxford Properties’ proposed project, which might be suitable for the 

the Financial District, is inconsistent with the goals of the Chinatown community and would 

result in increased commuters and traffic in residential Chinatown. For long-time and immigrant 

residents to stay in their homes and communities, Chinatown needs more affordable housing and 

other community resources—not developments that exceed the zoning envelope without careful 

consideration of community needs. 

III. The proposed project will further damage the health and safety of existing 

communities and worsen issues of environmental racism against Asian residents 

 

  The City of Boston has cited Chinatown as having one of the highest density traffic 

crashes in the city due to the neighborhood’s high population density and its location at the 

intersection of major highways and roads. The Massachusetts Turnpike and I-93 intersect at the 

heart of Chinatown, bringing traffic and air pollutants to the neighborhood. Chinatown also has 

one of the highest percentage of workers who walk to work in the city, at 51.4%. A new office 

building in the area would only bring more vehicle and foot traffic. However, without addressing 

any of the health and safety issues imminent to the Chinatown and Leather District communities, 

whose needs include more green spaces, clean air, and safer streets and roads, the proposed 

development at 125 Lincoln would make the area even more harmful to its existing communities.  

                                                           
7 The Boston Redevelopment Authority Zoning Code website, 

https://library.municode.com/ma/boston/codes/redevelopment_authority?nodeId=ART44LEDI 
8 “125 Lincoln Street Project Notification Form” (June 2019) http://www.bostonplans.org/getattachment/a1db10c3-fb81-40e2-

b43a-e9d9efe08285 
9 The Boston Planning and Development Agency website, http://www.bostonplans.org/zoning/what-is-zoning 
10 Chinatown 2020 Master Plan: A Health Lens Analysis (Dec. 2018), http://www.focl-

boston.org/uploads/8/2/7/7/82770312/chinatown_master_ppan_2010.pdf 

https://library.municode.com/ma/boston/codes/redevelopment_authority?nodeId=ART44LEDI
http://www.bostonplans.org/getattachment/a1db10c3-fb81-40e2-b43a-e9d9efe08285
http://www.bostonplans.org/getattachment/a1db10c3-fb81-40e2-b43a-e9d9efe08285
http://www.bostonplans.org/zoning/what-is-zoning
http://www.focl-boston.org/uploads/8/2/7/7/82770312/chinatown_master_ppan_2010.pdf
http://www.focl-boston.org/uploads/8/2/7/7/82770312/chinatown_master_ppan_2010.pdf


5 
 

 

According to a report published earlier this year, Chinatown has the highest concentration 

of vehicle emissions and the worst air quality in Massachusetts. The same study also shows that 

Asian American residents are exposed to 36 percent more harmful pollution particles than white 

residents in the state. Short-term effects of inhaling these particles include asthma and heart 

attacks, and long-term effects include other respiratory and cardiovascular diseases.11 These 

particles also trap heat and lead to higher surface temperatures in the summer. Chinatown and the 

Leather District area has high to very high daytime surface temperature recorded.12 To make the 

matter worse, Chinatown also has one of the least tree canopy coverage in Boston.13 The lack of 

tree canopy coverage and green spaces, as well as issues of air pollution in Chinatown, 

dramatically affect the residents’ health and quality of life. With the proposed construction of a 

34-story office building, an even higher number of commuters and traffic would come in and out 

of the area, bringing in more pollutants that would further intensify the severity of chronic 

pollution issues in Chinatown.  

  

IV. The proposed project will impact opportunities for jobs and small businesses 

accessible to low-income working class families in the neighborhood 

 

Not only is Chinatown a residential area, it is also the cultural and economic hub for 

many Chinese Americans in the Greater Boston area. Many Asian Americans, due to racial 

discrimination and limited English proficiency, are only able to find job opportunities in the 

restaurants and shops in Chinatown. Currently located on the proposed 125 Lincoln Street 

project site are longstanding Chinese supermarket and dim sum restaurant that employ dozens of 

Chinese immigrants and serve as a gathering space for many Asian Americans in Greater 

Boston. Contrary to Oxford Properties’ description in the Project Notification Form of a 

“deteriorated commercial asset,” these community institutions serve important roles for workers 

and the greater Asian American community.  

The proposed project at 125 Lincoln Street would replace the existing restaurant and 

supermarket, leaving dozens of workers unemployed. According to census data for the years of 

2006 to 2010, Chinatown had a poverty rate of 39% and a median household income of less than 

$18,000. In addition, the unemployment rate in Chinatown was 50% higher than the city as a 

whole.14 Replacing the existing supermarket and restaurant would leave more residents 

unemployed and exacerbate issues of poverty in Chinatown. The proposed project could make 

the area even more expensive for small businesses to rent, forcing the current supermarket and 

restaurant out of Chinatown, as well as other small businesses in the area. In addition to engaging 

                                                           
11 Inequitable Exposure to Air Pollution from Vehicles in Massachusetts, Union of Concerned Scientists (June 2019) 

https://www.ucsusa.org/sites/default/files/attach/2019/06/Inequitable-Exposure-to-Vehicle-Pollution-MA.pdf 
12 The Boston Climate Ready Map Explorer, http://boston.maps.arcgis.com/  
13 Trust for Public Land, Climate-Smart Cities website, https://www.tpl.org/how-we-work/climate-smart-cities 
14 United States Census Bureau. (2018) American FactFinder. Retrieved from: 

https://factfinder.census.gov/faces/nav/jsf/pages/index.xhtml 

https://www.ucsusa.org/sites/default/files/attach/2019/06/Inequitable-Exposure-to-Vehicle-Pollution-MA.pdf
http://boston.maps.arcgis.com/apps/View/index.html?appid=7a599ab2ebad43d68adabc9a9ebea0e6&extent=-71.1583,42.2897,-70.9309,42.4060
https://www.tpl.org/how-we-work/climate-smart-cities
https://factfinder.census.gov/faces/nav/jsf/pages/index.xhtml
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community stakeholders to carefully consider the needs of Chinatown residents, Oxford 

Properties should prioritize space for commercial tenants currently at the site.  

 
*** 

The proposed project at 125 Lincoln Street will have a disproportionate impact on the 

Asian American community in Chinatown. A 34-story office building in a community already 

combatting gentrification will only worsen the ongoing housing crisis and add tremendous 

pressures to the many long-time immigrant residents and families. With new construction and 

more commuters coming into the neighborhood, issues of air pollution and traffic will continue 

to plague the health and safety of residents and workers. The project’s goals, vision, and massive 

size will erode the historic, residential, and cultural fabric of Chinatown.   

We urge you to reconsider the project proposal by Oxford Properties and find ways for 

the project to align with the community’s needs and goals. Thank you for your consideration of 

the community’s concerns through this public comment process.  

 

Sincerely, 

 

/s/ Bethany Li 

 

Bethany Li 

Director, Asian Outreach Unit  

Greater Boston Legal Services  
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Michael Sinatra <michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov>

125 Lincoln Street Tower Project – Oxford Properties

Rob Geary Tue, Jul 30, 2019 at 3:06 PM
To: Michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov
Cc: mayor@boston.gov, ed.flynn@boston.gov, Michelle.Wu@boston.gov, 

Dear Mr. Sinatra:

I am writing to express my strong opposition to Oxford Properties’ proposal to build a colossal office tower in the Leather
District.   The lot on which they want to build is totally inappropriate for the scale and intended use of this project.

To the east and southeast of this lot is the national register historic district that has for fifteen years been my home.  The
buildings are low scale, nearly all of them conforming to the 100’ limit set by our city’s zoning.  It is a mixed use
neighborhood, but it is largely residential.  And it is, in fact, a neighborhood. 

To the north and west of the proposed tower is the Chinatown Gateway portion of the Rose Kennedy Greenway.  To
continue be a greenway, and to thrive as such, it must have sunlight.  The proposed structure would block the sunlight for
a major part of the morning.  But the Greenway is more than a garden.  It is open space, a respite from the sense of being
closed in by the city.  Even when it is not casting a shadow directly on the plant life, this tower would still block our view of
the sky and would diminish the quality of the experience of the park to the many families and other residents who use it. 

It would have the same impact on the Leather District.  It is proposed as a sheer vertical massing that fills its entire lot,
with no set-backs, no relief whatsoever from sidewalk to roofline.  It does not conform in any way to it’s historic
surroundings.  And it will be filled each workday with office workers who commute in each morning and commute home at
night, having no stake in the surrounding neighborhood and no stake in our city, treating it merely as a pass-through. 
Lincoln Street is already strained to its limits during rush hour.  This structure will make it unbearable.

There is a plan in place for zoning around the Greenway, and it should be followed. Variances should be granted only for
clear public benefit, not for private profit.  The only benefits from this proposal are for the proponents.

I see no reason to trust these people to keep their word in anything they propose. They have used very deceptive
presentations to hide the real impact of what they are trying to do: graphics that misrepresent the scale of the structure,
graphics that hide the adverse impacts of shadow, wind and traffic, and an endless stream of weasel words; slides that
claim they are the pension fund of some tens of thousands of state and municipal workers, without mentioning that these
workers are not Americans. They have repeatedly told us they have listened to us and incorporated what we wanted in
their plan.  In fact, it was not their plan that have revised, only their talking points.

They have also repeatedly mentioned how they plan to “leverage” the set-aside funding that will be required of a project
that so egregriously exceeds zoning laws for the site, without telling us what they mean by this.  My best guess of this is
that they plan to use the set-aside requirement to fund development of a derelict building they own in Chinatown. So
instead of helping the city with these funds, their plan seems once again to be to line their own pockets.  I only wish I
knew how to spell Hootzpah!

These people would make hundreds of millions of dollars from this project, but very little of it will stay in Boston.  After the
construction work is over, the few security and janitorial jobs the building will generate will barely offset the loss of jobs for
the people who now work at the grocery, restaurants and hair salon currently on the site.

Canada has always been a great neighbor.  Until now. Please encourage these people to go back across the border and
build their awful structure in Halifax or Saskatoon.  I am not willing to have my quality of life, nor that of my neighbors,
sacrificed so that a bunch of foreign interlopers can have a more lavish retirement. 

Please say “No” to this horrendous proposal.

Thank you.

Robert L. Geary
210 Lincoln Street
Leather District
Boston 02111

https://www.google.com/maps/search/210+Lincoln+Street+Leather+District+Boston+02111?entry=gmail&source=g
https://www.google.com/maps/search/210+Lincoln+Street+Leather+District+Boston+02111?entry=gmail&source=g
https://www.google.com/maps/search/210+Lincoln+Street+Leather+District+Boston+02111?entry=gmail&source=g
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Michael Sinatra <michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov>

125 Lincoln

Clifford Gluck Thu, Jun 27, 2019 at 7:54 AM
To: michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov

Dear Mr Sinatra,

This project violates the height restrictions placed along the Greenway, and in no way should be given a variance.  The
design of the building stands in stark contrast to the historic nature of the Leather District architecture, much like the
current City Hall violated the harmony of the West End.  The plan speaks of “linkage” but instead creates a wall between
neighborhoods.  The suggestion that this is a “mixed use” building is absurd.  Out of 630,000 sq ft, 4,000 sq ft are
dedicated to retail, a ratio of 0.63%!  Currently there are vibrant restaurants and a grocery store available to the
neighborhood.   Most of the frontage on Beach Street would be taken up by a garage entrance, making the walk along
Beach St much less inviting to pedestrian traffic.  The traffic and trip calculations would exponentially increase the
pollution and congestion in the neighborhood.   Having attended the meeting last night, the fourth in the proposal series,
there has been an alarming arrogance and lack of responsiveness from the Oxford and the Gensler representatives.  The
neighborhood has been very clear about our concerns; the concerns were not only ignored, but the video “tours” and still
mockups of the building all neglected to show its scale or any honest representation of how it will feel in the space.  Even
the picture on the BPDA website is a skewed view down Lincoln Street from the Surface Road, misrepresenting the scale
of the building.
I oppose this project in its current form, and sincerely hope that we, the voters and the taxpayers will be heard.

Most sincerely, 

Clifford D Gluck, MD FACS
112 Beach St, Unit 1
Boston, MA 02111

Sent from my iPad
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Michael Sinatra <michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov>

Opposition to Oxford Capital Project Proposal for 125 Lincoln Street, Leather
District

George Golabek Mon, Jul 1, 2019 at 9:56 AM
To: Michael.A.Sinatra@boston.gov

Dear Mr. Sinatra,

 

I am writing in opposition to the proposed project for 125 Lincoln Street, in the Leather District.

 

Although I was unable to attend the public meeting on June 26, I did review the presentation
thoroughly.

 

I am a long-time business owner, property owner and building manager in the neighborhood. One
of the things that drew our company to this area was the neighborhood feel which is illustrated by
the relatively small scale of the buildings and vibrancy of residential/commercial mix. I feel the
that Oxford proposal does fit this criteria and would be out of place with the rest of the
neighborhood.

 

I am not opposed to development of that site, but I think that a mixed-use building, with a scale
suitable for the neighborhood is more in keeping with the type of project that should be
considered for that location.

 

Thank you for your consideration.

 

Sincerely,

 

George Golabek

President

Allison Associates

123 South Street

Boston, MA02111

 

www.allisonboston.com

https://www.google.com/maps/search/123+South+Street+Boston?entry=gmail&source=g
https://www.google.com/maps/search/123+South+Street+Boston?entry=gmail&source=g
http://www.allisonboston.com/
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Michael Sinatra <michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov>

125 Lincoln Comment Letter

Rebecca McKevitz Tue, Jul 30, 2019 at 7:22 PM
To: Michael Sinatra <michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov>
Cc: Jesse Brackenbury 

Mike,

Attached please find the Greenway Conservancy's comment letter on Oxford's proposal at 125 Lincoln Street. We look
forward to continuing this conversation and working closely with the BPDA, Oxford and the community as this project
develops.

Thanks very much,

Rebecca McKevitz, ASLA
Capital Projects Manager 
Rose Kennedy Greenway Conservancy
185 Kneeland Street   
Boston, MA 02111

ORGANIC HORTICULTURE  |  FOOD TRUCKS  |  FREE EVENTS  |  FOUNTAINS  |  PUBLIC ART  |  CAROUSEL

Greenway Conservancy 125 Lincoln IAG Comment Letter.pdf
109K

https://www.google.com/maps/search/125+Lincoln+Street?entry=gmail&source=g
https://maps.google.com/?q=185+Kneeland+Street+%C2%A0%C2%A0+Boston,+MA+02111&entry=gmail&source=g
http://www.rosekennedygreenway.org/about-us/organics/
http://www.rosekennedygreenway.org/visit/food/full-mobile-eats-calendar/
http://www.rosekennedygreenway.org/events/
http://www.rosekennedygreenway.org/visit/fountains/
http://www.rosekennedygreenway.org/visit/public-art/
http://www.rosekennedygreenway.org/visit/greenway-carousel/
https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0?ui=2&ik=0cbdb5b592&view=att&th=16c45315f5a8ef14&attid=0.1&disp=attd&realattid=f_jyqg1q9d0&safe=1&zw
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Michael Sinatra <michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov>

125 Lincoln Street Tower Project -Oxford Properties 

Caleb Ho Wed, Jun 12, 2019 at 9:10 AM
To: Michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov
Cc: mayor@boston.gov, ed.flynn@boston.gov, Michelle.Wu@boston.gov, danchen.xu@boston.gov,

Hello Michael and others, 
 
I have lived in the Leather District 20+ years and I love my neighborhood. I love the connections my neighborhood has
established with Chinatown. I am writing to voice my strong opposition to the proposed Oxford tower development at 125
Lincoln Street. 
 
The proposed 370 feet building will significantly damage my neighborhood, enveloping us in shadows. It will bring a
destructive amount of traffic and noise pollution to my neighborhood. It will be an imposing wall, cutting off my
neighborhood from Chinatown and other neighborhoods. The proposed 370 feet building violates the Zoning Code
(Article 44). The proposed 370 feet building contradicts the BPDA’s own Greenway Planning Study for this very site. This
proposed development goes against urban planning as envisioned by my neighborhood and city; that is, developing more
mixed-use (residential and commercial) spaces to bring in more residents to our beautiful city.  
 
I support responsible development that is in line with the 100 feet maximum criteria. I support mixed-use development. I
do not support Oxford’s proposal to plant a 370 feet commercial building in my neighborhood. 
 
Caleb Noël Ho 
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Michael Sinatra <michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov>

125 Lincoln Street Tower Project- IAG Member Letter

Kathryn Friedman Tue, Jul 30, 2019 at 4:47 PM
To: Michael Sinatra <michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov>
Cc: mayor@boston.gov, ed.flynn@boston.gov, Michelle.Wu@boston.gov, Brad Blake <bradsaccount@gmail.com>,
Christopher Betke , "Leff, Drew" , Karen Chen

, Ruth Moy >, Jeena Hah  Suzanne Lee
, Theresa Tsoi , "Dong, Sherry" 

Dear Michael Sinatra,

We the undersigned IAG members are writing in response to the Project Notification Form (PNF) submitted 
on June 7, 2019 by Oxford Properties. The proposal is for a 24-story office tower at 125 Lincoln Street in the 
Leather District, neighboring Chinatown. 
 
The following are our joint concerns about the proposed project at 125 Lincoln Street:
 

The height and massing of the proposed project are out of scale with the surrounding neighborhoods, 
and the project will disrupt the connective ties between Chinatown and the Leather District.
The existing large-scale retail spaces are anchor institutions that serve Chinatown, the Leather 
District, and communities beyond. We need clear commitments from the developer in preserving the 
existing businesses at the current location.
The introduction of a single-use office tower threatens the historic character of Leather District and its 
history as a mixed-use neighborhood. A mix-used building with smaller massing and height is more 
fitting.
The transition of the parcel from mixed-use to only office-use would increase traffic congestion during 
peak weekday hours and result in the loss of meaningful night and weekend activity.
The proposed loading dock and garage entry would compromise Beach Street as a pedestrian 
corridor.
The placement of an office tower amid low- and mid-rise housing would disrupt the residential feel of 
both neighborhoods. Both Chinatown and the Leather District prefer to see this project as an 
extension of our neighborhoods rather than an extension of the Financial District.  We believe that the 
people of Chinatown and the Leather District are what gives this city life and soul. Therefore, it is 
critical that the residential feel is preserved.
The magnitude of the proposed building would create dense shadows on outdoor spaces that serve 
both neighborhoods and on Leather District residences.
The proposed community benefits are not proportional to the size of the project.

 
The 125 Lincoln block has become important to the lives of both communities. To remove that block and 
replace it with an exceedingly tall, barrier-like office tower, will deactivate a critical urban edge and change 
the character of the historic Leather District and the Chinatown Greenway park. It will also leave both 
neighborhoods with a loss of important assets following the burden of a painful construction process.
 

https://www.google.com/maps/search/125+Lincoln+Street?entry=gmail&source=g
https://www.google.com/maps/search/125+Lincoln+Street?entry=gmail&source=g
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Unless there are some drastic changes, in accordance to the needs and concerns of Chinatown and 
Leather District residents and stakeholders, we encourage Oxford Properties to withdraw its current 
proposal.
 
Sincerely,

The Chinatown and Leather District IAG members:
 
Brad Blake
Christopher Betke
Drew Leff
Jeena Hah
Karen Chen
Kathryn Friedman
Ruth Moy
Sherry Dong
Theresa Tsoi
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Michael Sinatra <michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov>

125 Lincoln Street Tower Project- REVISED Letter from IAG Members

Kathryn Friedman Tue, Jul 30, 2019 at 5:29 PM
To: Michael Sinatra <michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov>
Cc: mayor@boston.gov, ed.flynn@boston.gov, Michelle.Wu@boston.gov, Brad Blake ,
Christopher Betke >, "Leff, Drew" >, Karen Chen

 Ruth Moy , Jeena Hah , Suzanne Lee
, Theresa Tsoi >, "Dong, Sherry" 

Dear Michael Sinatra,

We the undersigned IAG members are writing in response to the Project Notification Form (PNF) submitted 
on June 7, 2019 by Oxford Properties. The proposal is for a 24-story office tower at 125 Lincoln Street in the 
Leather District, neighboring Chinatown. 
 
The following are our joint concerns about the proposed project at 125 Lincoln Street:
 

The height and massing of the proposed project are out of scale with the surrounding neighborhoods, 
and the project will disrupt the connective ties between Chinatown and the Leather District.
The existing large-scale retail spaces are anchor institutions that serve Chinatown, the Leather 
District, and communities beyond. We need clear commitments from the developer in preserving the 
existing businesses at the current location.
The introduction of a single-use office tower threatens the historic character of Leather District and its 
history as a mixed-use neighborhood. A mix-used building with smaller massing and height is more 
fitting.
The transition of the parcel from mixed-use to only office-use would increase traffic congestion during 
peak weekday hours and result in the loss of meaningful night and weekend activity.
The proposed loading dock and garage entry would compromise Beach Street as a pedestrian 
corridor.
The placement of an office tower amid low- and mid-rise housing would disrupt the residential feel of 
both neighborhoods. Both Chinatown and the Leather District prefer to see this project as an 
extension of our neighborhoods rather than an extension of the Financial District.  We believe that the 
people of Chinatown and the Leather District are what gives this city life and soul. Therefore, it is 
critical that the residential feel is preserved.
The magnitude of the proposed building would create dense shadows on outdoor spaces that serve 
both neighborhoods and on Leather District residences.
The proposed community benefits are not proportional to the size of the project.

 
The 125 Lincoln block has become important to the lives of both communities. To remove that block and 
replace it with an exceedingly tall, barrier-like office tower, will deactivate a critical urban edge and change 
the character of the historic Leather District and the Chinatown Greenway park. It will also leave both 
neighborhoods with a loss of important assets following the burden of a painful construction process.
 

https://www.google.com/maps/search/125+Lincoln+Street?entry=gmail&source=g
https://www.google.com/maps/search/125+Lincoln+Street?entry=gmail&source=g
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Unless there are some drastic changes, in accordance to the needs and concerns of Chinatown and 
Leather District residents and stakeholders, we encourage Oxford Properties to withdraw its current 
proposal.
 
Sincerely,
 
Chinatown and the Leather District IAG members:
 
Brad Blake
Christopher Betke
Drew Leff
Jeena Hah
Karen Chen
Kathryn Friedman
Ruth Moy
Sherry Dong
Suzanne Lee
Theresa Tsoi
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Michael Sinatra <michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov>

125 Lincoln St Tower Project - Oxford Properties

Scott Johnson Wed, Jun 19, 2019 at 7:58 PM
To: michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov
Cc: mayor@boston.gov, ed.flynn@boston.gov, michelle.wu@boston.gov, danchen.xu@boston.gov,

Hi Michael,

I am writing to express my strong objection to Oxford Properties' plan to build a 370' office tower at 125 Lincoln St.  The
proposed tower is simply too tall, will wall off the Chinatown and Leather District neighborhoods from one another, and do
nothing to improve access to housing in the area.

The BPDA Greenway Planning Study, as well as zoning ordinances, call for a building with a maximum height of 100', in
order to minimize shadows and fit into the surrounding area.  I feel that this plan, which is nearly 4x taller than zoning
allows, is completely inappropriate.

I'm also very concerned about the current businesses in the garage space.  The Hei La Moon restaurant and CMart are
both important to the Chinatown community in particular, and create active use at night and on weekends that serves to
deter crime.  An office building will be virtually unoccupied at those times and will create a sort of urban desert.

While the existing building can certainly use some improvement, it is much more valuable to the neighborhood than
Oxford's proposal.  I'd love to see a mixed use building in this location, with housing and other businesses that would
liven up the neighborhood at all hours.

Thank you for your time and attention, and I appreciate the opportunity to provide comments.

Regards,
Scott Johnson
111 Beach St Unit 3A
Leather District

https://www.google.com/maps/search/125+Lincoln+St?entry=gmail&source=g
https://www.google.com/maps/search/111+Beach+St+Unit+3A+Leather+District?entry=gmail&source=g
https://www.google.com/maps/search/111+Beach+St+Unit+3A+Leather+District?entry=gmail&source=g
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Michael Sinatra <michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov>

125 Lincoln Street Tower Project-Oxford Properties

Jamie Sroczynski Tue, Jul 30, 2019 at 6:17 PM
To: Michael.a.Sinatra@boston.gov
Cc: mayor@boston.gov, ed.flynn@boston.gov, michelle.wu@boston.gov, 

Dear Mr. Sinatra,

I strongly oppose the project proposed by Oxford Proper�es for 125 Lincoln Street.

The residents of the Leather District neighborhood are families and individuals who live, work and pay taxes in the 
city of Boston. The majority of residences are owner-inhabited. There are few parking spots associated with the 
buildings here – neighborhood residents predominantly walk or take public transporta�on to their jobs.  The 
neighborhood has grown safer and cleaner over the past two decades. Small independent businesses and restaurants 
are thriving here. Crime is down. Families with children are staying put instead of fleeing to the suburbs. The 
neighborhood associa�on is strong and has driven posi�ve change throughout the neighborhood while partnering 
with adjacent neighborhoods to forge a strong sense of community. In short, this is the type of neighborhood where 
people want to live and raise families. It should be a model for a city in need or more mixed-use and affordable 
housing op�ons for its ci�zens. Yet, if the BPDA – and the City of Boston – approves the commercial office space 
project proposed for the 125 Lincoln street property by the interna�onal development firm Oxford Proper�es, it will 
directly imperil the future of this neighborhood and irreversibly change it for the worse.  

The 125 Lincoln Street property Oxford Proper�es purchased over two years ago is zoned for 100 feet. This zoning 
standard is appropriate and commensurate with the con�guous residen�al proper�es and neighborhood. This same 
height restric�on on the property site is also called for by the BPDA’s own Greenway Planning Study. It should not be 
changed and Oxford Proper�es should be offered no variance to this height restric�on without direct approval by the 
Leather District Neighborhood Associa�on.   Any development of this parcel should be limited to 100 feet in height 
and dedicated to mixed use or residen�al purposes.

Since Oxford made its purchase of the 125 Lincoln property, it has been an uninvolved and negligent steward for the 
property.  Throughout Oxford’s ownership, trash barrels on the property have regularly overflowed, trash has been 
strewn through the small (public) parking lot con�guous to the market, rats can be seen on a regular basis, graffi� has 
covered many of the external walls, drug dealing and use has been a daily occurrence behind the property; discarded 
syringes have posed a hazard to anyone brave enough to wander down the alley, and a baby was birthed next to the 
dumpster this past winter. For two years, Oxford took no apparent steps to address any of these items – no addi�onal 
ligh�ng, no regular cleaning, no added security, and no improvements to the physical structure of the parking garage. 
In short – it closed its eyes to the neighborhood. Perhaps this was inten�onal – a misguided effort to get the 
neighborhood to accept its monstrous proposal for a misplaced commercial building – I don’t know. However I do 
know that it would be a grave injus�ce for the BPDA to now award Oxford Proper�es for its negligence. 

The developer’s own presenta�on shows the proposed project will have a significant impact on shadows and wind in 
the neighborhood and on the Greenway. Its massive size will dwarf the neighborhood and create a giant physical wall 
between the Leather District and Chinatown neighborhoods.  It will degrade the daily existence of Leather District 
residents and erode the fabric of this emerging neighborhood. The Leather District is NOT the Financial District - and 
should not become an extension of it. The proposed office-only use is completely inconsistent with the successful 
mixed use nature of the Leather District. 

https://www.google.com/maps/search/125+Lincoln+Street?entry=gmail&source=g
https://www.google.com/maps/search/125+Lincoln+street?entry=gmail&source=g
https://www.google.com/maps/search/125+Lincoln+Street?entry=gmail&source=g
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If for some reason the BPDA mistakenly recommends a height and usage variance for this Oxford Proper�es proposal, 
then it should righ�ully be willing to grant the same variance to every property in the neighborhood. Why should this 
interna�onal developer be given the opportunity for deep profits based on a zoning variance when others in the 
same neighborhood are not? In such a case, the BPDA should approve height and size waivers to every property in 
the Leather District and let Boston-resident taxpayers benefit in the same manner as this Canadian property 
developer. 

In the end however, I hope the Oxford proper�es proposal is soundly rejected by the BPDA. It is the wrong project for 
the Leather District neighborhood and the City of Boston. Please send Oxford back to the drawing boards un�l they 
can bring forward a proposal that works for the neighborhood and complies with the height and size requirements 
currently in place for this piece of property.

Sincerely,

Jamie Magnani Sroczynski
70 Lincoln Street, Unit L618
Boston, MA 02111

https://www.google.com/maps/search/70+Lincoln+Street,+Unit+L618+Boston,+MA+02111?entry=gmail&source=g
https://www.google.com/maps/search/70+Lincoln+Street,+Unit+L618+Boston,+MA+02111?entry=gmail&source=g


8/5/2019 City of Boston Mail - 125 Lincoln Street Tower Project – Oxford Properties

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0?ik=0cbdb5b592&view=pt&search=all&permmsgid=msg-f%3A1640542884284160511&simpl=msg-f%3A16405428842… 1/2

Michael Sinatra <michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov>

125 Lincoln Street Tower Project – Oxford Properties 

Jonathan Kannair Tue, Jul 30, 2019 at 11:26 PM
To: Michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov
Cc: mayor@boston.gov, Ed Flynn <ed.flynn@boston.gov>, Michelle.Wu@boston.gov, 

Dear Mr. Sintra,

Since 1996 my wife and I have owned property and lived in Boston’s Leather District. We have raised a child at our
current Leather District address. I also own a business based in the Leather District.

I am writing with respect to the above-referenced proposal now before the Boston Planning & Development Agency
(BPDA).

We attended at least four neighborhood and public meetings on this topic which included extensive presentations
by Oxford Property Group on their proposed redevelopment of 125 Lincoln Stret. While we began this process with an
open mind we are now firmly opposed to this project — along with the majority of other residents and property owners of
both Chinatown and the Leather District.

Our strong opposition is based on a these key facts:

-  This proposal violates the zoning code (Article 44), urban planning with respect to the Leather District and the
BPDA’s own Greenway Planning Study for this site all of which say 80’ by right and 100’ maximum. The Oxford
proposed redevelopment is for 370 feet, or two-thirds of the height of the One Financial skyscraper across from South
Station!

- Oxford is not a good steward of the property on this site which they now own. This property has been poorly
monitored and maintained by Oxford since they purchased it and their gross negligence as an owner in this regard has
been well documented by media reports in the Boston Globe as well as reports by current tenants.

- Oxford has repeatedly demonstrated bad faith in the process. Oxford is proposing a building that would be 370 feet
tall or three times as tall as Lincoln Plaza. They have repeatedly dissembled during public meetings on their critical point
and only when pressed have acknowledged the height. I challenge to you look at the artist renderings included by Oxford
with their proposal at the BPDA and see if you could figure this out from their submitted highly stylized and dishonest
architectural renderings.

- Oxford knew the height restrictions when they purchased the site. They purchased believing that they would get a
blank check from the City of Boston to do what they wanted there, without regard to zoning, previous urban planning
(including by the BPDA for this exact site), expectations for the Greenway and feedback from the neighborhood and those
most impacted by the development.

- The proposed office-only use is completely inconsistent with the successful mixed use (residential /
commercial) of the Leather District. 

-  This project would destroy the quality of life in what has become a vibrant mixed use neighborhood with a
substantial residential population in the heart of the city. It will bathe the Greenway in shadow in the early part of the
day and the Leather District in shadow during the remainder of the day. We can expect increased traffic and wind. It
will become a dead zone for the neighborhood at night instead of contributing to the vitality of this neighborhood. Worst of
all, it will wall the Leather District off from Chinatown, contrary to the stated goals of the BRA’s own Study. 

This is a very poor use of a parcel that is abutting the Greenway. We must do better. We the taxpaying citizens of the
Leather District deserve this proposal to be soundly rejected and without further delay.

Sincerely,

Jonathan Kannair 

cc: The Honorable Martin J. Walsh, Mayor, City of Boston
The Honorable Edward Flynn, Boston City Councilor, District 2
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The Honorable Michelle Wu, Boston City Councilor, At-Large
Christopher G. Betke, Esq., President, Leather District Neighborhood Association
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Michael Sinatra <michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov>

Proposed Project at 125 Lincoln Street

Karen Diane Johnson Tue, Jul 30, 2019 at 5:42 PM
To: "michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov" <michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov>
Cc:

While I applaud real estate development as it brings opportunities a neighborhood, I feel that the project being
proposed by Oxford Properties misses the mark.

As an esteemed investor and operator of Class A commercial buildings, Oxford has an opportunity to create an
amazing opportunity for the neighborhood and build a property that will benefit its investors.  However, the
project Oxford is proposing is of a mass and height that is completely inappropriate for our neighbor and
violates the current laws that govern height restrictions.    If built as proposed, this project will create noise, dirt
and congestion on Lincoln Street and the surrounding streets during its construction then bring unprecedented
traffic to the area as an estimated 4,000 to 5,000 workers flood the already busy area by day.  Furthermore, the
sheer size and mass of the building will cast horrible shadows and consume an entire block, creating a wall
between the Leather District and Chinatown.  At 370 feet, with no setbacks, it totally out of proportion to other
buildings in the neighborhood.

I've seen many of Oxford's other properties and know that they can work with their architects to create a less
imposing structure, one that produces refractive light and is at a scale more appropriate for the neighborhood. 
The design team at Gensler takes its lead from their client.  They're a very talented group and are very capable of
pivoting and producing a structure that is a better fit for the neighborhood.   

The current parking structure occupying the site is a disturbing eyesore.  The back of the property serves as a
gathering point for intravenous drug users, their drug suppliers  and thugs who have been terrorizing the
neighborhood recently.  I'm sure there are prostitutes there as well.  Oxford has owned the property for two
years and instead of seeing an improvement, things have gotten worse.  It is shocking and disappointing to see
this.  So far, they've been a terrible neighbor.  I'm sure their board and investors would agree.

I'd like to see a modern building of an appropriate scale erected.  I'm involved with commercial real estate
professionally and while I don't know the economics of this deal, I've seen enough deals to know that there is a
tremendous opportunity for Oxford to create  a very profitable project under what is lawfully permitted. 
Personally, I would support a modest height variance if Oxford were to bring a project with a space that is
activated 18 hours during the weekdays and on the weekends with high end options.s.  

Innovation is the new buzzword.  Let's see some innovation.

Karen Diane Johnson
Non est optio defectum
Lux et Veritas
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Michael Sinatra <michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov>

125 Lincoln Street Tower Project- Oxford Properties

Kathryn Friedman Mon, Jul 15, 2019 at 11:17 AM
To: Michael Sinatra <michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov>
Cc: mayor@boston.gov, ed.flynn@boston.gov, Michelle.Wu@boston.gov, 

Dear Michael,

After much thought regarding Oxford's proposal for 125 Lincoln Street, here are my official comments:

Oxford Properties’ proposal for a 340’/370’ office tower at 125 Lincoln Street is at odds with the 80’/100’ zoning
restrictions, which were implemented to guide the development of the site. The most recent zoning restrictions were
established in 2009 and were intended to balance the needs of Boston’s residents with the needs of profit-seeking
developers. Oxford’s proposal severely prioritizes the developer and does little to acknowledge the neighborhood in
which the project is sited.  It is critical to note the many adverse conditions that the project will impose upon the
Leather District:

·  Loss of connection with Chinatown

·  Loss of businesses that are used by residents of the Leather District, residents of Chinatown, those with
ties to the Chinatown community, and tourists

·  Loss of night and weekend activity in an area that desperately needs it

·  Loss of sunlight

·  Loss of sky view

·  Loss of parking for both residents and businesses

·  Loss of residential neighborhood feel

·  Gain in wind

·  Gain in solar glare

·  Gain in traffic at already congested times

·  Compromise of Beach Street as a pedestrian corridor

This is an objective look (see climate, traffic, noise, etc. studies in the PNF) at what Oxford’s proposal will do to the
desirability of the Leather District as a place to live and a place to conduct business. The proposed building will not
only have harmful ramifications for those who currently have interests in the Leather District but will also likely reduce
the overall desirability of the neighborhood for future investors, including for the very tenants that Oxford seeks to
attract.

It is important to keep in mind that Oxford’s premise for this project is based solely on a floor area and a proximity to
transit. For them, the connection between site and program can be reduced to information that can easily be found on
a map of Boston. They have overlooked the less tangible factors that cannot be obtained through quick internet
searches. They have ignored the deep-seeded roots of both the Leather District and Chinatown neighborhoods as well
as the current vibrant and interconnected communities that exist on both sides of the site. Introducing an office tower,
which is at odds with the scale and uses of surrounding buildings starts to create a firm delineation at what is now a
fluid neighborhood edge. It is the start of a wall between two distinct but integrated cultures/communities and sets a
frightening trajectory for future development along neighborhood boundaries. Boston is a city which has expressed a
strong desire to reconnect neighborhoods. Is Oxford prepared to proceed with the proposed height, massing, and use

https://www.google.com/maps/search/125+Lincoln+Street?entry=gmail&source=g
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that would disconnect communities and place big business interests over the livability of some of Boston’s oldest and
most storied neighborhoods, or would Oxford consider a mixed-use building with a smaller footprint?

In return for all the losses/gains listed above, the Leather District has been offered ‘privately-owned public space’. This
is not an equitable trade. The project’s benefits to Oxford and their investment portfolio are significant. The project’s
consequences to both the Leather District and Chinatown are also significant. While there has been talk of low-income
housing credits for Chinatown, the offering to the Leather District is a token gesture and one of little need. The
neighborhood already has a ‘privately-owned public space’ at One Financial; it is inaccessible to residents at all
convenient hours and provides no amenities other than a few tables with a nice view. Then there is South Station.
While the building remains open throughout evenings and weekends, the unprogrammed public space has no draw. Is
Oxford prepared to reconsider this aspect of their proposal, engage the Leather District in dialogue about
neighborhood needs, and offer a more significant mitigation option to the community in which they wish to build?

I offer my criticism as both a Leather District resident and as an architect. When developers and designers do not fully
understand the context in which they seek to build, they place undue stress on the public. I see this everyday in my
neighborhood when those who need to access the South Station T or the Greenway are forced to make decisions
about which way to walk around the One Financial building. While commuters usually opt for the shortest path, we are
required to consider wind conditions, traffic conditions, time of day, day of the week, etc. because safety and comfort
are serious factors. The Beach Street corridor is currently one of the few protected entrances/exits into and out of the
Leather District as far as climate and activity. Is Oxford prepared to redesign their proposed building to mitigate the
vulnerability that residents, workers, and visitors to the neighborhood will experience as a result of this project?

My concerns with Oxford’s proposal are too numerous to state in a single succinct letter. The site analysis and
program analysis neglect to understand the short- and long-term impact of the proposed building on both the
immediate surrounding neighborhoods and on the City of Boston. Many of us in the Leather District are prepared to
entertain a project which will fix long-standing concerns of connectivity, climate response, congestion, and accessibility.
We are also willing to entertain a project which will bring meaningful activity to our neighborhood. The current proposal,
however, is an obstacle to every one of these goals. Is Oxford’s team prepared to revisit the context in which they seek
to build and offer a new proposal that solves more urban problems than it creates?

-- 

Kathryn Friedman, Architect
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Michael Sinatra <michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov>

Oxford-125 Lincoln St Proposal

Kelley Betke Thu, Jun 20, 2019 at 9:11 AM
To: "michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov" <michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov>
Cc: "  "danchen.xu@boston.gov" <danchen.xu@boston.gov>,
"ed.flynn@boston.gov" <ed.flynn@boston.gov>, "mayor@boston.gov" <mayor@boston.gov>, "michelle.wu@boston.gov"
<michelle.wu@boston.gov>

Dear Mr. Sinatra: 

 

I am writing to strongly oppose the proposed Oxford Development at 125 Lincoln Street.  It is way too
big for that location.  In fact, both zoning and the 2010 Greenway Planning Study (done by your agency)
indicate that the maximum height should be 100’.  What is being proposed is almost 4x that.  Moreover,
the “office only” use is inappropriate for the mixed residential/commercial use that the Leather District is
known for. 

 

I am the mother of two small children.  My husband and I bucked the trend and have elected to stay and
raise our children in the City and not move to the suburbs.   The City should be taking steps to support
families doing what we are doing.  However, this monstrosity of the building does the exact opposite and
makes us contemplate moving (for the first time).   It will block all views of the sun and sky from my
entire home and cover us all in shadow.  It will wall us off from our downtown neighbors, thus, robbing
us of important interactions that make living in the City unique and special. 

 

We live in the Leather District and not the Financial District.  I urge the BPDA to enforce the zoning law
and its own planning study.   

 

Sincerely,  Kelley Betke

https://www.google.com/maps/search/125+Lincoln+Street?entry=gmail&source=g
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Michael Sinatra <michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov>

Comment on 125 Lincoln Street Tower Project – Oxford Properties

John P. Kim Tue, Jul 30, 2019 at 4:40 PM
To: "Michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov" <Michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov>
Cc: "mayor@boston.gov" <mayor@boston.gov>, "ed.flynn@boston.gov" <ed.flynn@boston.gov>, "Michelle.Wu@boston.gov"
<Michelle.Wu@boston.gov>, "

Hello,

 

I am a resident and property owner in the Leather District in Boston.

 

I am writing to express my complete opposition to the proposed 125 Lincoln Street tower by Oxford Properties.

 

This proposal - as is - does nothing for the Leather District or Chinatown, and only serves to line the pockets of this real
estate developer.

 

It would introduce massive traffic, block out sunlight for much of the day – including for the historic Chinatown Arch -  and
provide literally not a single benefit to the residents of this neighborhood.  It is actively detrimental to residents who live in
these neighborhoods.

 

Additionally, this proposal ignores the current height restrictions on construction along the Greenway, which Oxford
Properties was well aware of when they purchased it.  If they thought they could buy your acquiescence to breaking the
rules just because they want to, I encourage you to send them packing.

 

If you support Oxford Properties in this proposal, you are supporting big business interests without any concern for the
citizens of Boston who live in the Leather District or Chinatown.

 

On the other hand, should Oxford Properties decide to build a building in line with the height restrictions currently in place,
and particularly if they planned on a mixed use building with residential units, they would gain support in this
neighborhood.

 

Thank you.

 

John Kim

https://www.google.com/maps/search/125+Lincoln+Street?entry=gmail&source=g


July 30, 2019

Michael.A Sinatra(~Boston.gov

Michael Sinatra, Project Manager
Boston Planning and Development Agency
One City Hall Sq., 9h Floor
Boston, MA 02201

Dear Mr. Sinatra,

As the owner of a neighborhood barber shop serving the residents and employees in Downtown,
I am excited about the possibility of more customers in the neighborhood.

A new office building by Oxford will be best in class, and improve the foot traffic and increase
the potential customer base in the neighborhood.

The project offers the potential for local small businesses to grow and support their employees.

We look forward to seeing he project advance.

Sincerely.

Au Kiswani
Petra Barber Shop LI.C
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Michael Sinatra <michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov>

125 Lincoln Street Tower Project – Oxford Properties

Tyler Kowalski Wed, Jun 26, 2019 at 10:26 PM
To: Michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov
Cc: mayor@boston.gov, ed.flynn@boston.gov, Michelle.Wu@boston.gov, danchen.xu@boston.gov,

Dear Mr. Sinatra & Members of The BPDA

I support development of the 125 Lincoln Street Property, however I categorically oppose the proposed height of 340+
feet. The current owners, Oxford Properties, purchased this property with full knowledge that the  zoning restrictions limit
development to 100 feet.

"Future additions or redevelopment of this site will be limited to 100’ by the high potential for shadows cast on the park.
Development here should align with the 80’/100’ heights of the existing Leather District fabric and should reinforce the
existing character and scale of the neighborhood."

Despite this Oxford Properties has worked hard to attempt to circumvent these zoning laws in our neighborhood for the
benefit of themselves NOT the Leather District. They have proposed a building that exceeds the limit by 240+ feet, and
have used deceptive marketing tactics to create renderings of the project that employ skewed perspective and scale to
diminish the true height and massing of the building. The current zoning laws should be enforced and not manipulated by
proposing heights that vastly exceed the limit in order to negotiate down to a height that still exceeds the 100 foot zoning
limit. As a resident in the Leather District and a member of the Leather District Neighborhood Association, I attended all
(4) meetings with Oxford to share our overwhelming disapproval of the height. They still have done nothing to address our
concerns. I'm hopeful that the BPDA will adhere to the previous BPDA urban planning studies that have been conducted
for both the Leather District and the Greenway and the enforce the law.

Best,
Tyler 

Tyler Kowalski 

https://www.google.com/maps/search/125+Lincoln+Street?entry=gmail&source=g
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Michael Sinatra <michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov>

125 Lincoln - LDNA position

Christopher Betke Mon, Jul 29, 2019 at 10:22 AM
To: Michael Sinatra <michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov>
Cc: "michelle.wu@boston.gov" <michelle.wu@boston.gov>, Ed Flynn <ed.flynn@boston.gov>, "mayor@boston.gov"
<mayor@boston.gov>

Dear Mr. Sinatra:
 
Please accept this comment on behalf of the Leather District Neighborhood Association (“LDNA”).  The LDNA is
unequivocally opposed to the proposed Oxford project at 125 Lincoln Street as its massing and office only use is
completely out of character with the low-rise/mixed-use buildings in the Leather District.   It is no accident that new
economy, tech businesses like to call the Leather District home.  This massive office-only building will hurt, not help that
economic engine.   Indeed, it is worth noting that at the June 5, 2019 public LDNA meeting, a representative of Oxford
publicly stated (with close to 100 witnesses) that the current use of the parking garage with tenants in the building is
economically viable.
 
No formal urban planning whatsoever is supportive of this out of scale project.  
 
Here is a quick guide to Leather District zoning and planning:  
 
Current - Boston Zoning Law (Article 44 – Leather District) – Maximum height 100 feet.

2010 -  City of Boston Greenway Planning Study (Development THIS SITE - 125 Lincoln Street) -
Because of the length of its frontage on the Greenway, the Lincoln Street Garage Site, if redeveloped, could
profoundly affect the character of the Chinatown Park and the adjacent Beach Street Crossroad. The
southwest corner of the property, in particular, presents a significant challenge to the legibility of the Beach
Street corridor, as the active uses on Beach and Lincoln Streets are segregated from the intersection by a very
active garage entry. Future additions or redevelopment of this site will be limited to 100’ by the high
potential for shadows cast on the park. Development here should align with the 80’/100’ heights of the
existing Leather District fabric and should reinforce the existing character and scale of the neighborhood.

 
1990 Leather District Plan  -  To preserve the scale of the District, the proposed zoning will allow a maximum building
height of eighty (80) feet, (100 feet with design review), and will limit floor area ratios (FAR) to six (6) times the size of the
building lot (8 times with design review). The height may be attained either through new construction or rooftop additions.
 
In other words, to build this here, one has to literally disregard every law or urban planning that came before.  This
building will effectively block the sky to our residents, build a wall between us and our neighbors, bury the Chinatown
Greenway Park in shadow, create additional traffic to the project and significantly increase wind in the area.  
 
Importantly, this building will be in direct violation of the City’s own Greenway Planning Study which stated its objective
was to
 

Preserve the newly created open spaces (environmentally, aesthetically, and
economically) by identifying densities, heights and other building massing criteria that
are compatible with the recreational activities and horticultural life that are being
encouraged to grow there. Activate the broader public realm in and surrounding the
parks by identifying and strategically locating desired uses, particularly at the ground
plane, that will contribute positively to the Greenway. Ensure the long term value of the
public’s investment in creating the Greenway by shaping development to maximize the
quality of the parks and extend their impact beyond its edges and into the Downtown
neighborhoods.

 
This building does none of that.  In fact, it is precisely what the BDPA’s own planning study was intended to prevent.  It
violates the zoning law, violates the Greenway Planning Study for this site and violates any sense of proportion or

https://www.google.com/maps/search/125+Lincoln+Street?entry=gmail&source=g
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common sense in urban design.
 
Further, this site is too small and too close to residential buildings to permit this sort of project.  Essentially, if allowed to
build to physical dimensions of the lot, the City will put residential buildings within less than 100 feet of a massive
construction project.  This represents a clear danger to the residents of those buildings – not to mention an impermissible
encroachment on their quiet enjoyment of life. 
 
The process for this project has been ineffective.  The LDNA has had multiple meetings with the Oxford team, and while
they are nice enough people personally, there has been virtually no change in the proposal to address neighborhood
concerns and issues.   There has been no meaningful attempt by Oxford to mitigate the potential harm to the
neighborhood by this project.   Proposed “public space” is viewed as neither “public” in any meaningful sense nor is it
viewed as any “benefit.”
 
The residents and businesses of the Leather District are not unfortunate bystanders who just happen to be in the way of
this huge, out-sized project proposed by a foreign corporation.  Rather, the Leather District is our home and we lived here
long before Oxford decided to purchase this property knowing full well the zoning limitations on it.  The City should be
supportive and understanding of our concerns – not the other way around.   
 
Thank you for your time and consideration.

 

Very truly yours,

 

Christopher G. Betke, Chair, LDNA  

 

 

CHRISTOPHER G. BETKE

COUGHLIN◦BETKE LLP
Massachusetts | Connecticut | New Hampshire | Rhode Island

 

 

Main Office

175 Federal Street  |  Boston, MA 02110

    

 

  

https://www.google.com/maps/search/175+Federal+Street+%7C+Boston,%0D%0A+MA+02110?entry=gmail&source=g
https://www.google.com/maps/search/175+Federal+Street+%7C+Boston,%0D%0A+MA+02110?entry=gmail&source=g
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Confidential Transmission

The information contained in this electronic mail is intended for the named recipients only.  It may contain privileged and confidential
material.  Any other distribution, copying or disclosure is strictly prohibited.  If you have received this transmission in error, please
notify us immediately by telephone and delete the original transmission without making a copy.
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Michael Sinatra <michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov>

125 Lincoln Street Tower Project - Oxford Properties

Michael Sroczynski Tue, Jul 30, 2019 at 12:38 PM
To: michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov
Cc: mayor@boston.gov, ed.flynn@boston.gov, michelle.wu@boston.gov, 

As a member of the Board of Trustees of the Lincoln Plaza Condominium Association (corner of Lincoln St and Essex St),
I am writing on behalf of the association's 85 unit owners to express the association's strong opposition to the project
proposed by Oxford Properties for 125 Lincoln Street. This project is vastly out of proportion for its location and will bring
irreparable harm to Lincoln Plaza and the Leather District neighborhood if allowed to go forward. It violates existing
zoning standards, urban planning with respect to the Leather District and the BPDA's own Greenway Planning Study for
the site. Any development of this parcel should be limited to 100 feet in height and consistent with the mixed
use/residential nature of the Leather District.We urge the BPDA to reject this proposal outright.

Sincerely,
Michael Sroczynski
Member, Lincoln Plaza Condominium Association Board of Trustees
70 Lincoln Street, Unit L618
Boston, MA 02111

https://www.google.com/maps/search/125+Lincoln+Street?entry=gmail&source=g
https://www.google.com/maps/search/70+Lincoln+Street,+Unit+L618+Boston,+MA+02111?entry=gmail&source=g
https://www.google.com/maps/search/70+Lincoln+Street,+Unit+L618+Boston,+MA+02111?entry=gmail&source=g
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Michael Sinatra <michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov>

125 Lincoln Street Boston,Ma. 02111

christopher Lucy Fri, Jun 21, 2019 at 6:32 PM
To: michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov

Hi Mr.Sinatra I would like to register Complete Support for OXFORD PROPERTIES PROPOSAL FOR THIS SITE.All
existing Tennant's can be relocated,the building services an obselecent purpose in a parking garage which is counter to
environmental and green energy / transportation goals...and Oxford properties is willing to negotiate improvements to the
neighborhood with the L DNA association and the Greenway as well.I hope that this project will be approved Christopher
Lucy (Owner occupant) 107 South Street unit 3B Boston Mass 02111 - 2840

https://www.google.com/maps/search/107+South+Street+unit+3B+Boston+Mass+02111?entry=gmail&source=g


717 Atlantic Avenue, Apt. 3B 
Boston, MA 02111-2814 
mcgee@post.harvard.edu 

617.574.9016 (home) 
 
 

July 30, 2019 

VIA ON-LINE SUBMISSION 

Mr. Michael A. Sinatra 
Boston Planning & Development Agency 
One City Hall, Ninth Floor 
Boston, Massachusetts 02201 

Re: 125 Lincoln Street Proposal 

Dear Mr. Sinatra: 

I am writing with respect to the above-referenced proposal now before the Boston 
Planning & Development Agency (BPDA).  My husband and I have owned property and 
lived in Boston’s Leather District since September 1998.  I have attended at least four 
neighborhood and public meetings on this topic1 that included extensive presentations by 
Oxford Property Group on their proposed redevelopment of 125 Lincoln Street, and I 
entered those meetings with an open mind and ears.  Unlike the representatives of 
Oxford, I was not being paid to be there and attended these meetings out of my limited 
free time, instead of attending to other obligations and activities, in order to better inform 
myself on what was being proposed and to be a good citizen.  I have zero economic 
interest or connection with any alternative proposals for this site.  However, based on 
what I have seen and heard from Oxford over the last seven months and in sitting through 
at least eight hours of neighborhood and BPDA public meetings, I am writing in very 
strong opposition to Oxford’s 125 Lincoln Street proposal. 

Given the unanimous opposition to this proposed development within the Leather 
District, I suspect that you will be hearing separately from many of my neighbors with 
their own concerns.  As a result, I will focus only on a few areas. 

At the outset, I want to make clear that I am not a “NIMBY” nor am I opposed to 
economic development.  I am not in the habit of writing in opposition to proposed real 
estate developments, and I believe this is the first time I have ever written the BPDA on 
any topic.  Indeed, while my home faces Atlantic Avenue / South Station, I have 
supported the proposed South Station Tower, which would directly impact me both in 
terms of shadows, wind and construction disruption and is much higher than what is 
proposed at 125 Lincoln (consistent with zoning for the South Station site across the 

                                                 
1 I attended a Leather District Neighborhood Association (LDNA) meeting where Oxford presented on 125 
Lincoln Street on 2/27/19, 4/24/19 and 6/5/19.  I also attended the BPDA public meeting for the Leather 
District and Chinatown on 6/26/19. 
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street from me).  I am not a zoning zealot, and I know that I have chosen to live in 
downtown Boston and in an urban setting.  Within the Leather District, I most recently 
supported the proposed hotel development at 150 Kneeland Street (formerly the Splash 
Ultra Lounge), which required a significant variance in zoning to proceed based on its 
height.  I did so based on the repeated sensitivity of the developer of that site to 
neighborhood issues and concerns as well as my belief that, due to the parcel size, the 
distressed property would not otherwise be re-developed but for the zoning variance. 

I was Assistant Secretary for Policy and Planning in the Executive Office of 
Economic Development for Governor Deval Patrick from 2007 to 2012, and I well 
understand and support the need for reasonable real estate development and the necessary 
ingredients to contribute to a vital business environment and a robust commercial 
taxpayer base in Boston.  This is all by way of saying I am not a NIMBY opponent, and I 
believe the Leather District has shown itself to be imminently reasonable over the last 
two decades that I have lived here with respect to proposed developments in the 
neighborhood. 

 

1.  This building proposal would violate the BRA / BPDA’s own 2010 
Greenway Planning District Study for this very site. 

Many of us in the Leather District lived here during the Central Artery / Tunnel 
project (the “Big Dig”).  Construction and staging was done here 24 hours a day, every 
day.  I lived through all of this disruption and noise and watched as little thought or effort 
was made to address neighborhood concerns because the project was over budget and 
behind schedule.  We understood that our sacrifice was necessary for the greater good, 
and in meetings with the City, we were repeatedly told that the social contract was that 
downtown residents who suffered through the noise, the traffic, the dirt, the lack of 
parking, etc. would end up with a beautiful park – a Greenway – at the end of it all. 

After billions in federal and state funds were invested on the Big Dig, one concern 
was that, after it was complete, private interests would potentially try to capture all of the 
lots adjacent to the Greenway and essentially take the public investment for themselves 
by building large projects on lots now made attractive by significant public investment 
and by the patient suffering of those immediate abutters who lived through the disruption 
of the Big Dig for many years.  It was an understandable concern that large developments 
would negatively impact this new public space, and that the public good from the 
massive public expenditure would be lost. 

With this all in mind, in 2010, your predecessor agency, the Boston 
Redevelopment Authority (BRA), undertook the Greenway Planning District Study, 
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collaborating with many architects, urban planners and neighborhood groups.2  Its stated 
objective was: 

“To create a set of guidelines specifically for these parcels adjacent to the 
Greenway and to establish design controls which achieve the following goals: 

 Preserve the newly created open spaces (environmentally, aesthetically, 
and economically) by identifying densities, heights and other building 
massing criteria that are compatible with the recreational activities and 
horticultural life that are being encouraged to grow there. 

 Activate the broader public realm in and surrounding the parks by 
identifying and strategically locating desired uses, particularly at the 
ground plane, that will contribute positively to the Greenway. 

 Ensure the long term value of the public’s investment in creating the 
Greenway by shaping development to maximize the quality of the parks 
and extend their impact beyond its edges and into the Downtown 
neighborhoods.” 

As was stated in the BRA’s Greenway Planning District Study: “Currently, these 
plots are subject to one or more zoning districts and overlays that do not account for the 
presence of the Greenway as one of Boston’s most significant new open space assets.”  
The planning was intended to “Balance the development pressures in the Greenway 
District with other growth areas and development opportunities in the City as a whole.” 

The method employed by the BRA for this study was: 

“After an initial Greenway-wide analysis of the existing conditions, hypothetical 
development scenarios were created at multiple scales and degrees of intervention.  
These development options were tested using a four-pronged approach for measuring the 
impacts and appropriateness of these development scenarios.  Each of the four analytical 
tools employed – Urban Design and Form, Environmental Conditions, Program and Use, 
and Economics – has the ability to greatly impact the way in which people utilize spaces 
along the Greenway….  What emerged from this study was the conclusion that new 
development alone will account for an important but relatively small percentage of the 
entire population that will be living and working near the Greenway.  It is therefore 
important that the Greenway is able to engage the bulk of the people who are already in 
the Downtown, change their behavior and attract a new regional audience who will view 
the Greenway as a special destination.” 

                                                 
2 http://www.bostonplans.org/planning/planning-initiatives/greenway-district-planning-study 
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This was not just a theoretical or abstract planning exercise.  Indeed, the 125 
Lincoln Street Garage, which Oxford now owns and proposes to redevelop, was 
extensively examined and was a specifically-cited case study by the BRA.  One of the 
stated goals for the Chinatown / Leather District development was to: “Promote 
continuity and reinforce the neighborhood scale along the Beach Street Crossroad.”  
Notably, it was not to build a giant and towering office building to wall off the Leather 
District from Chinatown and the Financial District. 

Among other conclusions in the BRA Greenway study, it states,  

“Because of the length of its frontage on the Greenway, the Lincoln Street Garage 
Site, if redeveloped, could profoundly affect the character of the Chinatown Park and the 
adjacent Beach Street Crossroad.  The southwest corner of the property, in particular, 
presents a significant challenge to the legibility of the Beach Street corridor, as the active 
uses on Beach and Lincoln Streets are segregated from the intersection by a very active 
garage entry.  Future additions or redevelopment of this site will be limited to 100’ by 
the high potential for shadows cast on the park.  Development here should align with 
the 80’/100’ heights of the existing Leather District fabric and should reinforce the 
existing character and scale of the neighborhood.” (bold italics mine) 

This Greenway District Planning Study is not something lost in the distant mists 
of time.  It’s on your own website right now.  It was completed in spring 2010 and 
adopted by the BRA Board on 7/20/2010.  Seven public meetings were held in City Hall 
to solicit input from the City’s residents.  Not to belabor the obvious, but the BPDA 
should adhere to what is in this Study.  To do otherwise would be to reject all of the hard 
work the BRA did on this, collaborating with many who spent many volunteer hours 
participating, and it would seriously call into question any future planning efforts by the 
BPDA that sought the participation or buy-in by those who live in Boston.  Why would 
anyone choose to participate or believe in future commitments, if they could be easily 
abandoned soon thereafter when a developer with big pockets came along?  The height 
restrictions for this site are and should remain 100 feet at a maximum. 

 

2. Oxford is not a good steward of what is there now. 

If you sense a great deal of frustration from members of the community, it’s also 
because Oxford hasn’t even bothered to appropriately maintain what is there now, while 
professing to be a fantastic steward of its real estate holdings and delivering a world-class 
experience for tenants and the neighborhood.  Even after repeated feedback from Leather 
District residents at many meetings, Oxford has allowed significant trash to accumulate 
on the site, and they have let it become a derelict eyesore for its neighbors.  The site is so 
poorly monitored and maintained by Oxford that, since they purchased it, a baby was 
born to a homeless drug addict living unnoticed behind a dumpster on the property, as 
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covered by the Boston Globe.3  It seems as if this is a cynical ploy by Oxford to try to 
make the property even more blighted in order that the City of Boston will approve their 
zoning variance request to build there and that the neighborhood would then acquiesce to 
anything they proposed.  This would simply be rewarding bad behavior, and it shouldn’t 
be tolerated by Mayor Walsh or the BPDA. 

 

3. Oxford has repeatedly demonstrated bad faith in the process. 

Oxford is proposing a building that would be 370 feet tall.  Folks could be 
forgiven for barely understanding that, because we spent at least two meetings and four 
exhausting hours of presentations by Oxford that focused on artist illustrations and 
diagrams of just the first floor.  When they eventually did bring diagrams, they presented 
them in a manner that deliberately disguised the height and scale of what is being 
proposed and made the new proposed building look close in height to what is across the 
street.  It is not.  Lincoln Plaza across the street is only 90 feet tall, consistent with other 
buildings in the Leather District.  The Oxford proposed building at 125 Lincoln would be 
370 feet tall, or three times as tall as Lincoln Plaza.  I challenge to you look at the artist 
renderings included by Oxford with their proposal at the BPDA and see if you could 
figure this out from their submitted renderings.   

They have ostensibly listened to hours of neighborhood feedback on this proposal 
and, while purporting to reflect that in their proposal, have made zero changes from what 
they initially proposed.  I believe the many artist renderings and deceptive and distorted 
angles intended to disguise the full height and scale of the building in neighborhood 
meetings was not by accident.  Oxford knows that the building is out of scale and context 
for the neighborhood.  Otherwise, they would simply show us what the proposed building 
would really look like if built. 

I cannot speak for my neighbors, but I harbored no ill will towards Oxford when I 
first heard of this proposal, and from what I have seen of its other properties in Boston 
and elsewhere, I respect their capacity as real estate developers.  I cannot blame them for 
swinging for the fences on this and asking for something well beyond what is permitted 
for the site.  But they have consistently demonstrated bad faith in meetings with the 
neighborhood and have frittered away any reservoir of good will that I or others might 
have had for them.  They only have themselves to blame for this. 

 

                                                 
3 The Boston Globe, “Under a Dark Sky, a Baby is Born” by Evan Allen, December 18, 2018. 
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4.  Oxford knew the height restrictions when they purchased the site.  If they 
cannot redevelop within those parameters, they should cut their losses and 
sell to someone who can and will. 

One of the more disingenuous arguments that Oxford has repeatedly made is that, 
given the imbedded value / income-producing assets from tenants on the site now, and 
the amount of time for construction (when that income would be foregone) and the 
significant costs of construction, they would need to build to their desired height and 
mass in order for redevelopment to be economically feasible and for the numbers to 
pencil out.  This is pretty outrageous.  Oxford knew what the height restrictions were 
when they purchased the property in 2017, and they purchased believing that they could 
get a blank check from the City of Boston to do what they wanted there, without regard to 
zoning, previous urban planning (including by the BPDA for this exact site), expectations 
for the Greenway and feedback from the neighborhood and those most impacted by the 
development.  This is a bit like someone murdering their parents and then claiming they 
deserve special sympathy and treatment because they’re now an orphan.   

Oxford Properties knew the height restrictions that were on the property when 
they acquired it, and since, by their own repeated statements to us in neighborhood 
meetings, they cannot afford to redevelop the site unless the BPDA essentially throws 
away any zoning laws for the site, Oxford should cut its losses and sell the site to 
someone who can and will redevelop the site (if so desired, preferably for something 
mixed use or entirely residential) responsibly and appropriately. 

 

This oversized, 625,00 square feet project violates the zoning code (Article 44), 
urban planning with respect to the Leather District and the BRA / BPDA’s own 
Greenway Planning Study for this exact site all of which state that it is restricted to 80 
feet by right and 100 feet maximum in height.  The Oxford proposed redevelopment is 
for 370 feet, or two-thirds of the height of the One Financial skyscraper across from 
South Station!  The proposed office-only use is completely inconsistent with the 
successful mixed use (residential / commercial) of the Leather District.  It will bathe the 
Greenway in shadow in the early part of the day and the Leather District in shadow 
during the remainder of the day.  We can expect increased traffic and wind.  It will 
become a dead zone for the neighborhood at night instead of contributing to the vitality 
of this increasingly residential neighborhood.  And, worst of all, it will wall the Leather 
District off from Chinatown, contrary to the stated goals of the BRA’s own Study.  This 
is a very poor use of a parcel that is abutting the Greenway.  We can and should do better, 
and the taxpaying citizens of the Leather District deserve for this proposal to be rejected 
soundly and without further delay. 
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I would be happy to discuss this further with you if you wish.  Thank you in 
advance for the opportunity to state my very strong opposition to Oxford’s proposed 
redevelopment at 125 Lincoln Street.   

Very truly yours, 

/s/ C. Stanley McGee 
 

C. Stanley McGee 
 
 
cc: The Honorable Martin J. Walsh, Mayor, City of Boston 
 The Honorable Edward Flynn, Boston City Councilor, District 2 
 The Honorable Michelle Wu, Boston City Councilor, At-Large 
 Danchen Wu, City of Boston Neighborhood Services Leather District Liaison 

Mr. Jesse Brackenbury, Executive Director, Rose Kennedy Greenway 
Conservancy  
Christopher G. Betke, Esq., President, Leather District Neighborhood Association 

 
 



July 26,2019

Michael Sinatra, Project Manager
Boston Planning and Development Agency
One City Hall Sq., 9* Floor
Boston, MA 02201

Dear Mr. Sinatra,

As a Boston resident, I vrite in support of the proposed project at 125 Lincoln
Street. The project offers a tremendous opportunity to transform the site from
an outdated, open air parking garage to a well-designed office building with ground
floor retail and significant programmable public space.

There is a strong demand for office space in Boston and a limited amount of new
construction in our downtown core. This site represents one of the few remaining
properties that can support a new office tower in Downtown Boston. Its proximity to
South Station, a city and regional transit hub, along with access to MBTA train and
bus lines and connection to major highways makes this location ideal for job creation.

Additionally, the project will create new affordable housing, expand and enhance
coimections to the Rose Kennedy Greenway, and improve the public
realm. This proposal provides a significant economic opportunity for the city.

^ I'} . "S.C ^ ^ f
Name

Address

. Q O

City, State, zip

Signature
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Michael Sinatra, Project Manager
Boston Planning and Development Agency
One City Hall Sq., 9"^ Floor
Boston, MA 02201

Dear Mr. Sinatra,

As a Boston resident, I write in support of the proposed project at 125 Lincoln
Street. The project offers a tremendous opportunity to transform the site from
an outdated, open air parking garage to a well-designed office building with ground
floor retail and significant programmable public space.

There is a strong demand for office space in Boston and a limited amount of new
construction in our downtown core. This site represents one of the few remaining
properties that can support a new office tower in Downtown Boston. Its proximity to
South Station, a city and regional transit hub, along with access to MBTA train and
bus lines and connection to major highways makes this location ideal for job creation.

Additionally, the project will create new affordable housing, expand and enhance
connections to the Rose Kennedy Greenway, and improve the public
realm. This proposal provides a significant economic opportunity for the city.

Name

C.ouptr SX. ^p4 ̂ 3
Address

, N\/\ OM
City, State, zip

i^natur?'"
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Michael Sinatra, Project Manager
Boston Planning and Development Agency
One City Hall Sq., 9* Floor
Boston, MA 02201

Dear Mr. Sinatra,

As a Boston resident, I write in support of the proposed project at 125 Lincoln
Street. The project offers a tremendous opportunity to transform the site from
an outdated, open air parking garage to a well-designed office building with groimd
floor retail and significant programmable public space.

There is a strong demand for office space in Boston and a limited amount of new
construction in our downtown core. This site represents one of the few remaining
properties that can support a new office tower in Downtown Boston. Its proximity to
South Station, a city and regional transit hub, along with access to MBTA train and
bus lines and connection to major highways makes this location ideal for job creation.

Additionally, the project will create new affordable housing, expand and enhance
connections to the Rose Kennedy Greenway, and improve the public
realm. This proposal provides a significant economic opportunity for the city.

Name

Z 7^ L \WJ l\V^ .
Address

City, State, zip
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Michael Sinatra, Project Manager
Boston Planning and Development Agency
One City Hall Sq., 9*^ Floor
Boston, MA 02201

Dear Mr. Sinatra,

As a Boston resident, I write in support of the proposed project at 125 Lincoln
Street. The project offers a tremendous opportunity to transform the site from
an outdated, open air parking garage to a well-designed office building with ground
floor retail and significant programmable public space.

There is a strong demand for office space in Boston and a limited amount of new
construction in our downtown core. This site represents one of the few remaining
properties that can support a new office tower in Downtown Boston. Its proximity to
South Station, a city and regional transit hub, along with access to MBTA train and
bus lines and connection to major highways makes this location ideal for job creation.

Additionally, the project will create new affordable housing, expand and enhance
connections to the Rose Kennedy Greenway, and improve the public
realm. This proposal provides a significant economic opportunity for the city.

Name

Address

City, ̂ te, zi|

ature
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Michael Sinatra, Project Manager
Boston Planning and Development Agency
One City Hall Sq., 9*^ Floor
Boston, MA 02201

Dear Mr. Sinatra,

As a Boston resident, I write in support of the proposed project at 125 Lincoln
Street. The project offers a tremendous opportunity to transform the site from
an outdated, open air parking garage to a well-designed office building with ground
floor retail and significant programmable public space.

There is a strong demand for office space in Boston and a limited amount of new
construction in our downtown core. This site represents one of the few remaining
properties that can support a new office tower in Downtown Boston. Its proximity to
South Station, a city and regional transit hub, along with access to MBTA train and
bus lines and connection to major highways makes this location ideal for job creation.

Additionally, the project will create new affordable housing, expand and enhance
connections to the Rose Kennedy Greenway, and improve the public
realm. This proposal provides a significant economic opportunity for the city.

Name

Bird

Address

0^ t'Z-S"

City, State, zip

Signature
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Michael Sinatra, Project Manager
Boston Planning and Development Agency
One City Hall Sq., 9^^ Floor
Boston, MA 02201

Dear Mr. Sinatra,

As a Boston resident, I write in support of the proposed project at 125 Lincoln
Street. The project offers a tremendous opportunity to transform the site from
an outdated, open air parking garage to a well-designed office building with ground
floor retail and significant programmable public space.

There is a strong demand for office space in Boston and a limited amount of new
construction in our downtown core. This site represents one of the few remaining
properties that can support a new office tower in Downtown Boston. Its proximity to
South Station, a city and regional transit hub, along with access to MBTA train and
bus lines and connection to major highways makes this location ideal for job creation.

Additionally, the project will create new affordable housing, expand and enhance
connections to the Rose Kennedy Greenway, and improve the public
realm. This proposal provides a significant economic opportunity for the city.

Name

Address

A| n- On 2 s
-  !iPCity, St^e, zip
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Michael Sinatra, Project Manager
Boston Planning and Development Agency
One City Hall Sq., 9"^ Floor
Boston, MA 02201

Dear Mr. Sinatra,

As a Boston resident, I write in support of the proposed project at 125 Lincoln
Street. The project offers a tremendous opportunity to transform the site from
an outdated, open air parking garage to a well-designed office building with ground
floor retail and significant programmable public space.

There is a strong demand for office space in Boston and a limited amount of new
construction in our downtown core. This site represents one of the few remaining
properties that can support a new office tower in Downtown Boston. Its proximity to
South Station, a city and regional transit hub, along with access to MBTA train and
bus lines and connection to major highways makes this location ideal for job creation.

Additionally, the project will create new affordable housing, expand and enhance
cormections to the Rose Kennedy Greenway, and improve the public
realm. This proposal provides a significant economic opportunity for the city.

Name

Address ^

Cjty, Stat^zip

Signatur
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Michael Sinatra, Project Manager
Boston Planning and Development Agency
One City Hall Sq., 9'^ Floor
Boston, MA 02201

Dear Mr. Sinatra,

As a Boston resident, I write in support of the proposed project at 125 Lincoln
Street. The project offers a tremendous opportunity to transform the site from
an outdated, open air parking garage to a well-designed office building with ground
floor retail and significant programmable public space.

There is a strong demand for office space in Boston and a limited amount of new
construction in our downtown core. This site represents one of the few remaining
properties that can support a new office tower in Downtown Boston. Its proximity to
South Station, a city and regional transit hub, along with access to MBTA train and
bus lines and connection to major highways makes this location ideal for job creation.

Additionally, the project will create new affordable housing, expand and enhance
connections to the Rose Kennedy Greenway, and improve the public
realm. This proposal provides a significant economic opportunity for the city.

Name '

Address

rK-rKi»j4-fr
City,

Signature
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Michael Sinatra, Project Manager
Boston Planning and Development Agency
One City Hall Sq., 9-^ Floor
Boston, MA 02201

Dear Mr. Sinatra,

As a Boston resident, I write in support of the proposed project at 125 Lincoln
Street. The project offers a tremendous opportunity to transform the site from
an outdated, open air parking garage to a well-designed office building with ground
floor retail and significant programmable public space.

There is a strong demand for office space in Boston and a limited amount of new
construction in our downtown core. This site represents one of the few remaining
properties that can support a new office tower in Downtown Boston. Its proximity to
South Station, a city and regional transit hub, along with access to MBTA train and
bus lines and connection to major highways makes this location ideal for job creation.

Additionally, the project will create new affordable housing, expand and enhance
connections to the Rose Kennedy Greenway, and improve the public
realm. This proposal provides a significant economic opportunity for the city.

Name

T 1 XrDqOO\^ sT
Address '

fXt 02-1
City, State, zip

i\4^
Signature
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Michael Sinatra, Project Manager
Boston Planning and Development Agency
One City Hall Sq., 9-^ Floor
Boston, MA 02201

Dear Mr. Sinatra,

As a Boston resident, I write in support of the proposed project at 125 Lincoln
Street. The project offers a tremendous opportunity to transform the site from
an outdated, open air parking garage to a well-designed office building with ground
floor retail and significant programmable public space.

There is a strong demand for office space in Boston and a limited amount of new
construction in our downtown core. This site represents one of the few remaining
properties that can support a new office tower in Downtovm Boston. Its proximity to
South Station, a city and regional transit hub, along with access to MBTA train and
bus lines and connection to major highways makes this location ideal for job creation.

Additionally, the project will create new affordable housing, expand and enhance
connections to the Rose Kennedy Greenway, and improve the public
realm. This proposal provides a significant economic opportunity for the city.

Name

Q-'-\ C-,7<.g-./^orvAr,s-V
Address

City; State, zip

Signature
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Michael Sinatra <michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov>

125 Lincoln Tower: project Oxford Properties

Christopher Myers Tue, Jul 30, 2019 at 9:46 PM
To: Michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov
Cc: mayor@boston.gov, ed.flynn@boston.gov, michelle.wu@boston.gov, , shirley leung
<shirley.leung@globe.com>

Dear Michael, 

We are residents in Boston’s Leather District and we are writing to express our strong opposition to the building under
proposal by Oxford Properties at 125 Lincoln Street. We are in opposition to this project not because we are  knee jerk
opponents of urban development. Not nearly. We are business owners with interests all over Boston. We are not against
aggressive development in any way as long as it makes sense. By making sense we mean that burgeoning business
interests must take into account the totality of a neighborhood, its population’s wishes, and it’s necessary for new
construction to have visual kinship with the extant architecture.  The Oxford Properties project proposes a ridiculous
relationship with neighboring architecture by being in excess of not only what the law permits, but by exceeding that legal
limit BY A FACTOR OF THREE.  

We have lived on the corner of Lincoln and Kneeland streets for 21 years. In all humility, we feel we possess a fair
understanding of the flavor of what makes this area work for the residents and families and business owners that
constitute the Leather District. This neighborhood invites development. However, the proposed building is too tall,
grotesquely out of balance, for the location, is out of character with the low-rise mixed use of the Leather District, will
create unwanted shadow and window effects, will grossly increase traffic, and most importantly this will effectively wall off
the Leather District from its neighbors.  This building possesses a massive difference in scale and would create a jarring
and unnatural effect with the residential buildings that have existed here for decades.  This neighborhood was not meant
to stage such a large construction project.  Please do not permit this massive project to go forward. If anyone in the city’s
planning offices attended any of the neighborhood’s meetings, they would have heard, without exaggeration, universal
opposition to this project, voiced by the hundreds of people that turned out for the tone deaf delivery of Oxford Properties.
We attended all three gatherings, and it would appear that just about every resident of the Leather District feels fervently
that this location needs to be renovated. We applaud the new owners direction for new development. However, their
proposal is simply too large by a considerable amount. 

Thank you for your attention to this communication. 

Christopher Myers and Joanne Chang. 
210 Lincoln St, Apt 501
Boston MA 02111
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Michael Sinatra <michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov>

125 Lincoln Street Tower Project – Oxford Properties

Ogi Ogas Sun, Jun 23, 2019 at 11:57 AM
To: Michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov
Cc: mayor@boston.gov, Michelle.Wu@boston.gov, danchen.xu@boston.gov, 

Mr. Sinatra:

I am a resident of the Lincoln Plaza condominiums in the Leather District, where I live with my wife and one year old son.
My wife and I made the conscious decision to have and raise a child in the city instead of moving out to the suburbs
because over the past ten years our neighborhood has undergone a dramatic transition from a highly urban, gritty, and
somewhat unsafe environment with exceedingly few families to a very family-friendly environment with vibrant parks
(especially the Greenway, Dewey Square, and Chinatown Park), many family-oriented businesses and attractions, and
most importantly, a safe neighborly environment where people recognize one another on the street and know one
another's children. When I moved into my building in 2006, there was a single family. Today, there are at least 2 dozen
children in Lincoln Plaza. 

The Leather District has always been a mixed use community, and today we are finally seeing this mixed-use history
flower into a dynamic, prosperous, and safe neighborhood. In my opinion, it is the presence of families which grounds a
community and makes it a neighborhood rather than an urban district. This was the dream of what would happen after the
Big Dig, and it is indeed happening all around us. 

The proposed office tower from Oxford would drop a boulder on that dream. 

First of all, the massive tower will serve as a wall--just like the expressway was before the Big Dig--cutting off the Leather
District from the Greenway and Chinatown. The whole point of the Big Dig was to knit communities back together, and the
Greenway serves as the main stitch; the Oxford tower not only blocks access from one side of the Greenway to the other,
it will put the Greenway in perpetual shadow, preventing most of the plants and foliage (the "green" of the Greenway)
from growing. It will also place the waterfall and the Chinatown park, areas that are now very popular with families, in
perpetual darkness. My wife and I donate money each year to the Greenway because we want our son and future
children to be able to enjoy this beautiful park. Oxford's project undercuts everything that we've been investing in to make
our neighborhood hospitable to families.

Second of all, one of the reasons that the Leather District and surrounding areas have become so safe is because there
are finally businesses, restaurants, and destinations here that are open in the evenings and on weekends. The most
dangerous and homeless-populated location near the Leather District right now is the gigantic Financial One office tower,
which is deserted on the evenings and weekends and therefore attracts undesirable activities. The Oxford tower proposal
only offers access during weekday business hours, which means that it will become as unpopulated and dangerous as
Financial One during those times when families are most likely to be out and about in the neighborhood.

Third of all, the traffic. As you know, traffic throughout Boston has reached crisis proportions, and the traffic on Lincoln
Street is particularly awful because it is an onramp into the city from 93. During rush hour, it is very dangerous to cross,
as cars constantly double-park on Lincoln Street while other drivers try to get down Lincoln Street as fast as they can,
ignoring the many pedestrian crosswalks. As someone who pushes a stroller across Lincoln Street virtually every day, I
can tell you that it always requires a parent to be completely vigilant. If you add another 4,000 commuters onto a street
that is already far beyond its capacity, along with a loading dock and massive delivery trucks, its a recipe for injury to
children. The Leather District has spent tremendous effort over the past decade and a half to make Lincoln Street more
safe for residents--limiting double-parking, getting rid of idling trucks and illegal bus stops, calling for improvements to the
previously pothole-riddling Lincoln Street and its cross streets--and adding the Oxford office tower feels like it one swoop
its going to undermine all the advances we have made in rendering Lincoln Street reasonably safe for families.

This is the Leather District, not the Financial District. This is no place for a monster commercial tower that goes against
everything this neighborhood stands for and has suffered through to make this a desirable place to live. It feels like
everything that the people who have lived here for the past 2 decades and worked so hard to build is now being exploited
by a multinational corporate real estate developer to make money at our expense. I believe there was a contract that the
city made with our neighborhood and other neighborhoods around the Big Dig that if we all suffered through the Big Dig
that it would become a family-friend neighborhood afterwards. My wife and I bought into the contract, and now that we're
finally able to reap the rewards of everyone's intense labor, outside interests with no stake in the neighborhood are
swooping in without even attempting to adjust to the needs and realities of our mixed-use, family-oriented community. 
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I urge you to block Oxford's development project as currently proposed. 

Dr. Ogi Ogas
(
70 Lincoln Street #213
Boston, MA 02111

https://www.google.com/maps/search/70+Lincoln+Street+%23213+Boston,+MA+02111?entry=gmail&source=g
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Michael Sinatra <michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov>

Do NOT approve the 125 Lincoln St. Tower Project by Oxford Properties

Hans Oh Mon, Jul 29, 2019 at 11:59 PM
To: Michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov
Cc: mayor@boston.gov, ed.flynn@boston.gov, Michelle.Wu@boston.gov, 

Dear Mr. Sinatra,

I am a resident and unit owner at 111 Beach St. and am writing to share my comment regarding the proposed tower
project by Oxford Properties at 125 Lincoln St.

I am writing to express my opposition to the proposal as it will negatively impact the surrounding neighborhood in
Chinatown and the Leather District. If approved, this tower will undue all of the progress that has been made to improve
the area.

Specifically, the proposed tower violates the zoning code (Article 44) and approved urban plan regarding the Leather
District and the BPDA's own Greenway Planning Study. Both re-enforce the standard of 80' by right and a 100' maximum.

The Oxford plan is 370'. That is nearly *four times* the zoning code and a significant departure from the intent of the city
plan.

Further, the Oxford plan for the monstrous tower is for office-only use which is inconsistent with the mixed-use approach
of combining both residential and commercial development in the Leather District and Chinatown. This proposed tower
will overwhelm the area and cause shadows in both the early and latter parts of the day resulting in increased traffic
congestion, wind, and other negative effects.

More critically, the proposed tower would hamper access to the surrounding areas between South Station and Chinatown,
the Financial District and the Leather District, and so on.

I am not against development that enriches the fabric of our wonderful city. However, developers must respect the plan
and standards in place especially if it impacts the lives of residents.

To re-iterate, I am wholly OPPOSED to the Oxford proposal for a 370' tower as it violates the city plan and does not
improve the neighborhood for those who live in and around the Leader District and Chinatown.

I hope you will place the needs and wishes of the residents of Boston over the commercial interests of a multi-national
corporation.

Sincerely,
Hans Oh

**********
Hans Oh

https://www.google.com/maps/search/125+Lincoln+St?entry=gmail&source=g


7/9/2019 City of Boston Mail - 125 Lincoln Street Tower Project – Oxford Properties

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0?ik=0cbdb5b592&view=pt&search=all&permmsgid=msg-f%3A1638536001670399534&simpl=msg-f%3A16385360016… 1/3

Michael Sinatra <michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov>

125 Lincoln Street Tower Project – Oxford Properties

mark oldham Mon, Jul 8, 2019 at 7:49 PM
To: Michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov
Cc: mayor@boston.gov, ed.flynn@boston.gov, Michelle.Wu@boston.gov, danchen.xu@boston.gov,

Comments in opposition to the current proposal for 125 Lincoln Street
 
Stewards of our cherished urban fabric
 

As elected officials you and your team at the BPDA are employed to serve as representatives of city residents and
act as stewards of our city and the resources we collectively share.
When you do your jobs well and with courage you can (and have) created great benefit to the city - think of the
Greenway and all the positive impact it has fostered. Thank you.
When you don’t show the requisite wisdom, sensitivity and courage but instead succumb to special interests or
yield to pressures of short-term financial gain at the expense of what is truly right for the city in the long run you
can do great and irreparable harm.
Little survives longer or provides as much ongoing benefit or harm to our city as the buildings and open spaces
within it. As stewards of this city, the quality of the built environment you allow is one of the key responsibilities
your positions hold and one of the longest lasting impacts of what you do. The decisions about what you do and do
not allow – and where - are not trivial and their impacts are not transient.
We need look no further than the destruction of Boston’s the historic West End 1960 in favor of faceless and overly
scaled towers. 60 years later we all still witness the irreversible damage your predecessors unfortunately allowed
in that part our city. If given the chance to remake that decision I’m sure you all would.

The Leather District: World Class Historic Urban Fabric

Despite previous mistakes, In downtown Boston we are fortunate enough to still have a number of neighborhoods
with genuinely world class historic urban fabric. The Back Bay. Beacon Hill. The North End. The South End. Bay
Village. Without doubt the Leather District stands among them as a truly irreplaceable historic urban fabric.
Like their peers the world over, these neighborhoods are so cherished largely because of two (irreplaceable)
ingredients: 1. The Quality of their Building Stock and 2. The Consistency of their Human Scale.
Historic fabric of this quality is rare and the envy of cities across the globe. In our young country they are
particularly rare. Other cities would yearn for them.
This proposed project for 125 Lincoln Street, as currently proposed, with its excessive height, bloated massing,
inappropriate use (office) and disproportionately financially driven agenda - for this location - seriously jeopardizes
the integrity, and special character of the Leather District.

Appropriate Development

I fully understand that development helps foster the growth and prosperity on which we all rely. I also understand
that surrounding all our best cherished human scaled neighborhoods there exist larger scale commercial districts
that allow our city to thrive financially. Both are needed and must coexist. However if not adequately protected the
towers can and will drown the fabric.
Larger development can easily exist when juxtaposed to historic fabric of this quality. Rarely however does it
succeed when it is so out of scale and superimposed on top of it and so close. That is the case with the 125
Lincoln proposal.
Other solutions to this site are possible. Solutions that could make the developers adequate return long term, that
can improve on the currently underutilized lot, that can increase real estate taxes and can benefit the community
and residents – they are all possible without ruining a neighborhood.
Unfortunately, the currently proposed inappropriate scale and use does not do these things and will ruin the
integrity and special character of the neighborhood. They know it and you know it.
With real courage and vision the city would have turned this lot into a park continuing the Greenway. With none of
those qualities you would allow it to proceed as planned. There is however a middle ground.
I am quite certain your agency wouldn’t allow this development it in the heart of the North End, Bay Village, South
End or Beacon Hill and you instinctively know why. Don’t do so here in the Leather District.
Allowing it to proceed as proposed would violate one of the more important obligations entrusted in you by the
residents and voters of this city - to act as stewards for our city and its fabric - for the long term.

https://www.google.com/maps/search/125+Lincoln+Street?entry=gmail&source=g
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10 Reasons the 125 Lincoln Street Tower is not appropriate development as currently proposed:

Height Alone (370’)  is far too tall for this location
The location is within the heart of the Leather District of a residential and mixed use neighborhood (not
adjacent or across a major artery)
Its height alone is irresponsibly tall for the location. The 2010 Greenway Planning Study was correct and
should be listened respected.

Overall Mass(iveness) has compounded negative impact of Tall Height and Large Floor Plate.
The large office (not residential) scaled footprint when extruded to this height creates a double negative
impact of  creating a wide and too tall building compounding the destructive effect on neighborhood scale.

It would destroy or (at minimum severely damage) an irreplaceable cherished historic urban fabric.
These neighborhoods are cherished assets that must be protected not overpowered by insensitively scale
and use.
Your job as stewards is to provide appropriate reason and judgement for the long term not just for short
term finances
The scale and massing alone are the primary culprit. The non community friendly use is the secondary but
related) culprit.

The scale proposed is not needed to provide adequate financial return.
We know this to be fact as alternate proposals by competing developers at the time of land purchase
proposed developments with at least 40% less mass and scale than the current proposal.
These alternate (non-office) proposals were both shorter, smaller in footprint and yet still allowed adequate
market driven  financial return
Just because a developer paid a price for land assuming it would be allowed to develop on it does not
mean they have the right to do so.

Proposal is disproportionately motivated by financial profit.
Absent of financial motivation, I do not believe a single architect or planner in this city would seriously
believe that a tower of this size, proportion or mass on this site is the best thing for the city's long term
future. It is too big and that is obvious.
Solutions far smaller than this insensitively planned tower would and could work with benefit to all.
Existing zoning, planning studies, common opinion and law reflects this truth. Please read and listen to
them.

You don’t have to allow it and it doesn’t help the community
The city has seen an explosion of office space over the last 10 years in the seaport.
You don’t need to allow this much more office SF in a single new spec office tower.

The proposal completely contradicts existing sound planning and zoning studies
2010 Greenway Planning confirms 80-100’ as max appropriate height specifically for this site.

Wrong Occupancy
No substantive community or evening benefit is provided by the office use.
The office use is detrimental to community building as it is vacated at night and does not help to solve
ongoing night time safety and behavior issues near South Station

There are other options and solutions.
It is not a situation of this proposal or nothing.

The voters, tax payers and neighboring communities unanimously do not support it
You are employed as stewards of our city for both short and long term. Make it better not worse.
You are elected by and serve the residents and tax payers of this city, not the corporations or businesses.
Proposing

Conclusion

In a country with so little urban fabric of the quality of the Leather District please protect it appropriately.
This does not by default mean no development. This means appropriately scaled, appropriately occupied and
appropriately considered development. Development that seeks first to maintain the qualities that make our city’s
fabric so strong and then to see how that fabric can be enhanced and not overpowered by new development.
It is of course a sensitive balance. That said it is one that any objective observer knows the proposed project at
125 Lincoln Street Tower does not strike.
Please see the bigger question at play. This cannot be about immediate financial circumstances. This must be
about maintaining the very fabric and essence that make this city so wonderful for generations to come. 

As a resident, as a tax payer, as a neighbor, and as an architect who has worked with the city designing some of the most
well received community buildings in the city over the last 10 years, I request you deny the current application for this
development as currently conceived.
 
Mark Oldham
Architect & Boston  Resident
111 Beach Street,

https://www.google.com/maps/search/111+Beach+Street,+Leather+District+Boston+MA?entry=gmail&source=g
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Leather District
Boston MA
 

https://www.google.com/maps/search/111+Beach+Street,+Leather+District+Boston+MA?entry=gmail&source=g
https://www.google.com/maps/search/111+Beach+Street,+Leather+District+Boston+MA?entry=gmail&source=g
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7/31/2019

MichaeLA.Sinatra@Boston.gov

Michael Sinatra, Project Manager
Boston Planning and Development Agency
One City Hall Sq., 9th Floor
Boston, MA 02201

Dear Mr. Sinatra,

As the owner of a neighborhood small business serving the residents and employees in
Chinatown, the Leather District, and Downtown Crossing, I am excited about the opportunity of
revitalizing the spacd at 125 Lincoln Street with a new, mixed use building.

A new office building with publicly accessible ground floor uses will add vibrancy and activity
to the site, improve the public realm and safety in the area, and increase foot traffic and patrons
in the neighborhood.

The project offers the potential for local small businesses to grow and support their employees.

We look forward to seeing the project advance.

Sincerely,

Tzu~ H- 0V
Tzurit Or
Founder & CEO



July 30, 2019 

 

Michael Sinatra 

Boston Planning & Development Agency (BPDA) 

One City Hall Square 

Boston, MA 02201 

 

RE: 125 Lincoln Street Project 

 

Dear Mr. Sinatra, 

 

We are submitting these comments on behalf of the Oxford Street Tenants Association in 

opposition of the project proposed by 125 Lincoln Street LLC and the Oxford Properties Group. 

We live at 22-30 Oxford Street in Chinatown, less than 500 feet from the proposed development 

site.  We believe this project will impact us greatly. 

 

We are more than 20 families of working-class immigrants fighting to stay in our community 

after our landlord proposed rent increases of 18-20%. With expansive luxury developments 

encroaching on Chinatown, and multiple hotel proposals in the vicinity, our community would 

be negatively impacted by such a high office building with no affordable housing on site. 

Furthermore, we are worried about the potential displacement of a Chinese grocery store and 

restaurant, which serves our community's needs. 

 

Our primary concerns are the lack of affordable housing on-site at a time when ourselves and 

others are deeply in need of it.  Other major concerns include the height of the project, increased 

street and pedestrian traffic, the displacement of the community's anchor businesses including a 

restaurant, grocery store, and butcher shop. 

 

We hope the developer will continue to listen to the community's feedback and reshape this 

project into something which both Chinatown and the Leather District residents can support. 

Thank you. 

 

 

 

Sincerely, 

Oxford Street Tenants Association 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



 

Michael Sinatra 

Boston Planning & Development Agency (BPDA) 

One City Hall Square 

Boston, MA 02201 

 

RE：林肯街 125 号发展项目 

 

波士顿规划和发展局的 Sinatra 先生， 

 

我们住在唐人街好事福街 22-30 号的住户，我们的住所距离开发项目的地点

不到 500 尺，该项目的发展会对我们造成极大的影响。我们好事福住客联谊

会想提交这些意见，反对 125 Lincoln Street LLC 和 Oxford Properties 

Group 提出的这个发展项目。 

 

当我们的房东提出租金要增加 18-20％之后，我们有超过 20 个工人阶级移民

家庭一直在争取留在我们的社区。随着唐人街的豪华项目发展开发，以及附

近的多个酒店项目建议，我们的社区现时又将面临受到兴建得如此高的办公

楼的负面影响，但大楼里面并没有我们需要的可负担性房屋。此外，我们也

担心对唐人社区非常重要的美东超市和喜临门酒楼也会失去。 

 

我们最主要担心的是我们自己和其他居民其实最需要的是可负担性房屋，但

项目发展大楼里面并没有包含可负担性房屋单位。 而其他问题还包括该项

目的高度，街道和行人交通量等的增加，社区的小商业也将变得流离失所，

包括餐馆，杂货店等。 

 

我们希望开发商要继续倾听社区的反馈意见，并将这个项目重新设计为唐人

街和皮革区居民都可以支持的项目。谢谢。 

 

 

好事福住客联谊会 

 

2019 年 7 月 30 日 
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Michael Sinatra <michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov>

125 Lincoln Street Tower Project - Oxford Properties

Pennie, Chris Tue, Jul 30, 2019 at 9:15 AM
To: "Michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov" <Michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov>
Cc: "mayor@boston.gov" <mayor@boston.gov>, "ed.flynn@boston.gov" <ed.flynn@boston.gov>, "Michelle.Wu@boston.gov"
<Michelle.Wu@boston.gov>, "bpdacomments@gmail.com" <bpdacomments@gmail.com>, "Pennie, Chris"

The proposed tower at this location would be an absolute travesty for both the city and the neighborhood.  Its massing
and height would completely take away from what makes the Leather District special.  It is completely out of scale with
the Greenway Planning Study for the site and it would wall off our entire neighborhood as well as increase the shadowing
later in the day.  I can only imagine what the wind will be like on Lincoln Street.

 

I am completely opposed to this development in its current context.

 

Christopher Pennie

Leather District Resident

111 Beach Street

 

Chris Pennie, LEED AP 
Senior Vice President - Operations
Lee Kennedy Company 
Let's build on big thinking.

122 Quincy Shore Drive, Quincy, MA 02171

     

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE:
This electronic mail transmission and any accompanying documents contain information belonging to
the sender (Lee Kennedy Company, Inc.) which may be confidential and/or legally privileged. This
information is intended only for the use of the individual or entity to whom this electronic mail
transmission was sent as indicated above. If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure,
copying, distribution, or action taken in reliance on the contents of the information contained in this
transmission is strictly prohibited.

https://www.google.com/maps/search/111+Beach+Street?entry=gmail&source=g
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Michael Sinatra <michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov>

125 Lincoln Street Tower Project – Oxford Properties 

Rob Petrie Tue, Jul 30, 2019 at 3:02 PM
To: "Michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov" <Michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov>
Cc: "mayor@boston.gov" <mayor@boston.gov>, "ed.flynn@boston.gov" <ed.flynn@boston.gov>, "Michelle.Wu@boston.gov"
<Michelle.Wu@boston.gov>

Michael,

 

I am writing in support of the 125 Lincoln Street project. I understand that there is a small, but very vocal, minority in the Leather
District who vehemently oppose the project. However, overblown and outsized fears about changing zoning laws, shadows,
wind, and traffic should lead to the cancellation of this project. The Leather District belongs to the city, which desperately needs
additional office space. The project will also lead to the creation of much needed communal spaces in the community. For these
reasons, I think the project should move ahead.

 

My only real concern about the project is that it will bisect Chinatown and, in the long run, reduce its overall size. As you may or
may not know, the Chinatown neighborhood doesn’t end at the JFK Surface Road. It continues on into the Leather District.
Almost all the businesses affected by the demolition of the car garage are Chinese owned (namely C-Mart & Hei La  Moon) and
very much a part of the Chinatown community. Moreover, there are many Chinese businesses along Lincoln Street, including a
tenant of 105 Beach Street (Empire Auction House). This project risks creating a wall in people’s minds between Chinatown and
the Leather District, which would over time lead the JFK Surface Road to become a natural barrier between them. This should
be avoided because, historically, Chinatown has already suffered hardship in the name of development. Not too long ago the
Central Artery was built through Chinatown without serious consideration for the hardships doing so would impose on the
community. It also led to the loss of its only library (which was just recently restored). For obvious reasons, repeating this
mistake should be avoided. A white suburban middle class residential or commercial community would not be expected to stand
for it. Neither should Chinatown.

 

Given the above, it is essential that Chinese businesses affected by this project be offered assistance so they can continue to
occupy the retail space on the first floor of the 125 Lincoln Street project. While it may make the project less profitable, it will
preserve the integrity of the neighborhood. It is also a small price to pay to avoid the mistakes of the past.

 

 

Robert Petrie
Academic Director

LSI Boston

 

https://www.google.com/maps/search/125+Lincoln+Street?entry=gmail&source=g
https://www.google.com/maps/search/105+Beach+Street?entry=gmail&source=g
https://www.google.com/maps/search/125+Lincoln+Street?entry=gmail&source=g
https://www.facebook.com/LSI.Worldwide
https://twitter.com/lsinews
https://www.instagram.com/lsi_worldwide/
https://www.youtube.com/user/LSILanguageStudies
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https://www.lsi.edu/en/
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Michael Sinatra <michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov>

125 Lincoln Street Tower Project – Oxford Properties

Pile, Richard Tue, Jul 30, 2019 at 4:20 PM
To: Michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov
Cc: mayor@boston.gov, ed.flynn@boston.gov, michell.wu@boston.gov, 

Dear Sir

I am writing to voice my strong opposition the proposed development at 125 Lincoln Street.  I have reviewed the Project
Notification Form submitted by the developer and have many objections, but here are what I feel are the most salient
points.

The Leather District is zoned for 80' with a maximum variance to 100'.  Oxford Properties is planning a 370'
commercial building massing 625,000 square feet.   Their sole reference is that "the project site is located in :(i the
Leather District, which is governed principally by Article 44 of the code...". (pg 1-8)  Nowhere in their 787 page proposal
do they mention that this contradicts existing zoning and planning and ignores the last 25 years of planning and
zoning code developed by the City and the BPDA in response to the changes brought about by the Big Dig and
the creation of the Greenway.  

The Leather District is an historic, distinctive, low-rise residential live/work community distinct from the high density, high
rise commercial areas of the Financial District and Downtown Crossing.   A 625,000 square foot office building does
nothing to enhance the neighborhood.  Rather than a benefit, this is a resource the directly detracts from the historic and
residential nature of the Leather District and undermines its uniqueness and value as a downtown residential community
that acts as a counter point to the nearby, heavily developed office districts.   

This project offers nothing to the neighborhood.  In their report, Oxford properties mentions no direct benefits to The
Leather District or Chinatown, only that it will strengthen economic vitality and ..."provide new office space that
meets the demands of future employers...". (pg 1-8)   Hardly a plus for residents.

As an office building it places incredible load on the neighborhood while not being part of it.  During the day, the influx of
office workers will overload the sidewalks and streets, over-fill existing amenities in the area and in effect squeeze
residents out. At night the building will be empty, providing no draw for pedestrian traffic after dark, just another empty
street.  

One of the goals of the Greenway is to connect the Leather District to neighboring Chinatown, opening these
communities to each other and the downtown.  This building creates a huge, dividing wall between them,   
 
Oxford does mention that it will be "replacing a deteriorated commercial asset" .  Since their purchase of the property they
have made no visible attempt to improve the building with repairs, security or better trash control and sanitation.  It would
appear that they are content with the building as it is.  During their presentations to the neighborhood association, they
repeatedly mentioned that a large development was the only "economically viable" way to develop the property.  Given
that they only purchased the building two years ago and with any kind of due diligence were aware of the condition of the
building, the zoning in place for the property, and the price they were paying for it, I find this argument fallacious.  If their
building is, as they describe it, "deteriorated" they should consider options to rectify this within the zoning envelope.

There are many details present in the Oxford report that are points of contention, but they are only relevant if all of the
planning, development and zoning developed from the Big Dig and its revitalization of the downtown are not only ignored,
but actively overturned.  The broad, economic "benefits" espoused by this proposal are already being adequately realized
by high density developments in the Seaport and Downtown.  There is no need to degrade a unique, historic part of
Boston to create another "cookie-cutter: office building in a location where it does not belong.

Thank you for your time

Richard Pile and N. Cathy Hogan
Residents,
Leather District, 
Boston

https://www.google.com/maps/search/125+Lincoln+Street?entry=gmail&source=g
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Michael Sinatra <michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov>

125 Lincoln Street Proposal

Rolfe, Eileen Fri, Jun 28, 2019 at 2:18 PM
To: "michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov" <michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov>
Cc: 

Dear Mr. Sinatra,

 

I am writing regarding the 125 Lincoln Street development proposal.  I have lived in the Leather

District for close to 20 years. 

 

I am pleased to see the parking garage go.  However, the proposed development will not bring any

added value to our neighborhood unless there is a plan for mixed use.  We need a significant residential

(and not transient) component to bring life and safety to the area.  We do not need another huge block on the

same street and side that is dead and dark without any street or neighborhood life after 5pm.  Let alone the violation of
the zoning height.

 

The retail plans are not the least bit specific and can change at anytime.  It also appears that they are

being able to use the Grrenway portion as a selling point for themselves.

 

Our neighborhood always seems to be an afterthought to city hall.  Sidewalks, drugs, lighting and above all,

the worst pollution rate in the city.  We have to suffer the on/off highway ramp traffic and anti-pedestrian

behaviors. 

 

And now, this.  Walling off 2 neighborhoods!!!  Isn't that one of the reasons the elevated central artery came down?

 

If the city allows this proposal as is, without a residential component, it will be just appalling.

 

 

 

Sincerely,

 

Eileen Harvey Rolfe

210 South Street

mailto:Michael.a.sinatra@boston
https://www.google.com/maps/search/125+Lincoln+Street?entry=gmail&source=g
https://www.google.com/maps/search/210+South+Street+%0D%0A+Boston,+MA+%0D%0A+02111?entry=gmail&source=g
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Boston, MA

02111

 

The information in this e-mail is intended only for the person to whom it is addressed. If you believe this e-mail was sent
to you in error and the e-mail contains patient information, please contact the Tufts Medical Center HIPAA Hotline at (617)
636-4422. If the e-mail was sent to you in error but does not contain patient information, contact the sender and properly
dispose of the e-mail.

Please consider the environment and the security of the information contained within or attached to this e-mail before
printing or saving to an insecure location.

https://www.google.com/maps/search/210+South+Street+%0D%0A+Boston,+MA+%0D%0A+02111?entry=gmail&source=g
https://www.google.com/maps/search/210+South+Street+%0D%0A+Boston,+MA+%0D%0A+02111?entry=gmail&source=g


LARRY ROSENBLUM PRESENTATION NOTES 
125 LINCOLN STREET PROPOSAL 
PUBLIC MEETING WITH BPDA AND OXFORD PROPERTIES – 6.26.19 
 

 
INTRO – Resident and business owner in Leather District, received first ZBA 
variance to live in this neighborhood, in 1979. Been active in LD and City of Boston 
planning issues for 40 years. 
 
Major concerns about this project: 
 

• WAY TOO TALL AND MASSIVE 
• OFFICE TOWER IS NOT A DESIRABLE BUILDING TYPE OR USE FOR THIS 

NEIGHBORHOOD - SHOULD BE RESIDENTIAL OR MIXED-USE  
• SITE TOO CONSTRAINED FOR THIS INTENSIVE USE – ACCESS LIMITATIONS, 

EXISTING TRAFFIC 
• PROPOSAL TOTALLY IGNORES ZONING REQUIREMENTS 

 
Questions regarding last point: 
 

• How do we find ourselves in this situation, being asked to comment on a 
proposal that blatantly ignores the development guidelines for the 
neighborhood? 

 
• Did the developer not know the zoning limitations when they purchased the 

property? 
 

• Did they test the neighborhood’s tolerance for a project like this BEFORE 
making a formal proposal to the City? Do they expect an approval 
irrespective of how we feel about it? 

 
• What happens if the City rejects this proposal? What’s next? 
 

I know this developer and his team are capable of creating a good office tower 
project. The problem is, this site should not have an office tower on it! 
 
THIS IS NOT THE FINANCIAL DISTRICT. 



 
COMMENT LETTER – OXFORD PROPERTIES 125 LINCOLN STREET OFFICE TOWER PROPOSAL 
 
 
TO:  Michael A. Sinatra, Project Manager 
  Boston Planning & Development Agency 
CC:  Mayor Martin Walsh 
  City Councilor Ed Flynn 
  City Councilor Michelle Wu 
  Danchen Xu 
FROM:  Larry Rosenblum  
  118 South Street 
  Boston, MA 02111 
   
DATE:  June 24, 2019 
RE:  Public Comment - Oxford Properties proposal for 125 Lincoln Street 
 
 
I am part of the original group of property owners at 118 South Street who, in 1979, sought and 
received the first zoning variance that allowed legal residence in the Leather District. 
 
I introduce myself this way because that variance, and the zoning changes that followed, bear 
directly on the choices the Leather District and City of Boston now face with regard to 125 
Lincoln Street. 
 
Background 
 
In 1979 the Leather District was zoned exclusively for commercial use. The variance request 
came at a time when the neighborhood was under severe stress. The leather industry was in 
decline - for environmental and other reasons - and building vacancies were very high, leaving 
the streets at night dark, empty and forbidding. Most of the buildings – being 70 or 80 years old 
- were not suited for modern commercial or office use without major investment, and this was 
not forthcoming from the business or development communities, so the very future of these 
buildings was at risk. 
 
The Zoning Board of Appeals understood this situation and viewed our request as a new way of 
thinking about the future of the neighborhood. We were a group of people who wanted to live 
and/or work here and who understood both the potential and limitations of the buildings. We 
were prepared to take on these challenges and we did. And, as it turns out, many followed 
behind us.  
 
This was the beginning of a new downtown neighborhood, one that combined commercial, 
retail and residential uses in buildings that would otherwise have no future, bringing both 
economic resiliency and 24/7 life to these streets and buildings. 



 
That first variance – affecting less than a dozen people – later grew into interim and then 
permanent zoning intended to both codify and protect the architectural and mixed-use 
character of the District. Today hundreds of people live in this eight-block area, having paid as 
much as $700 to $1,000 per square foot for the privilege. Those of us who chose to live here 
consider Article 44 zoning as important today as when it was first adopted. 
 
Which takes us to the proposal for 125 Lincoln and why I and most of my neighbors strongly 
oppose it. The following are the highlights of my objections, not in any particular order: 
 
Building Height & Massing 
 
It doesn’t take an architectural critic to recognize the inappropriateness of a 370-foot building 
on Lincoln Street – part of a neighborhood whose average building height is around 100 feet.  
 
Wow, that’s BIG! This is the first impression the community had when shown the drawings and 
it’s the first thing anyone in or around the neighborhood will see and feel when coming within 
eyeshot of this building. It is just too big. It will not only cast long shadows on buildings, streets 
and Greenway spaces around it, it will dominate the sky for people on the streets and looking 
out their windows. 
 
There is a reason maximum-building-heights are included in zoning regulations, which, for the 
Leather District, is 80 feet, or 100 feet with Large Project Review. The zoning seeks 
compatibility of the new with the old, and this is particularly important in historic districts. In 
flaunting Leather District zoning, this building simply says, I don’t care. This mentality is what 
drives financial district buildings into the sky, but it shouldn’t be acceptable here. The Leather 
District is not the Financial District and this building is attempting to change that. 
 
Using words from the Leather District Zoning Article 44.1, Purpose, Goals and Objectives – this 
building does NOT meet the standard of “ensur[ing] that new development is compatible with 
existing buildings in scale, design, and choice of building and decorative materials.” 
 
Site Characteristics & Constraints 
 
The site doesn’t allow suitable access for vehicles and pedestrians, nor does it offer adequate 
open space – other than by incorporating adjacent public space that it connects to. It’s a big 
building crammed onto a very constrained site.  
 
In addition, because the building can’t be approached from Surface Road - a more logical access 
point being a major street - Lincoln and Beach Streets become the default entry and egress 
points. This will be true both during construction and well beyond. Neither are wide enough to 
handle construction vehicles or vehicles queuing for the service dock or underground parking, 
to say nothing of double-parked cars at the Lincoln Street entrance. This site, given its size and 
limited access options, is just not suitable for such intensive use. 



 
Building Use 
 
Leather District vitality derives from its mixed-use occupancy, intimate scale and varied 
commercial and business activities. There are business people, retirees, and families-with-
children in the neighborhood, and small eateries and other commercial establishments. These 
bring vitality and 24/7 safety to the neighborhood and these are the qualities the community is 
trying to protect. 
 
Large office buildings undermine these qualities. They fill and empty in morning- and afternoon-
waves, clogging streets and sidewalks with office workers otherwise disconnected from the 
neighborhood. For this proposal that means more than 3,000 people entering and leaving each 
weekday - a number that probably approaches the combined number of people who currently 
live and work here. This large, monolithic, single-use building does not belong in a historic, 
mixed-use residential area. 
 
125 Lincoln As Precedent 
 
If approved in its current form, this building will undermine the future of the Leather District as 
a historic, mixed-use neighborhood. Across Beach Street is the old 5-story Teradyne building, 
another large-footprint parcel in the hands of a single owner. If a 370-foot building is 
acceptable for this site, how do you say no to that property owner or the next developer also 
looking to benefit from an expanded Financial District?  
 
Given its locational advantages it’s not hard to imagine the Leather District one day becoming 
the South Station Tower District, relegating the old Leather District to a chapter (or paragraph) 
in architectural and urban history books. After all, the entire Financial District was also once a 
collection of small brick buildings. If the architectural and mixed-use character of the Leather 
District is to be preserved, the intent of Article 44 must applied to this proposal.  
 
As a person who has been intimately involved in every planning effort in and around the 
Leather District since the 1980’s – including serving on the Mayor’s Central Artery Completion 
Task Force and a number of South Bay planning efforts, and who brings other personal and 
professional experience to this subject, I feel confident in saying this building is not appropriate 
for this site. 
 
I hope the City of Boston takes my comments and those of my neighbors to heart. There are 
many ways this site could be redeveloped to the satisfaction of the neighborhood and benefit 
of the City. This is not one of them. Please reject this proposal.  
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Michael Sinatra <michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov>

125 Lincoln Street Tower Project – Oxford Properties

John Russell Tue, Jul 30, 2019 at 5:58 PM
To: Michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov
Cc: mayor@boston.gov, ed.flynn@boston.gov, Michelle.Wu@boston.gov, 

Dear Mr. Sinatra, 

I am a resident at 70 Lincoln Street in the Leather District.    I write in opposition to the height and scope of
the 125 Lincoln Street Tower Project. 

I am a supporter of commercial and residential real estate development and have seen how it can be vitalizing
to underdeveloped sections of our great city. 

However, left unchecked, development can have a deleterious effect on a neighborhood.    It is clear as day to
me that the proposal for a massive office building at 125 Lincoln Street will harm the Leather District and,
likely, Chinatown.   A scaled down version of the proposal would be much more appropriate.   I support
development of this site, but not at this size and scope. 

And finally, does the law matter at all?    The proposed height is well beyond any legal limits and is against the
recommendation of the Greenway Planning Study.    So my view is not simply the narrow perspective of a
provincial local resident but is backed by the leaders who wrote the regulations on the size and height of
buildings on Lincoln Street and the experts who studied the Greenway back in 2010. 

Please enforce the law and the will of the people and scale this project down to the appropriate size.    Thank
you. 

JRussell 

https://www.google.com/maps/search/70+Lincoln+Street?entry=gmail&source=g
https://www.google.com/maps/search/125+Lincoln+Street?entry=gmail&source=g
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Michael Sinatra <michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov>

125 Lincoln Street Tower Project – Oxford Properties

Gregory Shomo Sat, Jul 27, 2019 at 4:20 PM
To: "Michael Sinatra, Project Manager" <Michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov>
Cc: Mayor Martin Walsh <mayor@boston.gov>, City Councilor Ed Flynn <ed.flynn@boston.gov>, City Councilor Michelle Wu
<Michelle.Wu@boston.gov>, Danchen Xu <danchen.xu@boston.gov>, greg shomo 

The proposed skyscraper office building at 125 Lincoln Street is being
presented as a boon to the neighborhood, but in reality it only
manages to transform the overlap between Chinatown and the Leather
District into a giant wall. These neighborhoods are home to many
families (both young and old) and would prefer to be brought closer
together rather than split apart. As mentioned in several meetings,
the best thing for the people in the neighborhood would be a park -
green space - at that location. Nobody thinks what we really need
is a giant skyscraper office building.

The plan submitted by Oxford Properties includes a massive zoning
variance to allow them to build up to a height of 370'. This is just
about four times the maximum height allowed by code and doesn't even
consider the mechanical floor - an additional 30'. Imagine if Oxford asked
to build 4 office buildings (at 100 feet) while only purchasing the
single plot !

Current code is not arbitrary - many weeks were spent establishing
zoning codes during the Big Dig and Greenway Projects - but there is
nothing naive about asking for such a variance. Oxford Properties
wants to privatize any gains that they can from the successful and
well-maintained Greenway and are not concerned about consequent
effects.

In addition to the adverse effects on Chinatown, the Leather District,
and the Greenway, Oxford Properties's plan is bad for Boston. We're
one of the actually great cities in the United States.  Boston is a
human-friendly, built out before cars ruled the world (I grew up in
Detroit) and it is different. The proposed office building does
nothing to advance living-in-Boston. It might do something for
commute-to-work-in-Boston, but surely there are enough office
buildings already that fill this role. We do not need an office
building at 125 Lincoln Street.

The proposed structure turns its back on both Chinatown and the
Leather District, making no effort to incorporate itself into the
location. There is no set-back for the higher floors. Maintenance
of the current structure begs the question "Can Oxford really
manage this property ?". We've gone on an on with these points
(and many others) in meetings, but the main point for me is that
this building just does not belong where they want to put it.
It might be a good building for a different location, but it is
absolutely the wrong building for 125 Lincoln Street.

I've lived in the Leather District for 19 years and seen a fair amount
of construction and renovation over that time. Much of it has been
good and appreciated, but I believe strongly that the Oxford Project
is bad for the neighborhood, bad for the people living in the
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neighborhood, and bad for the City of Boston. I ask that you reject
the plan outright and thank you for your consideration.

Greg Shomo
116 Lincoln St, #6C
Boston, MA 02111
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Michael Sinatra <michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov>

125 Lincoln Street Tower Project – Oxford Properties 

Linda See Wed, Jun 12, 2019 at 3:39 PM
To: Michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov
Cc: mayor@boston.gov, ed.flynn@boston.gov, Michelle.Wu@boston.gov, danchen.xu@boston.gov,

Michael et al: 
 
I am a lifelong Boston resident and have been a homeowner in Chinatown and the Leather District since 2009.  I live and
work in this neighborhood with my three young children, who also attend school here.  I am writing to voice my strong
opposition to the proposed development by Oxford Properties at 125 Lincoln Street.  
 
Although technically considered the Leather District, this is an important site to the Chinatown community as the current
home of Hei La Moon, C-Mart, a parking garage, and other retail establishments.  C-Mart, the supermarket – which has
existed at this site under various ownership for at least 25 years, if not more – offers familiar products at an accessible
price point for the residents of Chinatown that Whole Foods and Roche Bros do not.  The restaurant, Hei La Moon, is host
to large wedding celebrations and other cultural events, as well as a bustling daily dim sum business that is popular with
residents and visitors.  There are few alternatives remaining within Chinatown for these types of businesses, and losing
them to an office tower would be a tremendous hit to the Chinatown community.
 
The Oxford proposal violates the existing height restrictions and includes no residential component at a time when
affordable housing is sorely needed in Chinatown, and they have made no commitment to preserving these important
resources within Chinatown.  An office-use only tower would be inaccessible at nights and on weekends and jeopardize
safety in the surrounding area by removing the residents, visitors and patrons of the existing businesses.  
 
Chinatown needs to be preserved, and I ask for your help in this effort by rejecting the Oxford proposal in its current form. 
 
Kind regards,
Linda Y. See 
 
 
 

https://www.google.com/maps/search/125+Lincoln+Street?entry=gmail&source=g
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Michael Sinatra <michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov>

125 Lincoln Street Tower Project - Oxford Properties

Dave Seeley Tue, Jul 30, 2019 at 3:55 PM
To: Michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov, mayor@boston.gov, ed.flynn@boston.gov, Michelle.Wu@boston.gov,
danchen.xu@boston.gov

COMMENT LETTER – OXFORD PROPERTIES 125 LINCOLN STREET OFFICE TOWER PROPOSAL

TO:                  Michael A. Sinatra, Project Manager

                        Boston Planning & Development Agency - Michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov

 CC:                 Mayor Martin Walsh  - mayor@boston.gov

          City Councilor Ed Flynn  - ed.flynn@boston.gov

          City Councilor Michelle Wu  - Michelle.Wu@boston.gov

                        Danchen Xu - danchen.xu@boston.gov

 Christopher Betke - bpdacomments@gmail.com

 

FROM:             David Seeley

                        102 South Street 4

                        Boston, MA 02111

                        

DATE:              July 30, 2019

 

RE:                   Public Comment - Oxford Properties proposal for 125 Lincoln Street

Thanks for the opportunity to comment on this proposed development.  I’ve been a resident and business owner in the
Leather District for over thirty years, and have participated in City planning processes throughout that time.  I practiced
architecture and urban planning for a dozen years before a career change, and was the project designer on both the
Boston Police Headquarters for the City of Boston, and the South Station complex for the Beacon Companies, both with
Stull and Lee, Inc.  I was a representative to the South Bay Planning Study, the Mayor’s Central Artery Completion Task
Force, and I was co-chair for both the Chinatown Greenway Park process and the One Greenway tower development by
ACDC, along with friend and Chinatown advocate Stephanie Fan.  I then served two years on the Greenway Leadership
Council, where I oversaw comments on the BRA’s Greenway District Planning Study, in which the 125 Lincoln Street site
was specifically studied in order to determine the appropriate height and massing in order to protect the surrounding
neighborhood and Chinatown Park from detrimental shadow, wind, and traffic impacts.  As you know, that costly study,
including many hours of public meetings, resulted in a 100’ maximum, with substantial setback at 80’.  While I agree with
my neighbors that this development clashes with the context in both concept and design, and would be better suited as
residential, in the interest of brevity I want to speak directly to the unacceptable massing of the proposal.

By way of institutional knowledge, there was a bill proposed in 2009 by State Reps Byron Rushing and Marty Walz to
protect City’s parks from shadow impacts.  The bill was a result of public sentiment over no-confidence in the City in its
stewardship of public green space relative to the lure of economic development benefits. 

http://archive.boston.com/news/local/massachusetts/articles/2009/02/05/bill_looks_to_limit_shadows_on_parks/

https://www.google.com/maps/search/125+LINCOLN+STREET?entry=gmail&source=g
mailto:Michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov
mailto:mayor@boston.gov
mailto:ed.flynn@boston.gov
mailto:Michelle.Wu@boston.gov
mailto:danchen.xu@boston.gov
mailto:bpdacomments@gmail.com
https://www.google.com/maps/search/125+Lincoln+Street?entry=gmail&source=g
https://www.google.com/maps/search/125+Lincoln+Street?entry=gmail&source=g
http://archive.boston.com/news/local/massachusetts/articles/2009/02/05/bill_looks_to_limit_shadows_on_parks/
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I believe that the Greenway District Planning study was the BRA’s answer to demonstrating that they didn’t need State
oversight in order to be good stewards of public parks.  Shadow impacts on the open space were paramount in
consideration of setting massings on the sites studied.  During the public unveiling event of the Greenway District
Planning study, then BRA Chief Planner Kairos Shen was asked how we were to trust that allowable height and density
would not exceed those set within the study.  His response was “you have my word.”  While it’s understood that
administrations come and go, it is darkly ironic that the Walsh administration, which ran on transparency and fairness in
new development, would consider this proposal for the 125 Lincoln Street site.  As a community, we understand that only
the Mayor has authority to determine the final massing of this development, and we understand the pressure that can be
brought to bear “behind closed doors” and in the media, when the massing beyond the 100’ height limit is estimated to
generate an additional 277 million dollars profit as proposed.  We respectfully ask you to resist that pressure, and be
strong stewards for the character and quality of our neighborhoods by holding the limits set in the Greenway District
Planning Study. 

I believe that the shadow studies presented to date by the proponent are misleading at best, and I encourage you to
generate your own independent studies.  Via the url below: I utilized the City’s publicly available model to generate these
shadow studies during critical dates during the seasons.  Impacts on the growth seasons for the Chinatown park, and
shadows in the Leather district AND the Park are major, despite the proponent characterizing them as “negligible” in a
neighborhood meeting.

 

  

 

 

 

https://www.google.com/maps/search/125+Lincoln+Street?entry=gmail&source=g
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Michael Sinatra <michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov>

125 Lincoln Street Tower Project – Oxford Properties

Paul Semonian Thu, Jun 20, 2019 at 9:17 AM
To: Michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov
Cc:  mayor@boston.gov, ed.flynn@boston.gov, Michelle.Wu@boston.gov,
danchen.xu@boston.gov

Dear Mr Sinatra,
I am writing, as a new resident of the leather district, to state my objection to the currently proposed project at 125
Lincoln.  I bought a new residence at 111 Beach a month ago and will be moving in within a few weeks.  I am looking
forward to moving into an area of the city that I believe has a nice mix of everything, residential, commercial, retail food
and drink establishments.  

This proposed building does absolutely NOTHING to improve the area and from my view the developers are turning a
deaf ear to the concerns of the neighborhood and it's proper development going forward.  First the proposed structure is
absurdly large given the surrounding area and the zoning that was outlined in Article 44 / BPDA’s own Greenway
Planning Study.  This study states that 80’ - 100' is the maximum height allowed in the Leather District.  This building is
almost 4 times that maximum.  Aside from it violating the height limits, I urge you to oppose this building for other reasons
as well:

Commercial use only - the developer is not listening.  They are focusing on maximizing profits vs proper development for
the area where we live.  This area is a great area because of the successful mix of residential and commercial.  This
shifts the scale significantly.

This is a massive proposed structure that will serve as a WALL that we don’t want and don’t need.  The greenway served
to re-connect areas of the city that were previously walled off and developing something like this right along the same
path is extremely inconsistent with what anyone envisioned for the city in this area.

Traffic - it is hard to imagine how Kneeland and Lincoln Street could handle the massive influx of traffic that this building
would bring to bear at rush hour.  Lincoln Street is already a parking lot at times.  Adding thousands of additional workers
all rushing to get to and from their offices does not contribute to the area in a positive way whatsoever!

My final point is this.  When traveling around various states one can easily witness areas where proper planning was
ignored and developers were allowed to just build what they wanted.  Thankfully, in my humble opinion, Boston does not
have that many examples of this as we tend to hold the reins to make sure our great city stays great.  Allowing this builder
to put up a building 4 times the maximum size and more than 4 times the average height, with this amount of square
footage, with ZERO mixed use in the area really damages more than just the beauty of this area.  It also sets a very
dangerous president and would serve for a successful mixed use neighborhood to be turned into a commercial only ghost
town over time.  That would be a horrible thing to allow.

I hope that my comments help to influence this project in a more productive direction - one that is developed in concert
with the surroundings and takes into consideration the needs of the neighborhood vs just potential profit.

Sincerely,

Paul Semonian
111 Beach St, Unit 5E



 

MEMORANDUM 

TO:  Michael Sinatra, Project Manager  
FROM: John (Tad) Read, Senior Deputy Director for Transportation &  

Infrastructure Planning 
Manuel Esquivel, Senior Infrastructure & Energy Planning Fellow 
Ryan Walker, Smart Utilities Program - Associate    

DATE:  July 9, 2019 
SUBJECT:  125 Lincoln Street - Smart Utilities Comments - PNF 
 
Comments and request for further information: 

Thank you for your Smart Utilities Checklist submission. Please review the following comments 
and use the edit link that was generated with the initial submission to make necessary updates 
to the checklist. Any diagrams should be submitted to Manuel Esquivel at 
manuel.esquivel@boston.gov. 
 

1. Please indicate the types of green infrastructure that you intend to employ and provide a 
diagram with the locations within the site. 

2. Any street lights that need to be installed as a part of the project are being asked to be 
ready for smart technologies. This requires extra electrical and fiber optic connections be 
pulled to the light poles. We will continue to review this item with PIC and PWD and may 
request additional information in the future. 

3. We will continue to review the inclusion of AST associated with this project with the BTD 
and may request additional information in the future. 

4. If major reorganization or installation of utility infrastructure below grade will take place 
as part of the project, please provide a cross-section diagram indicating how utility 
infrastructure will be organized under ground. Please refer to the Smart Utility Standard 
cross-section diagrams. 

5. Please provide lateral diagrams indicating how all utility infrastructure will be extended to 
each building from the right-of-ways. If multiple possible scenarios exist and final plans 
are undetermined, please indicate all possibilities. 

      
If you have any questions regarding these comments or would like to arrange a meeting to 
discuss the policy please feel free to contact Manuel Esquivel at manuel.esquivel@boston.gov 
or 617.918.4382.        
      
Context: 

On June 14, 2018 the BPDA Board adopted the Smart Utilities Policy for Article 80 

Development Review. The policy (attached) calls for the incorporation of five (5) Smart Utility 
Technologies (SUTs) into new Article 80 developments. Table 1 describes these five (5) SUTs. 
Table 2 summarizes the key provisions and requirements of the policy, including the 
development project size thresholds that would trigger the incorporation of each SUT. 

In general, conversations about and review of the incorporation of the applicable SUTs into new 
Article 80 developments will be carried out by the BPDA and City staff during every stage (as 
applicable) of the review and permitting process, including a) prefile stage; b) initial filing; c) 

mailto:manuel.esquivel@boston.gov
mailto:manuel.esquivel@boston.gov
mailto:manuel.esquivel@boston.gov
mailto:manuel.esquivel@boston.gov
http://www.bostonplans.org/getattachment/7b87a301-95da-4723-b3a9-02bfebd1b109
http://www.bostonplans.org/getattachment/7b87a301-95da-4723-b3a9-02bfebd1b109
http://www.bostonplans.org/getattachment/7b87a301-95da-4723-b3a9-02bfebd1b109
http://www.bostonplans.org/getattachment/7b87a301-95da-4723-b3a9-02bfebd1b109


1 

Article 80 development review prior to BPDA Board approval; d) prior to filing an application for 
a Building Permit; and e) prior to filing an application for a Certificate of Occupancy.   

In conjunction with the SUTs contemplated in the Smart Utilities Policy, the BPDA and City staff 
will review the installation of SUTs and related infrastructure in right-of-ways in accordance with 
the Smart Utility Standards (“SUS”). The SUS set forth guidelines for planning and integration of 

SUTs with existing utility infrastructure in existing or new streets, including cross-section, lateral, 
and intersection diagrams. The Smart Utility Standards are intended to serve as guidelines for 
developers, architects, engineers, and utility providers for planning, designing, and locating 
utilities. 

In order to facilitate the review of integration of the SUTs and the SUS, the BPDA and the Smart 
Utilities Steering Committee has put together a Smart Utilities Checklist that can be filled out 
and updated during the review process. Please fill out the parts of the Checklist that apply to 
your project. Make sure to review this template first, before submitting the Smart Utilities 

Checklist. 

 
After submission, you will receive: 

1. A confirmation email with a PDF of your completed checklist. Please include a copy 
of this document with your next filing with the BPDA.  

2. A separate email with a link to update your initial submission. Please use ONLY this 
link for updating the Checklist associated with a specific project. 

Note: Any documents submitted via email to Manuel.Esquivel@Boston.gov will not be attached 
to the PDF form generated after submission, but are available upon request. 
 
 
The Smart Utilities Policy for Article 80 Development Review, the Smart Utility Standards, the 
Smart Utilities Checklist, and further information regarding the Boston Smart Utilities Vision 
project are available on the project’s website: http://www.bostonplans.org/smart-utilities. 

Manuel Esquivel, BPDA Senior Infrastructure and Energy Planning Fellow, will soon follow up to 
schedule a meeting with the proponent to discuss the Smart Utilities Policy. For any questions, 
you can contact Manuel Esquivel at manuel.esquivel@boston.gov or 617.918.4382. 

Table 1 - Summary description of 5 Smart Utility Technologies (SUTs) included in the Smart 

Utilities Policy for Article 80 Development Review 

Smart Utility Technology 

(SUTs) 
Summary Description  

District Energy Microgrid Energy system for clusters of buildings. Produces electricity on 

http://www.bostonplans.org/documents/planning/energy-planning/smart-utility-standards
http://www.bostonplans.org/documents/planning/energy-planning/smart-utility-standards
https://docs.google.com/forms/d/e/1FAIpQLSeauk6r1t5gKnfRVUpgZnJ3V6UeXbsiNYKiPJLhyJgw4udWDA/viewform
https://docs.google.com/forms/d/e/1FAIpQLSeauk6r1t5gKnfRVUpgZnJ3V6UeXbsiNYKiPJLhyJgw4udWDA/viewform
http://www.bostonplans.org/documents/planning/energy-planning/smart-utilities-checklist-template
http://www.bostonplans.org/documents/planning/energy-planning/smart-utilities-checklist-template
http://www.bostonplans.org/smart-utilities
http://www.bostonplans.org/smart-utilities
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development site and uses excess “heat” to serve heating/cooling 

needs. By combining these two energy loads, the energy 
efficiency of fuel consumed is increased. The system normally 
operates connected to main electric utility grid, but can 
disconnect (“island”) during power outages and continue 

providing electric/heating/cooling needs to end-users.     

Green Infrastructure 

Infrastructure that allows rainwater to percolate into the ground. 
Can prevent storm runoff and excessive diversion of stormwater 
into the water and sewer system.   

Adaptive Signal 

Technology 

Smart traffic signals and sensors that communicate with each 
other to make multimodal travel safer and more efficient.  

Smart Street Lights 

Traditional light poles that are equipped with smart sensors, wifi, 
cameras, etc. for health, equity, safety, traffic management, and 
other benefits.  

Telecom Utilidor 

An underground duct bank used to consolidate the wires and fiber 
optics installed for cable, internet, and other telecom services. 
Access to the duct bank is available through manholes. 
Significantly reduces the need for street openings to install 
telecom services.      

 

Table 2 - Summary of size threshold and other specifications for the 5 SUTs advanced in the 
Smart Utilities Policy for Article 80 Development Review (Note: This table is only for 

informational purposes. Please refer to the complete Smart Utilities Policy for Article 80 

Development Review to review the details.)    

 Article 80 Size Threshold  Other specifications  

District Energy Microgrid >1.5 million SF 
Feasibility Assessment; if feasible, 
then Master Plan & District Energy 

Microgrid-Ready design 

Green Infrastructure >100,000 SF 

Install to retain 1.25'' rainfall on 
impervious areas 

(Increase from 1" currently required 
by BWSC) 

Adaptive Signal 

Technology 

All projects requiring signal 
installation or improvements 

Install AST & related components 
into the traffic signal system network 

Smart Street Lights 

All Projects requiring street 
light installation or 

improvements 

Install additional electrical connection 
& fiber optics at pole 

Telecom Utilidor 
>1.5 million SF of 
development, or Install Telecom Utilidor 
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>0.5 miles of roadway 
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Michael Sinatra <michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov>

125 Lincoln Street Tower Project - Oxford Properties

Jane Snowden Thu, Jun 20, 2019 at 11:57 AM
To: Michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov
Cc: mayor@boston.gov, ed.flynn@boston.gov, Michelle.Wu@boston.gov, danchen.xu@boston.gov,

Dear Mr. Sinatra,

I have attended the informational meetings in the Leather District regarding the proposed office building at 125 Lincoln St.
I am extremely concerned about the oversized 370' height which directly violates the zoning code of 100' maximum for
the site. This will negatively impact us with shading issues onto the Greenway's new landscaping as well as the Leather
District housing, the ensuing wind tunnel issues and the increased traffic through our small 9-block neighborhood. The
traffic is already gridlocked in the afternoons along Lincoln and this will only worsen. This proposed office building would
not be in keeping with the mixed use environment of our neighborhood and its size would effectively cut us off from other
neighborhoods. 

Please don't allow the 100' maximum height limit to be so blatantly disregarded, which could then become a precedent for
other projects in the city. 

Thank you,
Janie Snowden 



 
 
 
 
 
July 30, 2019 

 

Michael.A.Sinatra@Boston.gov 

 

Michael Sinatra, Project Manager 

Boston Planning and Development Agency 

One City Hall Sq., 9th Floor 

Boston, MA 02201 

 

Dear Mr. Sinatra, 

 

I am an Executive Managing Director of Tiger Capital Group, LLC, which is a proud tenant of Oxford 

Properties Group at 60 State Street. While at this time, I am only writing you in my capacity as an officer Of 

Tiger and individually, please also note that I reside at 20 Rowes Wharf and I am a Director on the Board of the 

Rose Kennedy Greenway Conservancy.  

 

As you consider plans for a proposed office building at 125 Lincoln Street, I would like to note that our 

experience working with Oxford Properties is that they are great operators of office buildings and that they take 

the public realm in and around their properties seriously and they do so with tremendous and thoughtful care. I 

also have extensive experience with the Oxford team in Toronto and they are world class. 

 

I am of the opinion that the demand for office space in Boston remains strong, and the site at 125 Lincoln 

represents one of the few remaining properties that can support a contemporary new office tower in Downtown 

Boston. 

 

I am confident that Oxford Properties Group will develop an awesome project that will make the City of Boston 

and its citizens’ proud. I am a firm believer that under your guidance, Boston will continue to grow and shine! 

 

I am available to you for further discussion and/or perspective. My cell is 617.699.1744 

 

All the very best 

 

Brad 

 

 

 

 

 

Bradley W Snyder 

Executive Managing Director 

Tiger Capital Group, LLC 

60 State Street, 11th Floor 

Boston, MA. 02109 USA 
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Michael Sinatra <michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov>

125 Lincoln Street Tower Project – Oxford Properties

Valentine Oldham Mon, Jul 8, 2019 at 9:51 PM
To: Michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov
Cc: mayor@boston.gov, ed.flynn@boston.gov, Michelle.Wu@boston.gov, danchen.xu@boston.gov,

 Christopher Betke 

Dear Michael, 

Hello from the Leather District, where I've lived for nine years. 

I'm writing to urge you to heed the overwhelming voice of Leather District residents in opposing Oxford Properties
development at 125 Lincoln Street, as it now stands. 

Is the city willing to exchange the short-sighted financial gain of a oversized development like this in exchange for
destroying the historical character and scale of the Leather District, the likes of which are rarely seen in other American
cities? The West End, once populated with brownstones as picturesque as the Back Bay, has been bulldozed in favor of
charmless high rises. Please consider the legacy of your decision as you evaluate Oxford's insensitive proposal for 125
Lincoln -- consider what it will mean not just for this neighborhood, but for what you believe Boston deserves.

40-year resident, business owner, trained architect and urban designer Larry Rosenblum put it best at the June 26
meeting, and I echo all of these sentiments: 

I'm struck by the disconnect between the perspective Oxford brings to this project and the reality of where this
project is.
This would be a fabulous project if the Leather District didn't exist.
This belongs in the Financial District
The effort to bring it into a historic, low-rise, mixed use neighborhood is the beginning of the death knell of the
Leather District.
The site is too constrained for this intensiveness of use.
This is an inappropriate response to the redevelopment of the site.
If I had to choose between this and the parking garage, I'd prefer the parking garage.

Here are a few reasons I oppose it:

HEIGHT: 
The Greenway Planning Study recommended that buildings adjacent to the Greenway not exceed heights
of 80-100 feet. The proposed building is 370-feet tall. Why should a large developer automatically get to
flout those restrictions?
The bones of the Leather District are beautiful, with streets evoking New York's Soho. A monolithic, 370-foot
office tower adjacent to that would reflect the city's reckless disregard for the historic, charming scale of a
neighborhood that could otherwise thrive from a well scaled alternative. 

WIDTH: 
This will wall off our entire neighborhood from the rest of the city and from Chinatown. It will also create epic
shadows across a park where so many children play. 

USE: 
Oxford's existing plan to erect a building full of offices does nothing to buttress the Leather District's
vibrancy. 9-5 workers will come and go, while the neighborhood will revert to what feels more like a dead
zone on evenings and weekends. That makes it difficult for local businesses to thrive, and for residents to
enjoy amenities that could have arisen from a mixed-use structure. 
The intended office use brings huge burden to the neighborhood traffic, ensuring a tidal wave of thousands
of people at the beginning and end of each workday. We exist at the nexus of an already overtaxed
intersection of South Station traffic, onramps to 93 and 90, and this neighborhood is not equipped to handle
such additional volume.
When tourists arrive to South Station, their experience passing through the LD won't reflect the broader
agenda Boston should pursue: that the city's "doorstep" should be welcoming and filled with options for
visitors to pause and enjoy themselves. "Privately owned public space" under a large office tower is hardly
the "activation" that would benefit the neighborhood or the many tourists gathering first impressions. While
those "public spaces" are technically accessible, they are hardly inviting.

https://www.google.com/maps/search/125+Lincoln+Street?entry=gmail&source=g
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Oxford has been focusing on the ground level. To paraphrase another neighbor, Roberta Niculescu, we
Leather District neighbors residents don't need a glorified lobby to spend time in -- we use our living rooms
to entertain each other. I'd like to see a variety of use at the ground floor -- retail, restaurants, etc. -- rather
than some supposedly public space that closes at 7pm.

OXFORD's APPROACH
I have now attended four meetings with Oxford properties about this project, and have found their approach
to be evasive. They've referred to the height as its lower zoned height, until prompted during a Q&A to
include mechanical floors, which add 30' of height. Their renderings of the building vs. the neighboring LD
buildings appear to have been created in a fun-house mirror, thanks to unrealistic perspectives. They've
shared multiple video renderings of the building, none of which showed its full height. The last meeting
concluded with a Q&A slide, featuring a photo that truncated the building at about 10 floors, rather than
showing the height we all so vehemently oppose.
It seems as though Oxford is holding these public meetings because they're ticking the box, claiming
they've listened. I only sense this is a one-way street, and have not gleaned one ounce of compromise on
the main issues -- height, massing and use.  

The residents have spoken. Again, I implore you to consider the legacy you have the opportunity to preserve. Please
consider echoing the city's residents in opposing a building this insensitive to our beautiful neighborhood. 

Thank you, 
Valentine

-- 

Valentine Oldham

111 Beach Street
Unit 1 H
Boston, MA 02111

https://www.google.com/maps/search/111+Beach+Street+Unit+1?entry=gmail&source=g
https://www.google.com/maps/search/111+Beach+Street+Unit+1?entry=gmail&source=g
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Michael Sinatra <michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov>

125 Lincoln Street 

Linda Yuen Thu, Jun 13, 2019 at 6:53 PM
To: "michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov" <michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov>

Michael
I am opposed to the current proposal at 125 Lincoln Street. C-Mart and Hei La Moon are two vital Chinatown staples that
provide vital food, services and business to the Chinatown community. There isn’t enough affordable housing and green
space. It will be eyesore and visual hindrance to the vital cultural neighborhood that is Chinatown. 
Chinatown is an authentic cultural hotspot and makes Boston that much more diverse, interesting and multi faceted.
Please reconsider the proposal and please work with the community. 
Respectfully yours,
Linda Yuen
Boston resident 

https://www.google.com/maps/search/125+Lincoln+Street?entry=gmail&source=g
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Michael Sinatra <michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov>

125 Lincoln Street Tower Project – Oxford Properties

Bill Zimmermann Thu, Jun 20, 2019 at 9:08 AM
To: "Michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov" <Michael.a.sinatra@boston.gov>
Cc: "mayor@boston.gov" <mayor@boston.gov>, "ed.flynn@boston.gov" <ed.flynn@boston.gov>, "Michelle.Wu@boston.gov"
<Michelle.Wu@boston.gov>, "danchen.xu@boston.gov" <danchen.xu@boston.gov>, 

 Bill Zimmermann 

Sir:

As a resident of the Leather District I must strongly oppose this project as it is currently being proposed.  I do not dispute
the fact that a new building at this site would benefit the neighborhood in many ways, however a building of the size and
mass proposed would be more detrimental to the Leather District and Chinatown neighborhoods than beneficial.  I, and
most of my neighbors, are strongly concerned about the following issues that this building would cause:

- Air pollution

- Traffic (car and pedestrian) Congestion

- Noise Pollution (contrary to most commonly held beliefs, the Leather District is now predominantly a 24/7          
residential neighborhood)

- Shadows

I respectfully suggest you stand on the corner of Lincoln and Beach on any weekday, especially during morning and
afternoon rush hours to see the amount of congestion and noise we currently deal with. Then extrapolate how much
worse it would be with the additional cars, traffic, people, noise, etc. that a 300 foot office tower would add.

Further, numerous city studies have already concluded that the existing height limitation of 100 feet is appropriate and
correct for this neighborhood.

I could accept a slightly taller building with less massing but certainly not a block to block massive 300' tower as
proposed.

Please, do what's right for the neighborhood and consider the wishes, interests, and physical and emotional wellbeing
and the general quality of life of your constituents who live here.

Respectfully,

William Zimmermann
150 Lincoln Street
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